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NU thinclads
face NCAA

competition
B tight .iihlctcs are

hoping to rear a bountiful
harvest of national honors Jhts
weekend 1 the NCAA Track
and Field championships at
Detroit. Mich.

Defending team vhampion
Kansas could repeat but will
receive competition from
eastern power Villanova. KlPs
Karl Salb, college track's
premier shot putter, should
win his specialty with little
difficulty. If he does it will be
his third national mdooT title
m a row.

Colorado boasts another
pre-me- et lavonte m Marcus
"Walker. Walker has proven
himself 1he fastest rndooT
hurdleT in the tinned States
this winter.

Nebraska will he mienng
eight athletes m 1out events.
According To I oach 1 Tank

Sevngne the Huskers' best
chance of wmnint an vent will
he the triple mmp where holh
Ho pel on Ciordon and Wes

Leonard could battle Iot the
title.

NtTs Two-mi- le relay team is
one of only six invited to
compete in the NCAA track
meet. The young squad is made
up of fresh men Roger
Oiadwick. Dan Speck. Iarry

;imato, and suphomore 3im
Hawkins.

C!Teg Ciirlberg will be
entered m the mile run. after
qualifying on the strength of
his 3:59 6 three weeks ago nt
the Houston federation Meet.
Oirlberg missed workouts this
week due to a old but is

expected to be ready Ihis
weekend.

Nebraska is represented in
the 600-yar- d run by Garth
Case, who will be trying to
make up tor his defeat to
Kansas State s Dale Alexander
in the Big Eight Meet.

Rifle club hosts

shoot tourney
The rnivrrsity rifle Jub

will host its iMh annua! Big
Red kil'le Tournament at tne
Military and Naval Science
Building I nday ih rough
Sundiiy .

(ompetitors are expected
from Wisconsin. Missouri.
Kansas. Iowa. Oklahoma.
South Dakota. North Dakota
and Nebraska There are 32
teams entered from 15 schools.

TODAY AT 2,
4:30, 7 and 9;30

Emily Bronte's
defiant young lovers

live again in a
new and different

look at an
immortal classic.
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