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'Tote Bat Book'Plans Fees Due
Thursday-Swart- s

Officer's Orientation
Scheduled Thursday

Hardin, Colbert to Address Session
Colbert, the group will break
up into smaller special inter
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Chancellor Clifford Hardin
and J. Philip Colbert, dean of
Student Affairs, will be guest
speakers at the student coun-
cil sponsored orientation ses-
sion Thursday.

The session is for officers
of campus organizations and
organized houses. It will be
held at 4 p.m. in the Union
ballroom.

Short Talks
Following short talks by

Chancellor Hardin and Dean

favors this year to cut ex-
pense and the time involved
in making original favors.
Miss Swarts commented.

Favors
The favor is- - a. cardboard

"penny" with a picture of Lin-

coln and the words "Uni-
versity of Nebraska, Lincoln,
Coeds, 1958" on one side and
"Penny Carnival" and the
Greek letters of the partici-
pating house on the other
side. The favors for each
house are a different color.

A required meeting for all
active and pledge booth chair-
men will be held Sunday at 2
p.m. in Union 316. If a house
is not represented at this
meeting, it will not be able to
participate in Penny Carnival.

Penny Carnival is spon-
sored annually by Coed Coun-

selors both as a money-makin- g

project and as a way for
freshman pledge classes, to
become better acquainted.

Booths in the Carnival vie
for first, second and third
place honors. Winners are de-

termined by a vote of stu
dents attending and by a pa-

nel of judges.
Last year the Carnival was

held in the Union Ballroom,
but large crowds prompted
this year's move to the Mil-
itary and Naval Science

Lake Sees Jan, 1
As Crib

Construction Progress
Remains On Schedulet a,7i' 1

CAROL THOMAS, soph., Vicky Pearson and Roger
Swanson, freshmen, all from. Wansa, lug newly pur-
chased books and stndy supplies home after classes
Monday. Bookstores did a rush business as first assign-
ments were issued.

Merry-Go-Roun-d Starts Spin
AWS Mart Opens Activity World To Upperclassmen
Tf H ttc fmt af arrtn at artclet

fealiac with euupai actithira.

With the opening of school,
campus activities will again
begin their round of meetings,
typing and decorating.

Upperclassmen will be in-

troduced to these groups fol-

lowing the AWS Upperclass
Activity Mart Thursday, but
freshmen must wait six
weeks before participation in
activities.

The various organizations
and their functions are listed
below.

Frosh to Pack Union
For Mass Kernal Meeti

Penny Carnival first and
second plans along with a $5
entrance fee and $2.50 fee for
favors must be turned in to
Kaymarie Swarts at the Sig-
ma Kappa house between 3
p.m. and 9 p.m. Thursday.

Houses will be notified on
Sunday if their plan has been
accepted.

More Space
Penny Carnival will be held

In the Military Naval and Sci-

ence Building this year to
"provide more space so that
all houses can participate,
said Miss Swarts. Eighteen
organized houses are ex
pected to compete, she added.

All booths will have uniform

Deans9 Tea
To Welcome
Gal Students

The annual Dean's Tea for

all women students at the
University will be held Friday
In the Residence Halls for

Women.
This is the only event dur-

ing the school year in which
representatives from all cam-

pus women's groups partici-
pate in one project Represen-
tatives from more than 40

activities will assist.
A welcome for freshman

women, as well as returning
upperclassmen, to the Univer-
sity campus is the reason for
the tea, said Miss Helen Sny-

der, associate dean of student
affairs.

Miss Snyder, Mrs. Clifford
Hardin, wife of the chancel-
lor. Miss Madeline Girard,
Panhellenic director Miss
Ruth Meierhenry, business
manager of the Residence
llaHs, and Miss Olivia Han-
sen, head resident of the resi-
dence Halls, will be in the
receiving line.

Presenting guests to the re-
ceiving line will be Miss
Nancy Copeland, Mortar
Board president, and Miss
Nan Carlson, president of
AWS.

Young Demos
Will Organize

A University Young Demo-
crats group will be formed
Thursday evening at 7:15 in
the Union.

The Thursday meeting wDl
be the first attempt to organ-
ize a campus Democratic
group in recent j'ears. -

The organization, which will
' submit a constitution to the
student council for approval,
will concentrate on active
participation in the current
election campaign.

The speaker for the group
Thursday evening will be pro-

fessor Merton Bernstein of the
College of Law. Bernstein has
been administrative assistant
to Sen. Wayne Morse of Ore-

gon and during the past few
years has served as special
counsel to the Senate Labor
Committee.

BABW Mixer
Planned Sunday

A mixer for aH independent
women will be held in the
Union from 2 to 5 p.m. Sun-

day in parlors ABC.

The mixer, sponsored by
Barb Activities Board for
Women, is designed as a "get-acquainte-d"

session for inde-

pendent coeds living in differ-

ent housing units, according to
Doris Eby, president .

A fall style show is planned,
with an informal card party
scheduled afterward, Miss
Eby said.

Tickets will be on sale
Thursday for 15 cents in
dorms on both City and Ag
campus.

NU Work Topic
In Atom Study

Atomic research at the Uni-i-ersi- ty

will be discussed be-

fore an international confer-
ence this week at Gatlinburg,
Tenn.

Dr. Theodore Jorgensen,
professor of physics here will
speak at the conference, spon-

sored bv the National Aca-dPtn- v

of Sciences and
UNESCO.

Topic under discussion is
The Penetration of Charged

Particles in Matter."

be addressed by Dr. Lewii
Fowles, assistant dean of
Student Affairs.

Frank Hallgren and Helea
Snyder, Associate Deans of
Student Affairs, will speak to
the social chairman.

Talking to health chairman
will be Dr. Samuel Fuehn-nin- g,

director of Student
Health.

Don Olson, director of the
University debate squad, will
speak to the parliamen-
tarians.

Question Period
Following the talks will be

a question and answer pe-
riod.

"This orientation session
will enable officers to ask
questions now, and might
save them a future trip to the
Administration Office," Gary
Frenzel, council vice-preside- nt

said.
He added that the speeches

would be short, and that the
entire session should be over
by 4:45 p.m.

Exchange Ideas
'This is an excellent oppor-

tunity for organization officers
to learn what the University
expects of them, some of the
University's plans for the
year, parliamentary proce-
dure, and to exchange ideas
with members of the Admin-
istration," Dwaine R o g g e,
council president said.

"Be sure to bring your
questions Thursday," he
added. "Those officers who
attended in the past have
learned much that has helped
them in their organizations."

All Pledges
Own Hats
This Year

Freshman beanies are sell-
ing "very well," Dick Shu-gru-e,

Innocent In charge of
sales said.

All fraternity pledges have
now purchased beanies, he
reported. Beanie sales will
continue the rest of this week.

"We hope we'll get the same
cooperation from unaffiliated
students as we have from the
fraternity members," Shugrue
said. "The beanie tradition is
one of the last lingering tra-
ditions of campus-wid- e

scope."
With the money derived

from beanie sales, the Inno-
cents carry on other programs
including Homecoming, Ivy
Day, the Missouri Victory
Bell celebration and the Colo-
rado Buffalo Head activities,
Shugrue added.

Concert Drive
Starts Thursday

The kick-of- f dinner for the
student membership drive for
Lincoln Community Concerts
will be held Thursday at 6
p.m. in Union XY.

Anyone who wants to sell
memberships and would like
to attend the dinner should
call ext 42S5, by 5 p.m.
today, according to Bob
Handy, Union Activities Di-

rector.
The salesmen receive one

free membership for every 10
they sell and they have an
opportunity to win an RCA
Victor hi fi set Handy

are $4 and will
be available only through
Sept 24.

Tassel Signup
Deadline Near

Friday is the signup dead-
line for Tassels, according to
Jane Savener, publicity chair-
man.

Independent sophomores
and juniors are eligible. Seven
Barb sophomores, three Ag
sophomores, four Barb juniors
and three Ag juniors are
needed.

Application blanks are avail-
able at both Ag and City
Unions.

Requirements are a 5.5 av-

erage and interest in promot-
ing school spirit Miss Sav-
ener said.

SDX To Meet
Sigma Delta Chi, profession-

al journalistic fraternity, will
hold its first meeting of the
year Friday at 3 p.m. in the
Journalism School newsroom,
Dick Shugrue, SDX president
announced today.

The All University Fund so-

licits donations for many
causes through one major
drive. Student officers and
chairmen aided by a faculty
adviser make up the ALT
Board, while freshman work-
ers help with the fall drive.

Associated Women Students
regulates the women students'
activities and living rules.
AWS board members are
elected by all women students
in the spring. Two freshman
workers are selected from
each organized house.

Leffler, Bob Peterson, Tom
Frank, Joe Kemble, Bruce
Tohill, Lynn Sunberg, Bill
Kepp aer, Gary Pasco, Tom
Davies, Roger Clocker, Gary
Nett, Tom Judd, Roger Jones.

Donna Manary, Ann Shel-
don, Nancy Morgan, Joanie
SchammeL Harriet Anville,
Janet Hoeppner, Kay Strauss,
Charlotte Risser, Sonja Erik-se- n,

Judy Bruce, Alice Mis-kovsk- y,

Judi Turek, Bob
Clarke, Rich Bringleson, Gene
Mannlein, Richard Ambrosek,
John Schurr, Lowell Oamek,
Allen Fullerton, Ed Lindsay,
Richard Wacha, Jack Pitt-ma- n,

Francis "Skip" Hamer,
John Gutschlag, Larry Mid-dleto- n.

Jerry Williams.
Al Wiiiiams, Byron Owens,

Ben Prieb, Jerry Vap, Ron
Fulsaas, Larry Larsen, Sylvia
McNally, Patty Barrett, Jean--

est sections.
Officers attending the meet

ing include organization pres-
idents, treasurers, scholar
ship chairmen, social chair
man, health representatives
and parliamentarians.

J. P. Harper, treasurer of
the Student Activities Fund,
will speak to organization
treasurers.

Scholarship chairmen will

Opening

rector of the Union, crossed
his fingers as he prophesied
New Year's as opening day
for the new enlarged cafe and
kitchen.

Suffering now from its third
strike, this one by the metal
workers, construction of t h e
addition should allow a grand
opening nest fall, Lake said.

The view that presents it-

self now beyond the red
"Women" sign put up by an
enterprising individual, is re-

markably like that of a dorm
room before either occupant
has put away his belongings.

Exceptionally rainy weath-
er has left the floors in the
addition spotted with puddles.

ITile, wires, piles of every
Kind oi construction equip-me- nt

make an obstacle course
out of what will eventually be
ballrooms, cafeterias, bowling
alleys and game rooms.

Glass Walls
Molds have been poured for

glass walls that will almost
encircle the $1,250,000 struc-
ture. Once the walls are in,
Lake said, weather should
not pose much of a threat to
construction schedules.

"Pretty much on schedule"
was how Lake described the
progress now.

The streaks of freshly plas-
tered walls in the Crib, the
yawning holes that appear in
scattered places throughout
the present Union, represent
work that was done on the!
heating and cooling systems.!

Separate Heat
A 500-to- n steam absorption

unit in the new addition willj
separate the Union from the:
University system, which is
already heavily taxed.

Changes in the pipes and
ducting in the old Union are
"souping-u- p the heating sys-
tem throughout," Lake said.

Work begins this week on
the inside walls of the new
Crib and kitchen, Lake said.
This is the portion of the addi-
tion directly behind the
"Women" sign in the main
hall of the present Union.

Gloomy Cavern
What will eventually be 10

bowling lanes is now a
gloomy cavern with several
troughs running the length of
the floor. Eight of the lanes
will be used for leagues and
classes, but two will be kept
free at all times for open
bowling. Lake said.

What will in several months
be recognizable as party
rooms to be used for small
conventions, hour dances and
exhibits is now so dark that
flashlights are needed to
grope through the debris.

Reporters
Students who wish to join

the Daily Nebraskan report-
ing staff may sign np Thurs-
day at the upperclass activi-
ties mart in the Union Ball-
room, according to Emmie
Limpo, senior staff writer.
Previous journalistic experi-
ence is not needed, although
journalism students are es-
pecially needed, Miss Limpo
said.

AWS Signup
Set Thursday

Upperclassmen wishing to
register for University activi-
ties may do so Thursday, ac-
cording io AWS president Nan
Carlson.

The annual Activities Mart
for upperclassmen will be
held in the Union parlor from
2 to 5:30 p.m. Representatives
will be on hand to explain the
functions of the various Uni-
versity organizations and sip
up new members.

By Diana Maxwell
Copy Editor

The rains came with a
j
vengeance, the strikes came

; at crucial points, but the Stu
dent Union addition is inching
its way toward a partial open-
ing by January 1.

Duane Lake, managing di- -

sponsor Penny Carnival early
in the fall semester.

Corn Cobs is the men's pep
organization for promotion of
student enthusiasm. Cobs sell
Cornhuskers. N flowers, staee

jthe Homecoming Dance and
sponsor pep rallies.

Tassels is the women's pep
organization composed of
sophomores and juniors who
appear at football games and
other athletic contests in an
effort to bolster student mo-

rale.
The freshman group corres-

ponding to Cobs and Tassels
is Kernals, men and women
chosen from both unorganized
and organized houses.

Kosmet Klub is a group of
male students which advanc-
es sei-era- ! theatrical shows
for the University and public.
Each year the Klub sponsors
the Fall Revue and the Spring
Show. Sophomore and fresh
man males are eugiDie tor
worker positions.

The Nebraska Blueprint is
a monthly engineering maga
zine of the College of Engi-
neering and Architecture. The
staff of the Blueprint is made
up of students in Engineering
College.

The Cornhusker, the Univer-
sity yearbook, is published by
a paid staff chosen by t lie
faculty-stude- Subcommittee
on Student Publications. The
staff also consists of unpaid
section heads and workers.

The Red Cross is a com-
munity service organization
which serves Lincoln and vi--

Continued on Page 4

west and 5nd some adven-
ture," Mrs. Reece said.

"We had to get a Colo-

rado certificate before we
could teach there so I went
to the University of Colo-

rado for a summer. I don't
think I'll try to transfer my
grades from there if I ever
go back to school. I had a
terrible time, Mrs. Reece
recalled.

Two Daughters
In 1931, Mrs. Reece mar-

ried. She has two daugh-
ters, both married. One of
them lives in Omaha "so
I get to see one of my girls
once in a while," Mrs.
Reece says.

After her husband's
death, Mrs. Reece thought
of her old plan of becoming
a housemother. Her hus-

band had been of Kappa
Sigma at the University of
Colorado so when she heard
that Nebraska's Kappa Sigs
were looking for a house-

mother to replace Mrs.
George Engler, who retired
last year, she applied.

"I like working with
young people, she said.
"They are so natural."

The Kappa Sigs think that
"Jamey" is a' natural too.

Barb Activities B o a r d for
Women is an organization for
unaffiliated coeds. Independ-
ent women plan activities,
sponsor charity projects and
solve mutual problems.

University Builders Pr- -

mote NU in high schools
throughout the state. Students
begin work as committee
members and work up to
board positions.

The Big Sister program is
the main concern of the Coed
Counselors. Among other
projects, the Coed Counselors

Friday

nie Roquet Linda Schelbitz--
kie, Ginny Hubka, e a n e
Fenton, Barbara Tanner,
Mary Walt Jeanette John-
son, Bonny Lucas, Joyce
Wasserman, Dee Hale, Linda
Picard, Mary Erickson, Judy
Means, Betsy Tulles, Sadie
Yeager, Julie Scott, Laurie
Abernathy, Sharon Dietrich,
Sigrid Henderson, Patty Pa-
lermo, Nancy Booth, Mary
Wester, Ellen Basaco.

JoAnne Buck, Pat Dean,
Sallye Miller, Penny Sandrit-te- r,

Midge Timm, Bob Gies-le- r,

Larry Greenwald, Rich
Zerr, Bob Boettcher, Lane
McClure, Denny Loch, Jerry
Boden, Keith Nelson, Neil
Schwartz, Louis Titus, Steve
Eeachler, Rusty Clark, Vance
Uden, Dale Lutz, Keith
Welsh, Ronald Schroeder,

Continued on Page 4

atmosphere. Though she
was originally from Illinois,
she attended Oklahoma Uni-

versity "because I had rel-

atives in Norman."
Taught in Illinois

After graduating from
Oklahoma, she returned to
Illinois to teach and after
a year there, she went to
Colorado.

"I had relatives living
there so I thought I'd go

6. .' or w
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Mrs. Reece

Mrs. Reece, '29th Pledge,'
Becomes Kappa Sig Housemom

The first mass meeting for
all Kernals will be held this
evening at 7:00 in the Student
Union Ballroom. Kernals are
reminded to bring their iden
tification cards with them so
the cards can be punched,
designating that the
has purchased a football
ticket

Kernals are:
le Blait, Buddy Wolfe, Stu

Kubler, Larry Herman, Ron
Simons, Arnie Ban, Dick
Kubler, Larry Herman, Ron
Simons, Arnie Ban, Dick
Myers, Tim Dinklege, Ken
Fiske, Ken Greve, Larry
Schuster, Harvey AM, Bill
ConnelL Norm Beatty, Kent
SearL Mike Thomas, Bob
Jordan, Brian Binning.

Pat Betts, Nancy Teder-ma- n,

Anne Lult, Barbara
Miles, Judy Marshall, Carol
Zajic, Judy Phipps, Marion
Dorn, Ann Walker, Rosemary
Kelly, Suzanne Maxwell,
Twila Pearsen, Diane Tinan,
Suki Tinan, Linda Harman,
Judy Margaret, Harriet
Rogers, Nancy Jewell.

Phyllis BneC Janis Dorland,
Philippa Koopnuo, Charlene
Mohr, Patricia Vincent Judy
Wilson, Pat Anderson, Jane
M e h r i n g, Nicke Christie,
Lynn Goman, Bonnie Bush,
Kity Shearer, Brian Bigg,
Gary Drown, Wilson Merritt,
Ed Morrow, Hal Spurrier,
John Zauha, Ken Pohlman,
Jerry Lamberson, Jim Lee,
Larry Henry, Dan Wehrbein.

Phil Barron, Jeff Swartz,
Mike Canar, Stu Stoler, Bob
Schapiro, Tom Rosenzweig,
Bennie Grossman, Dave An-stin- e,

Dick Nelson, Joe How-

ard, Joe Frederick, Tom
Burkholder, Judy Cohen,
June Zneimer, Muriel Lel-choo- k,

Judy Freed.
Maddi Miroff, Nancy Gross-

man, Dean Roeber, Leon
Sperling, Gene Schievellbein,
Dick Momby, Hi Bavermeis-ten- ,

Dale Pieper, Bob Ahn-thol- z,

Reg Ekluwo, Jack
Fitch, Martin Hylbak, Glenn
Shaheen.

Nori Yost, Judy Brown,
Kay McCormick, Barb Eak-ke- r,

Sue Falkerson, Ginger
Shilling, Gunel Atrsek, Linda
Kaes, Erenda Kaufman, Lou-

ise Fankel, Clare Vrba, San-

dra Oberg, Gene Tice, Bill
Orwig, Al Plummer, Boyce

Voir: Thli h m Ural at a an-le-
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By George Mover
Managing Editor

The official Interfratern-it- y

Council pledge list has
28 names listed under Kap-
pa Sigma, but the Kappa
Sigs themselves insist they
took 29 new pledges this
year.

The 29th "pledge" is Mr;;.
John Reece, Pueblo. Colo-

rado, the new Kappa Sig
housemother.

Freshman
Mrs. Reece, or "Jamey,"

as she prefers to be called,
has never been a house-
mother on any other cam-
pus so she is starting off
her new job "as lost as any
of the freshmen."

The idea of becoming a
housemother is not new to
Mrs. Reece, however. "Be-
fore I ever got married, I
thought if I ever wind up a
middle aged widow, a s
most women nowadays will,
I'd like to be a house-
mother," Mrs. Reece saicL

The job appealed to her
because she, herself, had
attended two universities
and 'ad liked the college

T


