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ent through drink and dulls his
genius with opium. His body
racked with the violent couching
of advanced tuberculosis, Bran-we- ll

dies after a debaucherie at
the village alehouse followed by
exposure to the wind.

Stalwart young Yorkshireman
Bob Samardick appears to carry
the dying Branwell home in act
III. Samardick played the bril-
liant Russian actor, Sascha, in
Room Service.

Soft Brogue.
Blanche Duckworth tongues a

soft brogue as the Yorkshire
maid- - servant of the Bronte fam-
ily. Miss Duckworth was cast as
the wardrobe maid for "The Skin
of Our Teeth" this season, and
last year played two maid parts.
Alis Swanson, bent with age
cakling like a crone, has the role
of Tabby, beloved old nurse and
housekeeper for the Brontes. Miss
Swanson flirted her way through
"The Skin of Our Teeth" as
Sabina.

"Moor Born" is directed by Dan
Mullin.

BULLETIN
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Out of the frying pan into the
fight that is the role for kitchen
fats in this war, according to the
Texas State Nutrition Council,
with headquarters on the Univer-
sity of Texas campus.
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United ...
We are backing the
San Francisco confer-
ence, opening today.
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