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Panhell Council
Gives Wartime
Workshop Plan

Pan hellenic wartime workshop
will start Sunday, Nov. 5, with
an church Sunday and
a house president's dinner to be
held at the Cornhusker at 1.

Exchange luncheons will start
Monday and continue through
the week. Mary Joe Kobes, Pan
hellenic Council president, will
speak Monday at a Panhellenic
meeting at 5 in Ellen Smith hall

Tuesday in the Union at 5, Jim
Chubb, former student pastor at
Baker university, will speak at
Vespers.

Pledge training, especially for
pledge captains and pledge presi
dents, will be held at 5 Wednesday
at Ellen Smith hall. At 7 Mrs
James Stuart will speak on

What Should Wartime Social
Activities Be?"

Larson Speaks.
Thursday, Jean Larson, presi-

dent of Mortar Board, will speak
at Ellen Smith Hall on "What
Should Wartime Campus Activ
ities Be," Mrs. Carl Lessenhop,
scholarship advisor of Kappa Al
pha Theta, will discuss "Ob
jectives and Techniques of
Scholarship" at Ellen Smith
hall at 7.

A dinner for all sorority girls
Friday at 6 in the Union ballroom
will climax the week of activities.
The guest speaker will be Mrs
Joseph Seacrest, national presi-
dent of Kappa Kappa Gamma.

UN Instructor
Publishes Book
On War Fiction

The university's newest art in-

structor, Clara Marie Allen, has
recently published a book, "Slacks

nd Callouses, written in col-

laboration with Constance Bow-
man.

A story of a summer spent
working in an airplane factory on
the west coast, it is told in a sim-
ple, direct manner, with amusing
illustrations.

The spent the sum-
mer months on an aircraft pro-
duction line and recorded their
experiences in a book filled with
wit, humor, apt descriptions, and
clever cartoons.

Mrs. Allen received her mas-
ter's degree in art from the Uni-
versity of California in 1939, and
has been teaching since that time.

Former Student
Earns Medal
In Munich Raid

First Lt. Richard E. Kinman,
Grand Island, Neb., has been
awarded the Distinguished Flying
Cross for "extraordinary achieve-
ment while participating in aerial
flight against the enemy."

While participating in a bomb-
ing mission on Munich, Germany
the B-- 24 Liberator in which Lieu-
tenant Kinman was navigator de
veloped engine trouble in three
engines. Despite tne lact tnai tne
plane had fallen out of formation
the crew reached the target and
made a successful bomb run, altho
the plane suffered many flack
hits.

A graduate of Lincoln high
school in June 1934, Lt. Kinman
attended the university in 1935

where he was enrolled in the
business administration college.
Entering the army in 1941, he
took his training in San Marcos,
Tex.

Besides the recently awarded
Distinguished Flying Cross, Lieu-
tenant Kinman has also received
the air medal with three Oak leaf
clusters.

Lincoln Camera
Club Opens New
Exhibit in Morrill

The Lincoln Camera club an-

nounces the first
salon of photography Nov. 5 to
Nov. 17.

The salon affords an opportun-
ity for camera enthusiastis to dis-

play their work. The exhibition
presents photography by residents
of the state, former Nebraskans
and by service men stationed in
Nebraska.

Following the showing at Mor-

rill hall, Lincoln, the exhibition
will be later h?M at Joslyn Me-

morial, Omaha, and in Hastings.

Mrs. O. W. Meier
Sets Up Student
Memorial Fund

In memory of her husband, the
late Otto W. Meier of Lincoln,
Mrs. Meier has established a $500
student loan fund, according to
Perry W. Branch, secretary of the
Nebraska foundation.

Mr. Meier was a practicing
lawyer in Lincoln. He received
his law degree from the univer-
sity in 1900. His son Franklin,
now a lieutenant in the na.vy, was
well-kno- wn as center on tha Ne-

braska football team in 1933-3- 4.

The loan is available to stu
dents registered in any school or
college of the university
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Dr. F. H. Tanner
Talks to Nu-nied- s

About Pathology
Dr. Frank H. Tanner, patholo

gist attached to the Lincoln hos-
pitals and graduate of the, Ne
braska school of medicine, dis-
cussed the work of a pathologist
at the Nu-m- ed meeting held in
315 Student Union Wednesday
evening.

Pathology, the science of
diseases in man, explained Dr.
Tanner, consist of four general
divisions. Surgical pathology is
the examination of tissues surgic-
ally removed, to determine the
nature or extent of the disease.
While the patient is still on the
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FlightTraining
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