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ochle party on New Year';; eve
with the following guests: Mr.
and Mrs. Lynn Rothe and Mar-
lin, Mr. and Mrs. Edward Van
Horn and John and Mr. and Mrs
Walter Patton. Mr. and Mrs.

underwent a tonsillectomy on
Wednesday morning at the Bry-
an Memorial hospital in Lincoln
Mrs Raymond Freeman was an
overnight guest of Mr. and Mrs.
Marvin Wade and boys in Lin-
coln. Steve returned home Thurs-
day afternoon.

Weeping Water News
Mra. Edward Van Horn Phono 252 -- W

and 210 to M0 pounds. Individual
winners will move Into the car-

cass competition.
Certification data will be avail-

able on request for all hogs ent-

ered in the Omaha Show. Those
desiring certification on individ-

ual hogs should fill out the re-

quired forms. The forms should
be delivered to the commission
firms of the owner's choice and
at the same time specifying the
hog or hogs he seeks to have
certified. The firm. In turn, will
supply the completed forms to
'the parking packer buying the
hogs. The regular certification
charge will apply.

Market Hog
Entries Due
This Month

OMAHA Entries for the sec-

ond annual Omaha Market Hog
Show, February 6, should be sub-

mitted during the month of Jan-
uary, according to R. E. Cun-
ningham, secretary of the Oma-
ha Livestock Exchange and
chairman of the show committee.

Entry forms will be available
through County . Extension
Agents, vocational agriculture
teachers or commission firms
operating on thP Omaha marke.

The Show calls for a id

entry, barrows and
gilts (not more than five gilts),
in across weight range of 1.000
to 2,400 pounds. The exhibitor
may designate one barrow from
his entry, for separate individ-
ual competition. There will be
two weight classes in individual
competition 190 to 215 pounds

Mrs. II. I. Rookstool
Mr. and Mrs. Charles Gibson

held a dinner
with the following guests: Mr.
and Mrs. Jack Hays and Tom,
Mr. and Mrs. Harlon Gibson,
and Mr. and Mrs. Richard Gib-
son and children of Omaha.

Mr. and Mrs. Gayle Meeske
and Barbara of Omaha were gu-
ests of Mr. and Mrs. Harold
Domingo and boys and Mr. and

ford and Reggie and other rela-
tives.

Ricky and Debbie Cooper were
Thursday afternoon and evening
guests of Mr. and Mrs. Clifford
Cooper while Mrs. Clayton
Cooper, Kit and Sheri and Mrs.
Louis Sack of Murray were busi-
ness visitors in Nebraska City.
Mrs. Clayton Cooper and chil-
dren were supper' guests at the
Sack home.

Mr. and Mrs. Ralph Lindsey,
Mrs. Edith Wiles and Ralph of
Avoca, Mr. and Mrs. DeForest
Ward of Murray and Mr. and
Mrs. James Zeesin of Seward
were New Years dinner guests
of Mr. and Mrs. Lerov Zessin.

Mr. and Mrs. Arvin Patton
and family, Mr. and Mrs. Paul
Wiles and Virgil Graham were
New Years dinner and supper
guests of Mr. and Mrs. R'oy

Wiles and family.
Mr. and Mrs. Paul Straub and

family of Avoca were Sunday
dinner and lunch guests of Mr.
and Mrs. Harold Meisinger and
family.

Mr. and Mrs. Leon Merrick of
Osceola were dinner guests of

Mr. and Mrs. Engene Day.
Mr. and Mrs. William Finley

and daughters and Mr. and Mrs.
Miller Christensen were dinner
guests of Mr. and Mrs. Loren
Dennis and family of Bellevue.

Mr. and Mrs. Ed Steinkamp
were guests of Mrs. Jane Stein-
kamp of Manley and her house-guest- s

Mr. and Mrs. Herbert
Steinkamp of Canton, Ohio.

Alvera Severn of South Bend,
Indiana visited over the holidays
with Rev. and Mrs C. W. Severn
and family.

Mr. and Mrs. James McVay
and Mrs. J. E. Renner were
dinner guests of Mr. and Mrs.
Floyd Renner and family of
Louisville.

Mrs. Raymond Freeman and
Steven were Monday morning
guests of Mrs. Harold Bruns and
family.

Mr. and Mrs. Rolland Heil and
Alan of Omaha were Sunday
afternoon callers of Mr. and Mrs.
Sterling Wiles. They went to Lin-
coln where they visited Mrs.
Wallace Richert and Joel at the
Bryan Memorial hospital.

Mr. and Mrs. Wallace Richert
of Murdock are the parents of a
baby boy, born at the Bryan
Memorial hospital In Lincoln
on Tuesday. December 29, 1959.
The baby weighed 8 pounds 1

ounce and has been named Joel
Thomas. Mr. and Mrs. Sterling
Wiles are ttifi maternal grand-
parents. Mr. and Mrs. Carl Ric-

hert of Murdock are the paternal

Kansas. Clifford, Donna and
Stanley, Jr. accompanied them
home after spending a week at
the Larry Schroeder home.

Mr. and Mrs. Rolland Cooper
and Alan of Omaha were Sun-
day afternoon guests of Mr. and
Mrs. Ray Wiles and W. P.
Wright at Rest Haven.

The Cass County Christian
Fellowship meeting was held
Sunday evening at the Meth-
odist church in Elmwood. Those
attending from the Christian
church in Weeping Water were
Mr. and Mrs. Lynn Rothe and
Marlin. Mr. and Mrs. Victor
Schwarz and family, Mr. and
Mrs. Buster Baxter and Russell,
Carol Nickels, Jeannie Kunz,
Shirley Upton, Wendell Plunk-
ett, Roy Ward and George
Plunkett.

Joe Sterling arrived home by
plane from San Francisco, Cali-
fornia on Wednesday in Omaha.
He has been stationed for the
past months in Japan. He lias
been discharged and is at home
with his parents, Mr. and Mrs.
Alton Sterling. New Year's holi-
day guests at the Sterling home
were Edwin Sterling of Lincoln
and Mr. and Mrs. Rotwrt Ossen-ko- p

and Linda of Omaha.
The Rainbow Girls held their

Christmas party on Tuesday
evening in the Odd Fellows Hall.
Following the regular business
meeting a inajority service was
held for Roberta Knaup and
Henrietta Plliold.

Mr. and Mrs. Robert Berg-man- n

and Debbie entertained at
a New Year's pinocule party
with the following guests: Mr.
and Mrs. Melvin Thomas and
family, Mr. and Mrs. Harold
Meisinger and family and Mr.
and Mrs. Howard Rath and
family.

Sharon Stock spent the week
end wth Mr. aind Mrs. Harlon
Stock and Jim. New Year's day

Mrs. Lewis Baker entertained
at a birthday party on Tuesday
afternoon in honor of the .se-
venth birthday of her son Randy.
The first grade class was invited
and 18 attended. Mrs. Baker
baked tw0 sailboat birthday
( akes for the oceasslon and this
was .served with ice cream and
cookies. Favors of gum, suckers
and balloons were given the
children before they went home.

Mr. and Mrs. Lee Stratton
home on F'riday evening

alter spending the holidays vis-
iting relatives in California.
They were grests of Mr. and
Mrs. Eugene Stratton and fam-
ily at Buena Park and spent
Christmas day with them.

Carolyn Muhr of Krebs, Okla-
homa visited for a few days with
Mr. and Mrs. Arnold Upton and
family. She left Sunday for
Omaha where she is attending
college. Other dinner guests on
Sunday at the Upton home were
Mr. and Mrs. Omer Gottule and
family of Fremont.

Mr. and Mrs. James Zes.sin of
Seward and Mr. and Mrs. Allen
Ehlers, Jr. were oyster supper
guests on New Year s eve of Mr.
and Mrs. Leroy Zessin.

Mr. and Mrs. Stanley Schroe-de- r
of Louisville were Sunday

dinner guests or Mr. and Mrs.
Larry Schroeder of Manhatten,

PLATTSMOUTH

LOCKERS

WILL CLOSE

SATURDAYS AT
6 P.M. UNTIL

SPRING

Help restore vital

Gerald Terry and Kathy of Lin-- j
coin were callers during the eve-- !
ning.

Mr. and Mrs. Leo Christensen
were Saturday evening guests;
of Mr .and Mrs. Wilson Btekford;
an,d Reggie.

Mrs. Ai Bickford stayed at her.
hc.ne in Weeping Water for a
few days during the holidays.
She is making her home this
winter in Lincoln with Mr. and
Mrs. Al Bickford and Cindy.
While here she visited with Mr.
and Mrs Art Hammond and
Mrs. Chris Miller.

Myrtle John of Kearney visited
for a few days with Mr. and Mrs.
Joseph John.

Mr. and Mrs. Russell Van Ev-
ery and family of Ogallala were
guests of Mr. and Mrs. Elmer
Michelsen, Sr. and Mr. and Mrs.
Elmer Michelsen, Jr. and fam-
ily. They were all dinner guests
of Mr. and Mrs. Carl Christen-
sen and family of Louisville.

Mr. and Mrs. Charles Hanson
and family of Minneapolis visit-
ed for a few days with Mr. and
Mrs. R. O. Baker and other rel-

atives.
Mr. and Mrs. Harold Meising-

er and family were Tuesday eve-
ning guests of Mr. and Mrs. Al-vi-

Groesser and boys.
Mr. and Mrs. Mark Hohman

and family were dinner guests of
Mr. and Mrs. Leo Hohman and
family of Plattsmouth.

Alice Hohman visited for a
few days with Barbara Houchin
at Elkhorn.

Linville Prall of Gallup, N. M.
visited over the holidays with
Mr. and Mrs. Milton Prall. Mrs.
Prall remained with her mother,
Mrs. John Hutchinson, who
underwent surgery at a hospit-
al at Oshkosh.

Helen Tynar of Denver, Colo-
rado spent the holidays with Mr.
and Mrs. Gordon Wilcoxen and

.

. ...

Mr. and Mrs. Ed Holscher of!
Cook were Saturday guests of
Mr. and Mrs. Raymond Freeman
and family. Paula accompanied
them to Weeping Water after
spending a week in Cook with her
grandparents.

Mr and Mrs. Warren Johnson!
took Robert Johnson to Omaha
on Friday morning where he left
by train for Washington. He will
visit relatives there for the win-
ter months.

Mr. and Mrs. Gerald Terry and
Kathy of Lincoln spent the week
end with Mr. and Mrs. Walter
Patton and Ruth Ann.

A New Year's eve dance was
held at the Cass County Auditor-
ium for teenage youth. A large
crowd attended. The music was
furnished by the Rhythm Rock-
ers from Milford. Erma Kirch-
hoff and Kenneth Domingo won
the door prizes.

Mr. and Mrs. Edward Van
Horn and family attended the
Judy Habel-Gle- n Nickels wedd-
ing at the Methodist church in
Louisville on Tuesday evening at
8:00 p.m.

Mrs. De Forest Philpot and
Miss Joanne Stoll of Lincoln vis-
ited from Friday until Sunday
with Mr. and Mrs. Herbert Stoll.
Mr. and Mrs. Stoll took Joanne
back to Lincoln Sunday after-
noon

Mr. and Mrs. Lewis Baker and
family and Mrs. Vesta Baker of
Lincoln visited on Saturday and
Sunday with Mr. and Mrs. Cecil
Peck and family at Blair.

Mr. and Mrs. Warren Johnson
were Friday dinner guests of
Mr. and Mrs. Stanley Schroeder
of Louisville. Afternoon guests
were Mr. and Mrs Lynn Rothe
and Marlin.

Mr. and Mrs. Willis Lorensen
and family entertained at a pin

All a..

and overnight guecU at the
Stock home were Mr. and Mrs.
Robert Miller of Lincoln.

Mrs. Merle Hunt and Ricky of
Boise, Idaho visited for several
days with Mr. and Mrs. Herbert
Rohrdanz and Frank Hunt.

Mr. and Mrs. Fred Martin and
family of Linden, Iowa, and Mr.
and Mrs. Frank Tiffany of Col-

fax, Iowa were Wednesday and
overnight guests of Mr. and Mrs.
H. W. Christensen.

Mr. and Mrs. James Hermance
and JoAnn of Lincoln were New
Years dinner guests of Mr. and
Mrs. Wilson Bickford and Reg-
gie. JoAnn remained for a visit
until Sunday when Mr. and Mrs.
Bickford and Reggie took her
home and were dinner guests at
the Hermance home. This was a
belated birthday dinner in hon-
or of Mrs. Bickford.

Mr. and Mrs. Norman Urwin
and Alan were Sunday supper
guests of Mr. and Mrs. Clifford
Cooper.

Mr. and Mrs. DeForest Ward
and Mrs. Leroy Zessin visited
from Sunday until Tuesday with
Mr. and Mrs. Gayle Ward in
Wichita, Kansas. Mr. and Mrs.
Charles Ward of Slaughters,
Kentucky are houseguests at the
Gayle Ward home and they
went to visit with them before
they returned to their home.

Mr. and Mrs. Clifford Cooper
spnt Tuesday and Wednesday
at the home of Mr. and Mrs.
Laurence Eidenmlller to help
butcher.

Mr. and Mrs. Lewis Baker en-

tertained the following at a New
Years eve pinochle party: Mes-ser- s.

and Mmes. Larry Mihulke,
Darrell Mather, Harold Bruns,
Pat Wade, Waller Saxton, Eldon
Moore, Richard Harmon and
Henry Hoffman.

Mr. and Mrs. Dean Stratton
and Eric of Lincoln were Satur-
day supper and all day Sunday
guests of Mr. and Mrs. Lee
stratton. Joining them in the
evening on Saturday were Mr.
and Mrs. Leroy Siratton and
boys and Mr. and Mrs. Kenneth
Stratton and Monty.

Mr. and Mrs. Don Urwin of
Louisville were Sunday dinner
guests of Mr. and Mrs. Lewis
Baker and family.

Mrs. Alice Duebler of Daven-
port, Iowa visited from New
Years eve until Monday evening
with Mr. and Mrs. Victor Plunk-
ett and Wendell. Sunday after-
noon guests at the rlunkett
home were Mr. and Mrs. James
McKay.

New Years eve guests at the
Henry Knaup home were Mrs.
C. F. Stilgeoouer or Gettysburg,
South Dakota, Ahlene Fitcn,
Mr. and Mrs. Fred Engelking
and family and Henry Scnaefer
of Elmwood and Bernard Poppe
of Chester.

Mr. and Mrs. Sterling Wiles
and Mrs. and Mrs. Wallace
Richert and children of Mur-
dock were dinner guests of Mr.
and Mrs. Rolland Heil and
Douglas of Omaha.

Jacque and Jimmy Richert of
Murdock visited from Thursday
until Sunday with Mr. and Mrs.
Sterling Wiles while their moth-
er, Mrs. Wallace Richert was in
the hospital with a new baby,
joel Thomas.

1
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Mrs. Art Meeske and boys.
A-2- c and Mrs. John Tvler and

children of Topeka, Kansas visit- -'

ed for a few days with Mr. and
Mrs. L. E Johnson and Mr. and
Mrs. Vein Starr and family of
Ralston.

- Journal Want Ads Pay

I BARGAINS
GALORE

AT YOUR

VETERANS

THRIFT STORE

.Men's Winter f 195
.

ITopcoats i ea.
Men's Winter 95(

Jackets ...... ea.
Men's Shirts, Sweaters 20(

and Pan In ... from
Men's Wo:k and Dress 45(

Shoes pr.
C'hililreis Snowsuits

1 and (Mats, Jackets,
Shirt, Dresses, ICC
Skirti from

IgWomr, Winter Coats flCCfl...ackets ea.
3,000 Women's Dresses OfiC

Ml M m M

Jtronl Shoes, Skirts OfFJ
Sweaters ea.

arm, located 1
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Wffla DELICIOUS B C, Good Used Clothing

'laJnyjjtfWJ " l)a'Iy 9 t0 8 45
ti i I

m 1 Ml aFWTfHHTIf " i"" '

REXALL

ms i nave moved to town, I will sell at Public
mile south

Auction, at the Lancaster P.

of Murray on ' I
America's Largest Selling
Vitamin-Miner- al Formula

35 Day Supply .". $2.59
72 Day Supply $4.79

144 Day Supply $7.95
288 Day Supply $15.90 Value $13.90

(Save $2.00 on this size)

energy with..

Rexo Drug

1 9 t.Q
AT 11 O'CLOCK

SUPER PLENAMINS JUNIOR for children 6 thru 12
36's 1.79 72's 3.29 144's 5.49

SUPER PLENAMINS JUNIOR LIQUID
for children 1 thru 12
8 ox. 3.75 Pint 5.95 14 MEA o

9 White Faced Calves-Wei- ght 400 toSchreiner 2 Roan Cows-- to freshen in Spring.
3 White Faced Cqws-t-o freshen in Spring. duu lbs.

MA.CHIiiiYCDR ROTOR

Mrs. Victor Plunkett and Mrs.
Alice Duebler of Davennort,
Iowa were Sunday evening
guests of Mr. and Mrs. Eanos
Plunkett and girls.

Terry Bickford of Columbia,
Mis ouri visited for a few days
with Mr. and Mrs. Wilson Bick- -

in better
set!

28 ft. Extension Ladder
500 lb Platform Scales
2 wheel hand truck
Pump Jack with Electric Motor

marvel scans the skiesTV

grandparents, Mr. and Mrs. Ray
Wiles and Mr. and Mrs. W. P.
Wright are the great-grandp-ar

ents.
Mr and Mrs. Willis Lorensen

and family were New Year's din
ner guests of Mr. and Mrs. Ken
neth Hauschlid and Steven of
Ceresco.

Mr. and Mrs. Gordon House of
Greenville, Miss., were Tuesday
guests of Mrs. Emily Olive and
Benii.

Mr. and Mrs. Mark Homan and
family, Mr. and Mrs. Willis Lor
ensen and family and Dennis
Gochneour were Monday eve
ning dinner guests of Mr. and
Mrs. Malcoln Pollard and family
of Nehawka. Mr. and Mrs. Poll
ard entertained the members
of the Triple D. Dairy club and
their families at dinner.

Mr. and Mrs. Roger Richards
and family of Orleans were gues
ts for several days of Mr. and
Mrs. Rasmus Lauritzen and
family.

Mr. and Mrs. Rasmus Laurit-
zen and Kenneth entertained at
a birthday party, honoring Alice
Lauritzen on her 16th birthday.
The guests were Mr. and Mrs.
Roger Richards and family of
Orleans, Mr. and Mrs. Richard
Lauritzen and family, Mrs. Rich-
ard Harmon and girls, Mr. and
Mrs. Tom Akeson and Mr. and
Mrs. Rasmus Lauritzen, Sr.

Debbie and Pamela Rich of
Lincoln visited for several days
with Mrs. H. I. Rookstool and
Mr. and Mrs. Gordon Wilcoxen.

Mr. and Mrs. Frank Nickels of
Plattsmouth and Jeanine Habel
of Louisville were Thursday eve-
ning guests of Mr. and Mrs. Ed-
ward Van Horn and family.
Velda accompanied them home
after visiting for two days at
the Van Horn home. Shirley Up-

ton was a Wednesday supper
guests of Carol and Velda Nick-
els.

Mr. nad Mrs. Charles Roberts
of Omaha were New Year's eve
guests of Mr. and Mrs. Raymond
Freeman and Steve.

Mr. and Mrs. Henry Irons and
Julie and Mr. and Mrs. Kenneth
Stratton and Monty were chili
supper guests of Mr and Mrs.
Stuart Meisinger and girls of
Plattsmouth. on Monday eve-
ning. A surprise party was held
in the evening for Mr. and Mrs.
Henry Irons and Julie, with a
number of guests attending A
gift was presented to Julie.

Mr. and Mrs. Hy Kirchhoff
and Mrs. George Kirchhoff were
business visitors in Lincoln on
Tuesday.

Mr. and Mrs. James Stewart
and Jenefer of Anaheim, Calif-
ornia were callers of Mr. and
Mrs. Lynn Rothe and family.

Neila Pierce of Nehawka was
a Tuesday overnight guest of
Sandra Jameson.

Steven Freeman, son of Mr.
and Mrs. Raymond Freeman,

ROTATES AUTOMATICALLY YOUR ANTENNA
straight at the sending
tower of the channel

to track down the best
nnRsihlft nietureon every

want.A channel.

like radar to pull

pictures on your

AIMS

in you

READ

Hundred
are now in
areat just

"MORE STATIONS,

lots of
they all
have a better
cdr rotor

-- Mr.
"STATIONS WE

In clean and
pleasure

20 Farmall Tractor on Rubber.
John Deere 730 Two row pull type Lister
Van Brunt 18 hole grain drill, with grass at-

tachment, good
New Idea 4 wheel manure spreader-go-od

John Deere 42 ft. Grain Elevator-go- od

John Deere Speed Jack
John Deere Hoist-- in good shape
Letz No. 80 Grinder-ve- ry good
New Idea 12 ft. EZ flow-li- ke new
John Deere 12A Combine-compl- ete with

pickup attachmeant
15 ft. Rodrich Lean Disc
Chase two row
C-- 1 Pride of the Farm Stock tank, Electric
IHC Cream Sepcrator
IHC Milking Machine
IHC Corn Planter
Set of 18 inch furrow openers
Cattle Chute
80 gallon Kline Hog Waters, oil heat
70 bushel Wooden hog feeder
Oil Tank Heater-ncv- er used
Cement mixer-go- od shape
11 ft. IHC Sulky Rake

275 gallon fuel tank
Walking plow
Scraper
Broadcaster Sceder-wi- th grass attachment
2 drive belts
Set Steel Wheels for F20 Tractor
Barrels
4 Heat Lamps
Set of Roll-a-wa- y nests
2 Electric Brooders
1 Oil Brooder Stove
1 Sensation 20 inch Lawn Mower
Chicken feeders Cr waters
Hog troughs
Wheel Barrow
Shop tools
Heavy lor chain

WHAT ACTUAL USERS SAY!

of thousand! of CDR Rotort
une and in TV reception
like your.

BETTER PICTURES. We have

company from far and near, and

say we get more stations and
picture than they do. Tha

can not be beat."
C. J. McCantt, Anrtion). Kant at
NEVER DREAMED Of GETTING com

clear. We never received real

NO WONDER YOU HAVE TV TROUBLE with weak or nowy picture nd

"ghosts" on to many channels! Like most people, you're prob-

ably in a location where TV signals come from many directions

-- not just the one yout antenna was set up to face.

WHAT TO DO ABOUT ITT Make your antenna work 3 or 4 times more

efficiently and bring in the best possible picture from any

direction. What you need is the TV marvel that causes your

antenna to Circle and Detect like Radar-t- he CDR ROTOR.

EASY AS Here's all you do to pull in clearer,

harper, stronger pictures:

1. Turn handy Skyeweep Direction Selector on CDR'$ beau-

tiful little Control Cabinet.

1 Rotor at the bast of your roof-anten- tJrm it in a com-

plete circle till you tee the picture clearer than ever before.

Lift your finger from the Selector and yojir antenna

locke in potition.

Simple, isn't itT So why settle for half-wa- y TVt Putl in oil

the channeli youf aet is equipped to receive-w- ith a thrifty

CDR ROTOR. .

out of TV till we got the new

goods and many other

CDR ROTOR." --Curtit Oof, Benton, 111.

"SURROUNDED BY HIGH BUILDINGS. Even
though my antenna is a very good one, I
couldn't get a true, sharp image. Since

installing a CDR rotor, my ir'ures are
clearer, sharper, steadier. My set behaves
lfke a brand new one, even though the
nearest TV station is over45 miles away."

-- Melvin A. Mot: Flint. Mich.

Lots of Scrap Iron
Some Household

articles

MURRAY

served on ground by Ladies of Murray Chrisrhn
TERMS: CASH DAY OF SALE

n a .W) ROTOR
Ly f EjlNCtl NO E"CT UKI 3

Church.

STATE BANK, Clerk

Lunch

FT3 . n

YOUNG and MORRIS

NOW.' Start getting

perfect TV pictures
ifh a c

l-- M Wat

to

AUCTIONEERS
Pitft TV aaeUa'


