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all their children home. Present
were Mr. and Mrs. Jim Hall. of
Kearney; Mr. and Mrs. Marion
Wendt of Unadilla and Mr. and
Mrs. Ed Parriott and children.

Mrs. Cora Gerbeling spent
Thanksgiving Day dinner with
her three sons and family at
the home of Dale Gerbeling and
family. Also there were Clyde
Gerbeling and Ralph Gerbeling
and family. She returned to her
home Sunday.

Mrs. Blanche Kuehn and Alice
entertained with Thanksgiving
dinner Mr. and Mrs. Reuben
Stock and sons, Jim and Joe, cf
Murdock. Mrs. Stock is Blanche's
daughter, Eunice. Also a guost
was Mrs. Frank Gustin, her sis-

ter. Jim and Joe Stock remain-
ed over the weekend. Friday
evening they entertained Miss
Ethel Langhorst for supper.

Mr. and Mrs. Harold Wilken's
Carol, son, Allen drove to Ithaca
Sunday where they had a
Thanksgiving dinner with her
mother, Mrs. Otto Berlin. Mr.
and Mrs. Virgil Frahm and fam-
ily of Ithaca were guests. Mrs.
Frahm is also a daughter of Mrs.

" 'Berlin.
Elmwood

Omaha Thanksgiving
Thanksgiving morning early

Mr. and Mrs. Joe Kunz and Dale
called to take Mrs. Chas. Born-emei- er

to Omaha for Thanks-
giving turkey dinner with Mr.
and Mrs. George Dilger and son
Charles. Mrs. Dilger is her
daughter. The Kunz returned to
Elmwood but Mrs. Bornemeier
remained until Sunday when

giving dinner at their home for
the family, Sunday. Those at-
tending were Mr. and Mrs. Lewis
Koutsky, Mr. and Mrs. Robert
Schriner, Mr. and Mrs. Bedic
Wanek, Mrs. Henry Hansen, Mrs.
Ellen Kunz all of Lincoln; Mr.
and Mrs. - Dale Beckman and
daughter, Susan, of Omaha. His
mother, Mrs. Elda Lenz, com-
pleted the family gathering. For
Thanksgiving Mrs. Lenz rela-
tives were the guests for dinner.
The guests were Mr. and Mrs.
John Peterson, her parents Mr.
and Mrs. Dean Wieners and
family of three children all of
Lincoln; Mrs. Mary Ann Peter-
son, Denver; Mr. and Mrs. Jack
Kalkhorst and four children
from Denver.

Mr. and Mrs. George Eiden-mill- er

had Thanksgiving dinner
at their home, on Thursday with
Mr. and Mrs. Robert Clark and
baby son, (Mrs. Clark is their
daughter Jocelea); Mrs. Eiden-miller- 's

mother, Mrs. Viola
Hayes, and her sister, Mrs. Les-s- ie

Weidick, from Los Angeles,
Calif., who is at present vis-
iting the mother, Mrs. Hayes.

Mr. and Mrs. Elmer Hall en-
tertained at a Thanksgiving
supper Thursday, Nov. 24, with

SPECIAL
OLD TIME SALESMAN'S SAMPLE SALE OF

COSTUME JEWELRY
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Mrs. Thomas Tennant
Phone 4251 Louisville

Mr. and Mrs. Lester Wagoner
calitd at the Lloyd Schneider
home Friday evening.

Mr. and Mrs. Harold Ahl and
Don spent Thanksgiving at the
Harry Tigner home in Platts-i.iout- h.

- .

Mr. and Mrs. John Wagoner, j

Mrs. Florence Mayneld and
family, Mr. and Mrs. Robert
Startzer and family of Spring-
field, Mies Ruth Schroeder and
Bill Wagoner were entertained
uith Thanksgiving supper at
Harry Ahl home.

Mrs. Sam Fullton of Omaha;
Lt. and Mrs. Wm. Fulton fam-
ily cf Texas visited at the Day-
ton Hennings home last week.

Mr. and Mrs. Elmer Johnson
entertained their family with
Thanksgiving supper Friday.
Present were Mr. and Mrs. Ber-
nard Johnson and Vicki of
Weeping Water; Mr. and Mrs.
John Van Vleit and son of Lin- -
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295 250
Burgundy Blue
Beie White
Wbue Green
Browa Cold
Grey

I Firtiton FOAM RUBBER Innertotes

J Wah and dry in a jiffy!
Fit left and right foot!

I Pack like a hankie! Sizes: SMI

I
Pad-a-round- s: I

I Quantity Size Color

Grove
505 Main

es and family cf Kearney. Mr.
and Mrs. Rhodes visited at the
Johnsons, leaving Sunday for
their home in Kearney.

Mr. and Mrs. Maurice Group
and family, Mr- - and Mrs. Tony
Moran and family of Ralston
were supper guests at the Lloyd
Group home Thanksgiving.

Mr. and Mrs. Bill Green and
Patti of Storm Lake, Iowa visit-
ed Friday and Saturday at the
Maurice Group home. Mr. and
Mrs. Elmer Sprieck visited Mrs.
Floyd Gaur at ihe M. E. Hospi-
tal Sunday evening.

Mr. and Mrs. Elmer Sprieck
entertained with Thanksgiving
supper. Those present were Mr.
and Mrs. Clarence Stutton, Bill
and Bob, Mr. and Mrs. Marion
Sutton, Mr. and Mrs. Otto
Sprieck, Mr. and Mrs. Clarence
Sjogren and family.

Mr. and Mrs. Ervin Albert and
family, Mr. and Mrs. Harold
Striker cf Omaha were dinner
guests at the Ray Parcell home
in Elmwood Thanksgiving.

Mr. and Mrs. Elmer Johnson
were among those to attend the
Rhodes-Gibso- n wedding at
Weeping Water Thursday.

Mr. and Mrs. Otto Sprieck en-
tertained, family at dinner Sun
day, Nov. 20. Those present
were Mr. and Mrs. Otto Heil,
Bob and Judy; Noma Heard,
Mr. and Mrs. Norman Hutchi
son, Lincoln; Mr. and Mrs. Ro
land Heil of Omaha, Mr. and
Mrs. Elmer Sprieck and family,

Visitors at the Ervin Albert
Nov. 20 were Mr. and Mrs. J. H.
Albert and Mr. and Mrs. Ray
Parcell.

Thanksgiving guests at the
John Ritter homo were Mr. and
Mrs. Francis Ritter and son of
Papillion; Mr. and Mrs. Ed Gu-
thrie and family and Francis
Ritter, Sr. all of Omaha.

Mrs. Richard Livingston and
Susan, called at the Dayton
Hennings home Sunday after-
noon.

Mr. and Mrs. Roy Bricker of
Elsie visited and were dinner
guests at the Elmer Johnson
home Friday.

Mr. and Mrs. Don Thornton
called at the Dayton Hennings
home Tuesday evening.

Mr. and Mrs. Harry Ahl, John
and Kenneth, and Mrs. Florence
Mayfield, visited in Omaha Sat-
urday.

Mr. and Mrs. Lester Wagoner
were dinner guests at the Bob
Wagoner home Thanksgiving.

Mr. and Mrs. Arthur Derby
entertained with Thanksgiving
dinner. Present were Mr. and
Mrs. John Grahm, Mr. and Mrs.
LeRoy Derby and family, Mr.
and Mrs,, Ira Clinkenbeard of
Platfsmouth; Mr. and Mrs. B.
Clinkenbeard and David, Miss
Kay Andrews and Don Derby of
Lincoln; Jim and Miss Pat
Mathers.

Mr. and Mrs-- . Jim Ingram
drove to Lincoln Thursday to
spend Thanksgiving at the El-

mer Brandt home.
Mr. and Mrs. Tom Tennant

were dinner guests at the Mel-vi- n

Reed home Thanksgiving.
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David Eugene at St. Mary's
hospital, Nebraska City, weight
7 lbs. 15 Vz oz., November. 27,
1955 to 'Mr. and Mrs. James D.
Graves. Grandparents are Mr.
and Mrs. L. B. Todd, Murray
and Mr. and Mrs. Jim L. Graves.
Daughter

A daughter Martha Dorrine
to Major and Mrs. Bedford Rig-ga- n,

Nov. 19, 1955, weight 7 lbs.,
IOV2 oz.

The average 1954 income of
50,000,000 men who had some
income was $3,200 and for some
28,000,000 women, the average
figure was about $1,200. This
was about the same as in 1953,

but was considerably higher
than in 1945.

By

Mr. and Mrs. Lee Brown of
Sand Point, Idaho and Mr. and
Mrs. Bert Philpot of Weeping
Water were Saturday evening
callers at the Cynthia Dawson
and the Jack Philpot homes.

Miss Imogene Schiber who is
employed with the Trans World
Airlines in Kansas City, Mo.,
spent Thanksgiving vacation
with her parents, Mr. and Mrs.
Oliver Schiber. Miss Schiber
recently spent six weeks in Den-
ver working for the Airline com-
pany.

Mr. and Mrs. Jack Todd of
Lincoln were guests of Mrs.
Todd's parents, Mr. and Mrs.
Elmer Lohnes last week and
other relatives.

Mrs. Otto Lutz and daughter,
Marilyn have moved to town
and have rented Vieir farm
home west of Mynard to Mr.
and Mrs. Joe Loper and family.

Denny Ptak, son of Mr. and
Mrs. Theo Ptak, arrived from
Burbank, Calif., Tuesday morn-
ing where he has been employ-
ed at Lockheed Aircraft for the
past three months. He plans on
remaining m Plattsmouth.

Mr. and Mrs. Harold Buechler
and daughter Joyce s p e nt
Thanksgiving with Mr. and Mrs
Dan Terryberry and other rela
tives at Imperial. Mrs. Terry- -
berry is a sister of Mr. Buechler.
Mrs. Bertha Buechler accom
panied them home.

CALENDAR

Thursday, Dec. 1

Regular meeting Hugh J.
Kearns Post No. 56, the Ameri-
can Legion, Dec. 1, 1955, 8 p. m.,
40 & 8 club rooms.
Thursday, Dec. 1

Eagles Auxiliary will meet
Thursday, Dec. 1, at 8:00 p. m.
at the Eagles Hall.
Friday, Dec. 2

Good Will Kensington Christ-
mas party Dec. 2, 8 p. m.,tIOOF
Hall. '

Friday, Dec. 2 - ; J'
Chapter F, PEO, meets at 2:30

with Mrs. Alice Woster.
Friday, Dec. 2

Circle and Square Dance Club
will meet Friday, December 2,
at 322 Main at 8:30 p.m.
Sunday, Dec. 4

The Martin Rutt Chapter of
Daughters of the American Co-

lonists will hold their Christmas
business meeting and party at
the home of Mrs. Dale Philpot,
Plattsmouth, Nebr., on Sunday,
Dec. 4, 1955. The 1:00 p.m. din
ner will be followed by a busi-
ness meeting and exchange of
gifts.
Monday, December 5

P-- T. A. will meet at Central
building, Monday, Dec. 5.

Plattsmouth Woman's Club
Christmas party Dec. 5, 8 p.m.
at the home of Mrs. J. G. Mc-Mak- en.

Tuesday, December 6

Home Chapter 189 O. E. S. re-

gular meeting and election of of
ficers Tuesday, December 6, at
the Masonic Hall, 7:30 p.m.
Tuesday, December 6

Navy mothers will meet at te
home of Mrs. Helen Vroman,
Dec. 6 at 7:30 p.m. Christmas
party.

Cass County's
Greatest Newspaper

The Plattsmouth Journal

Mr. and Mrs. Dave Toman and
sons were at Wymore Saturday
where they spent the day at
the Harry Henton home.

Mr. Bert Philpot of Weeping
Water was in Plattsmouth Wed-
nesday on business.

"
Friends received word that

Mr. and Mrs. Stuart Reeby of St.
Paul, Minn., are the parents of
a son born Nov. 19. Mrs. Reeby
was the former Marj one Devoe.

A. J. Ross of Nebraska City
was transacting business in
town Wednesday.

Mrs. Harold Hyde and Mrs.
Walter Fulton of Plattsmouth
returned from Hammond, Ind.,
Friday morning after a three-an- d

one-ha- lf week visit with
their husbands, who are work-
ing for the Missouri Valley
Dredge company there. Their
visit ended with Thanksgiving
Day spent with-- their husbands.

Lt. and Mrs. Jim Doody who
are visiting here while awaiting
overseas orders were supper
guests of Mr. and Mrs. Frank
Rebal Tueday and later evening
callers at the home of Mr. and- -

Mrs. Carl Morehead.

Charles D. Koke Sr. who re-

turned to his home from the
Clarkson hospital, Omaha only
last Saturday, was taken quite
ill on Wednesday evening and
has returned to the hospital. He
is in room 203.

following also came in to help
him: Mr. and Mrs. Ernest Have-ma- n,

Mr. and Mrs. Hans Jensen,
Mr. and Mrs. William Dettmer,
Mr. and Mrs. Harry Kepler, Mr.
and Mrs. John Emshoff, Mr. and
Mrs. William Kepler, Mr. and
Mrs. Elvin Emshoff and daugh-
ter, Mr. and Mrs. John Buck-hol-z,

Mr. and Mrs. Darrell Math-
er and sons, Mr. and Mrs. Al-

bert Bose and sons, Mrs. Dena
Ruge, Miss Francis Ruge, Mrs.
Sophia Emshoff.

Avoca

Meyer Son Born
Mr. and Mrs. John Meyer are

the parents of a son, born at
Memorial Hospital, Nov; 23.
Grandparents are Mrs. Prigge,
Syracuse, Mr. and Mrs. George
Meyer, Avoca. They have anoth
er son.

Avoca
Mrs. Caroline Marquardt spent

Sunday at Russell, Iowa, where
she visited Mr. and Mrs. Ted
Hile and family.

Mr. and Mrs. Fred Marquardt
and family spent Thanksgiving
at Springfield, Mo., with Mr. and
Mrs. K. V. White and sons.

Miss Mary Zimmerer, Nebras-
ka City, who recently came
home from a trip to Europe,
spent Thanksgiving at the Os-

car Zimmerer home.
Mrs. William Maseman enter-

tained at a birthday supper hon-
oring Mrs. Myrtle Wolph Tues-
day. Other guests were Mrs. Ray
Norris, Mrs. John Norris, Mrs.
Lois Tefft and Mrs. Tom Akeson.

Mrs. Henry Smith has word
of the death Sunday of her
mother, Mrs. Mogens Johnson.

Avoca

Chest X-ra- y Dates
The Chest X-r- ay Mobile unit

will be in Avoca Dec. 7, 9-- i2 and
1- -5 o'clock.
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Mrs. E. B. Thomason was re-

leased from the St. Catherine
hospital, Omaha, last week and
is recuperating at her home in
the country.

.

Mrs. Joseph Bierl was releas-
ed from the St. Catherine hospi-
tal, Omaha last Thursday and
is recuperating at her home. -

Mrs. John Vinduska mother
of Henry Vinduska returned to
her home in Omaha Friday
from St. Joseph hospital.

Mr. and Mrs. Dale Henton
and children, Bobby and Patty
arid Mrs. Harry Henton return-
ed Sunday night from Oshkosh
where they had spent Thanks-
giving weekend at the Charles
Contryman home. They also vi-

sited in Grand Island enroute
home with Orin Contryman and
family.

Mrs. W. H. Polley returned
Tuesday evening from Ottawa,
Kans., where she has been car-
ing for her sister, Mrs. J.

Mr. and Mrs. Albert Richards
entertained at Thanks giving
dinner Mr. and Mrs. Albert
Stokes, Mrs. Marie Richards,
Mrs. Cynthia Dawson, and Chas-Dill- .

Mrs. John Price of Maryville,
Mo., was an overnight house
guest last Monday of Mr. and
Mrs. Fred Bourck.

A V C fi
Mrs. Henry Maseman

Correspondent

Women's Fellowship
Women s Fello w s h i p met

Tuesday in the church parlors
with the Missionary Committee
as hostesses. Chairman was Mrs.
Nancy Carsten. Mrs. William
Baier led the devotional period
and mentioned the 70 birthday
of the ladies aide of the Avoca
church.

Mrs. . Nancy .. Carsten read a
short" history of the Aide. Mrs.
J. W. Brendle read letters from
a former member, Miss Florence
Bardil, originator of the birth-
day party. Also letters were read
from Mrs. George Shackley of
Missouri; Niss Mary Roland and
Miss Flora Morley, both of Cali-
fornia.

Avoca
Dr. and Mrs. J. W. Brendle

were Thanksgiving guests of Mr.
and Mrs. John Marquardt and
Elenore. Also present was Harry
Marquardt.

Mrs. John Nutzman was a
Thanksgiving guest of Mr. and
Mrs. Joy Shroder near Palmyra.

Mr. and Mrs. Henry Condmier,
Mrs. Mary Louise Kennood,
Omaha, were. Thanksgiving
goests of Mr. and Mrs. Carl Zai-se- r.

,

Avoca

Flu Hits
Several families have been

layed low with the intestinal flu
this week.

Avoca
Mrs. Eli Wilson entertained

at the Lone Oaks near Lincoln
Sunday honoring the birthday of
her husband and Mrs. Elmer
Wessel. Guests were Mrs. El
mer Wessel, Mr. and Mrs. Carl
Zaiser, Mrs. Pauline Ludwig and
Paula.

At a late Thanksgiving dinner
Sunday at the John Emshoff
home were Wayne Wessel, Miss
Velda Sterns of Lincoln, Pvt.
Merlyn Minderman, Camp Chaf-
fee, Ark.; Mr. and Mrs. Ed Koes-t- er

and family and Mr. and Mrs.
Clarence Koester and family of
Otoe; Mr. and Mrs. Elton Blahie
and daughter, Mr. and Mrs.
Harold Blahie, Miss Doretta
Koester of Weeping Water.

Pvt. Merlyn Minderman arriv-
ed home Saturday from Ft. Bliss,
Texas, for a 14-d- ay furlough
with his mother, Mrs. Alma Min-
derman, and other relatives.

Mr. and Mrs. Louis Ruhge, Mr.
and Mrs. Maynard Bruns and
family, Mrs. Robert Mickle, Mrs.
Harry Michle" were Thanksgiving
guests of Mr. and Mrs. Ronald
Ganzel and children at Paw-
nee City Thursday.

Mrs. John Heebner and Mrs.
C. S. Miller of Weeping Water
helped their granddaughter,
Evelyn Heebner, daughter of Mr.
and Mrs. Lester Heebner, cele-
brate her fourth birthday Sun-
day. Fifteen little friends came
in and helped her celebrate.

Danny Crounover, son of Mr.
and Mrs. Robert Crounover, had
a tonsilectomy Tuesday.

A total of 22 friends of a
dance club at Brock surprised
Ernest Emshoff Wednesday eve-
ning, the night before his birth-
day. On Thursday evening the

Mr. and Mrs. Dilger and Charles
brought her home. They all had
supper at her home, then went:
to visit Mr. and Mrs. Henry
Bornemeier. Mrs. Henry Borne-
meier has been suffering from
a heart condition but was sitting
up. Then the Dilger's drove to
Lincoln to return Charles to the
University of Nebraska, where
he is a senior.

Elmwood
Mr. and Mrs. Sydney Moore

entertained a t Thanksgiving
dinner their son, Jim Moore,
and wife, Shirley; their daugh-
ter, Joann Lynn. Ethel Lang-hors- t,

Mrs. Moore's sister, and
their little granddaughter, Jan-
et Gibbs, was also there. She has
been with the Moores for sev-

eral months. On Sunday, Nov.
27, Mrs. Moore left for Shreve-po- rt

La., to take Janet home to
her parents; Mr. and Mrs. Vern
Gibbs. Mrs. Gibbs is the daugh-
ter of the Moore's (Dorothy).

Carol Ann Blessing was enter-
tained at dinner on Thanksgiv-
ing Day at the home of Mr. and
Mrs. Allen Ehlers, Sr., Avoca.

Mr. and Mrs. Orville Lenz and
family entertained a Thanks- -
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Rubber Toys Large
$1.98 each

TOY CARS Large
98c each

GAMES Ass't.
2 for 39c

Model Airplane Kit
98c each

SQUEEZE TOYS
Asst.

59c each

BANK Metal
Ass't.

98c each
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Stovers Chocolates1 PJ
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A Classified Ad in The Journal
costs as little as 35 cents 1

RADIATOR REPAIRING

Plattsmouth Motors
ONE-DA- Y SERVICE

Washington Ave. Ph. 287

EVENT

Jewelry
Dial 288

PHOTo
CREETINC

CARDS
1 Dy Service

50 for
$5.50

We Give

S & H

Green Stamps
On All Cifts

Purchases

Gifts bright and gay at prices easy to pay! That's what
you'll find at FELDHOUSEN'S to brighten your Christmas
shopping and lighten the cost of being a perfect Santa to
every person on your list. Come in today and wrap up
your gift buying the quick . . . easy . . . economical way!
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Kings Men Sets from $1.50
Timex Wrist Watches ?. . . $10.95
Ronson Lighters from $3.95
Billfold, all leather $3.75
Midnight Sets from $1.00
Plastic Billffolds, Fancy 98c
Electrique Toilet Sets from $1.50
Cotys Sets from $2.00

Give Your

Baby's Picture
for Christmas!
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J WOSTER SHOES
I Platfsmouth, Ncbr. J
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60"
ELECTRIC RAIOR

Start now to keep a thrilling
record of your baby's life in
pictures. Let our camera cap-
ture the true-to-lif- e charm of
baby's mischievous smiles . . .

happy laughter . . . and pensive
moments ... in photographs
you'll treasure through the
years.

PHONE 226 OR 6212

FOR APPOINTMENT

Compete
lights

UA with cose

V9 9Rn
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CHRISWISER'S
BABY PICTURES OUR SPECIALTY
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