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at the F. A. Hansen home. Mr.
and Mrs. Glen Krager and fam-
ily, Plattsmouth, called Sunday
afternoon.

Mrs. George Pollard was the
euest of her son. I.nrrv at n one

N e h aw ka RELUCTANT DONOR
A cow recently Kicsed about

giving milk. Her protest cost a
Central City farmer several
stitches in his fight cheek.

Phone 2604

IP
Westerners Are
Guests Last Week

Mrs. Bob Williams and daugh-
ter, Chrisandra, North Platte,
and her mother, Mrs. Henry
Swartz of Nehawka were guests
for several days last week of Mr.
and Mrs. Lester Waldo at Un-
ion. On Wednesday they went
to Lincoln to visit his parents,
Mr. and Mrs. R. E. Williams.

Nehawka
BIRTH

Mr. and Mrs. Don Dory, Lin-
coln, are the parents of a son,
Thomas Sheldon, born April 29.
Scott Dory, their other son, is at
the home of Mr. and Mrs. Mar-
ion Tucker. Don Dory, Lincoln,
was a guest for the day at the
Tucker home Sunday.

Nehawka
Mr. and Mrs. Wilbur Ringler,

Lincoln, were guests for the day
Sunday of her parents, Mr. and
Mrs. John Tyson.

Mr. and Mrs. Carl Dierking,
Otoe, Mr. and Mrs. Arnold
French and children, Avoca,
and Mr. and Mrs. Forrest Todd
and son called during the after-
noon and evening.

Mrs. Evelyn Bacgert, Lincoln,
was a week end guest of her
parents, Mr. and Mrs. Senn
WaddelL

Mr. and Mrs. Byron Warlick,
Holcrrege, were week end guests
of his parents. Mr. and Mrs. I.
A. Warlick. They came for the
senior class play Friday. His
brother, Floyd, was a member of
the cast.

Mr. and Mrs. Oscar Brandt en-

tertained four tables at cards
Saturday evening in recognition
of their sixth wedding anniver-
sary.

Mr. and Mrs. Glenn Thacker,
Mr. and Mrs. J. J. Pollard, Miss
Isabel Willsie and Mrs. Ernest
Pollard were dinner guests Sun-
day of Mr. and Mrs. George
Sheldon.

Mr. and Mrs. F. J. Knecht,
South Bend; Mr. and Mrs. Les-
ter Wunderlich, Murray, were
guests for the day Sunday of
Mrs. Sadie Schrader and Gerald.

Nehawka

Letter Tells Of
Interesting Sights
In Cairo, Egypt

Mr. and Mrs. F. O. Sand re-
ceived a letter from their daugh-
ter, Mrs. Blaine Sloan from

Omaha, were guests Saturday at
the Robert Wunderlich home.
Bobby Wunderlich, son of Mr.
and Mrs. Bob Wunderlich. re-

turned home Friday from Chil-
dren's Memorial hospital in Om-
aha, where he was a patient
the past week.

Mr. and Mrs. Louis Poulos and
children, Springfield, Nebr.,
called at the George Poulos, Sr.,
home Sunday evening.

Mrs. Roy Splitt took her moth-
er, Mrs. Anna Harshman, to
Browns hospital at Nebraska
City Monday. She will be a pa-
tient there for several days.

Mrs. Ona Kunkel's dinner
guests Sunday included Mr. and
Mrs. Howard Snodgrass, Union;
Dr. and Mrs.' L. N. Kunkel,
Weeping Water, Mr. and Mrs.
Bob Snodgrass, Nebraska City.

Mr. and Mrs. Dale Pummell
and family, Avoca. called at the
Harold Kearney home Sunday
evening.

A number of blood donors gave
to the Red Cross bloodmobile
unit at Avoca Thursday.

Mr. and Mrs. Elmer Stoll and
family called at the Herbert
Stoll home at Eagle Sunday eve-
ning. Monday Mr. Stoll attend-
ed a board meeting at the I. O.
O. F. home at York.

Mr. and Mrs. Stuart Schlichte-
meier and daughter were guests
Sunday of her mother, Mrs. Vio-len- ta

Conn at Panama. Thurs-
day evening they visited Mr. and
Mrs. Orville Kreifel at Spring-
field.

There are 122 billion tons of
recoverable coal reserves under-
lying the State of Tennessee.

Your Doctor's
Prescriptions

Promptly
Filled

Schreiner Drugs
A Druggist on duty

at all times.

SPECIAL

Mrs. F. O. Sand

Mr. and Mrs. Jim Sturm, Mr.
and Mrs. Melvin Sturm. Mrs.
Jack Reece and daughter had
dinner Saturday evening at
Sieinhart park at Nebraska
City.

Mrs. Jirn Sturm attended fun-
eral services Monday for Rev.
J. J. Sheaff at Lincoln. Rev.
Sheaff officiated at the wedding
of Mr. and Mrs. Sturm two weeks
ago. Ke died very suddenly of
a heart attack.

Mr. and Mrs. Leon Gansemer
rnd family. Murray, were sud-p- er

guests Sunday at the Ralph
V.'ieckhorst home.

Mrs. Harold Kearney and Mrs.
Kilev Thome drove cars to take
the children of district 3 to rural
school dav at Nebraska City
Tuesday. Miss Constance Fran-
cois is "the teacher.

Mr. and Mrs Harold Johnson
nnd family. Union: Mr. and Mrs.
Dick Johnson and daughter were
dinner guests Sunday at the
Ilenning Johnson home.

Judy Wieckiiorst has the
chicken pox.

iOSS eotre
Plattsmouth

Last Times Mon. & Tues., May
12-1- 3

Kirl; Douglas and a big cast
"THE BIG TREES"

Technicolor Special filmed in
the Redwood country!
Comedy, Cartoon, News

Wed. & Thurs., May 14-1- 5

Double Feature
Lucille Ball & John Agar

"THE MAGIC CARPET"
Days cf adventure Nights of

Delight !

and
Kirby Grant, Margaret Field &

Gail Davis
in

"YUKON MANHUNT"
Tames Oliver Curwood's story of

the North country!
Night Shows 7:00 & 9:30

BIRTH
Relatives here have received

announcements of the birth of
a daughter. Patricia Louise, to
Mr. and Mrs. Forbes King of
Sacramento, Calif. Mrs. Forbes
is the former Maxine Steffens,
formerly of Nehawka.

iNfiiawKa
Pvt. Elmer and Mrs. Ross,

Camp Roberts, Calif., called Mr.
and Mrs. Martin Ross Saturday
night to extend Mothers Day
greetings to Mrs. Ross. Elmer
goes on bivouac duty Thursday
and will be gone four weeks. El-
mer recently underwent surgery
to have a cyst removed from the
inside lower lip. His condition
is much unproved. While their
husbands are on tivouc duty,
Mrs. Ross and Mrs. Juanita Rec-
tor will s pend the time at Fres-
no with Mrs. Rector's mother.

Mr. and Mrs. Hall Pollard ac-
companied Mr. and Mrs. James
Pollard of Plattsmouth to Weep-
ing Water Friday evening to
visit Mr. and Mrs. Marion Stone.

Mr. and Mrs. O. T. Reece,
Ashland, were guests for the
day Sunday of Mr. and Mrs.
Melvin Sturm.

Gilbert Edmonds is seriously
ill at his home with the flu.

Nfhawka
Attend Services
For Uncle Sunday

Mrs. Carl Meisinger of Cook
and Mrs. Dan Anderson accom-
panied Bud Chriswisser of Louis-
ville to Custer, S. D., where they
attended funeral services Sun-
day for their uncle, Edward Ah-ren- s,

77. Mr. Ahrens was a for-
mer resident of Wyoming pre-
cinct. Mrs. Meisinger. Mrs. An-
derson and Mr. Chriswisser
spent Saturday and Sunday
nishts with relatives at Scotts-bluf- f.

They returned Monday
night.

.NftiawKa
Ms. Myrtle Cross, Alhambra.

Calik, arrived Sunday evening
to visir her brothers, Ivan Bal- -

j four of Union, Carl Balfour of
Nehawka and other relatives.

Patsy Li2htcat, Aurora, is vis-- :
iting at the Thurmond Nixon
home.

SCHRIENER DRUG
Phone 4114 SMCLCE

Have Recent Guests
Recent callers of Mrs. Lena

Schlichtemeier were Mrs. Frank
Schlichtemeier of Union and her
daughter, Mrs. Frank Cook of
West Bend. Iowa; Mrs. Paul
Wolph, Avoca; Mrs. James Bu-di- n,

Clarkson, Nebr.; Mrs. C. C.
Trotter, Mrs. Alvin McReynolds
and Mr. and Mrs. Wm. Orndorn.
Mrs. Schlichtemeier, who has
been ill for some time, is some-
what improved.

reiia wKa
Tuesday evening. May 6 was

open house at the new ag build-
ing. Wives of the school board
members served refreshments.

Commencement will be Friday
evening. May 16, with Joseph
Alexis of the Nebraska Univer-
sity guest speaker.

Saturday, May 17 the picnic
will be held at school.

NenawKa
Junior-Senio- r
Banquet Is Held

The junior-seni- or banquet was
held Monday evening at Cotner
Terrace in Lincoln. All faculty
members and their wives, and
Mr. and Mrs. Glenn Thacker
were invited guests. The ban-
quet theme was 'Space."'

Mrs. George Poulos, Sr., Mrs.
Ona Kunkel, Mrs. C. Trotter, ac-
companied Miss Bessie Murdoch
to Nebraska City Saturday aft-
ernoon where they visited Mrs.
Alice Plybon, Miss Florence
Knabe and Mrs. McConnell at
St. Mary's hospital.

Mrs. Emma Nutzman, Mrs.
Ned Nutzman and Mrs. Henry
Ross were business visitors in
Lincoln Monday.

Mr. and Mrs. Deane Nutzman
were guests at a pinocle party
Saturday evening at the Frank
Hobscheidt home near Union.

Mrs. Ruth B. Pollard and
Leonard St. John, Nebraska City,
called at the Hall Pollard home
Sunday morning. Sunday din-
ner guests at the Pollard home
were Dr. and Mrs. Elton New-
man and children, Omaha.

Tommy Johnson, Marjorie
Whipple and Peggy Sand have
been awarded trips to 4-- H club
week in Lincoln May 26
through 29.

XeJiawka

Baccalaureate
Services Sunday

The baccalaureate service was
held Sunday evening. May 11. at
the auditorium with Rev. An-

ders Hansen, Lutheran minister
at Elkhorn, Iowa, speaker. Mr.
Hansen is also superintendent
of the Salem home for old peo-
ple and invalids.

Nehawka

Ruth Bruns Is
F.H.A. President

Ruth Bruns was elected pres-
ident of the Future Homemak-er- s

of America at the organiza-
tion's last meeting of the year,
April 28, at the school. Other
officers are Janice Switzer, vice
president; Janet Cook, treasur-
er; Pat Dietl, secretary; Tatsy
Mather, song leader; Alberta
Nixon, recreation leader; Jean-in- e

Cooper, historian; Phyllis
Switzer, news reporter. The
chapter mothers are Mrs. A.
Mather, Mrs. Joe Dietl and Mrs.
A. Bruns. Janice Switzer and
Rosemary Redden served re-

freshments.
Nehawka

Rev. A. B. Small, Miss Lillian
Small, Mr. and Mrs. Guy Mur-
doch attended the meeting of
the Cass county minister's or-

ganization at the church at
Murray Sunday evening.

NewaWedding Date
Set For May 18

Invitations have been received
by relatives to the wedding of
Miss Charlotte Mayfield of Chi-
cago, daughter of Mr. and Mrs.
R. C. Mayfield of Louisville, and
James Dobervitch of Chicago.
The wedding will take place at
the Christian church at Weep-
ing Water May 18. Miss May-fie- ld

is a sister of Boyd and Ray-
mond Mayfield of Nehawka.

Nehawka
Sunday afternoon and lunch

guests at the Glen Masters home
were Mr. and Mrs. Lester Chris-
tiansen and son, Mr. and Mrs.
Charles Purdy and daughter,
Lincoln.

Mr. and Mrs. Wayne Linder
and daughter, Lincoln, were
wreek end guests of Mr. and
Mrs. Frank Linder. Mr. and Mrs.
Everett Brockman, Elmwood,
called Sunday evening.

Linda Hoback, Nebraska City,
was a week end guest of her
grandmother, Mrs. Georgia Ho-

back. On Saturday they drove
to Omaha. Mrs. Georgia Ho-
back attended the meeting of
her club, Happy Hour Club, at
the Y. W. C. A. in Omaha Wed-
nesday evening.

Hogues Are Hosts
At Sunday Dinner

Mr. and Mrs. Harlan Stock
and family, Weeping Water,
were dinner guests Sunday at
the Frank Hogue home. After-
noon callers were Mr. and Mrs.
Paul Long, Mr. and Mrs. Henry
Engelkemeier and Mrs. Blanche
Meisinger, Plattsmouth.

Nehawka
Mr. and Mrs. Emmitt Hicks

were Sunday dinner guests at
the Jim Chappell home. Mr. and
Mrs. Neil Redden, and son,
Plattsmouth, were guests at the
Emmitt Hicks and Rose Redden
homes Thursday.

The Girl Scouts are working
on their child care badges.
Thursday they will entertain
pre-scho- ol children at the Green
Nest.

Mr. and Mrs. Dean Hall. Oma
ha, were dinner guests Sunday

Monday - May 19th

Afternoon - 2 p.m.
Evening - 7:30 p.m.

o'clock Mother s Day luncheon
Sunday at the Kappa Sigma

J house in Lincoln.
Nehawxa

i Teach Cubs And
Scouts To Fly Kites

j Gene Banks, Ralph Betts and
Dick Stone assisted the Cub and
Boy Scouts with kite flying Sun-
day afternoon. They met at the
Harold Dodson home north of
town and the purpose was to
teach the boys to fly kites.
Twelve Cubs, four Scouts the
leader, Dick Stone, and most of
the parents were present.

Kchawka
Mr. and Mrs. John Bagley

left Saturday for Perham, Minn.,
where they will spend the sum-
mer.

Mr. and Mrs. Paul Poppe, Kan-
sas City, Kan., were dinner
guests Sunday of Mrs. Gertrude
Carper.

Xhawka
Boy's State
Delegate Named

Merritt Dodson. Jr., will rep-
resent the Nehawka high school
juniors at Boys State June 1 to
7 in Lincoln. He has chosen
the subject, 'The School Sys-
tem," to study. He is sponsored
by the American Legion. Jim
Sturm is local commander.

Nehawka
Denny Dale. Omaha, Darlene

Eaton and Mrs. Charlotte Scho-mak- er

were week end guests at
the John Chappell home in
Plattsmouth.

Mr. and Mrs. John Dale and
Janice, Omaha, were week end
guests at the John Eaton home.
Mr. and Mrs. Earl Waldo and
family, Lincoln, were Sunday
afternoon callers.

Dorothy and Delores Ed-
monds, Nebraska City; Dean Ed-
monds and Mr. . Edwards, San
Diego, were Sunday afternoon
callers at the Gilbert Edmonds
home.

Mrs. C. D. St. John is not so
well.

Saturday was Roger Balfour's
tenth birthday. His guests were
Bryce Hansen, Lonny Jones.
Gary and Gene Mayfield, Carl
and Gary Hobbie, Mrs. Vance
Balfour and daughters.

Sunday dinner guests at the
Kent Balfour home were Mr.
and Mrs. Ralph Hobbie and sons,
Nebraska City, Mrs. Helen Pe-
terson and Marius, Mr. and Mrs.
Vance Balfour and daughters
and their guest, Bob Pelky, Mr.
and Mrs. Carl Balfour.

The I. H. C. bowling team fin-
ished their league games Thurs-
day and placed fifth. Several
Nehawka men were members of
the team.

Mr. and Mrs. Henry Young,
Nebraska City; Mr. and Mrs.
Ivan Balfour, Union, called at
the Carl Balfour home Sunday.

- Mr. and Mrs. Howard Han-
sen, Brainard; Mr. and Mrs.
Donald Hansen. Lyons, were
week end guests at the John
Hansen home. Mr. and Mrs.
Ivan Hansen and son joined
them for supper Saturday eve-
ning.

Nehawka

Visit Flood
Victims At Hamburg

Mrs. George Kime and grand-
daughter, Theresa Kime, accom-
panied Mr. and Mrs. Alvin Mc-
Reynolds to Hamburg, Iowa, by
the Omaha route Friday after-
noon where they visited Mrs.
Henry Welch. Mr. and Mrs.
Welch, whose home was flooded
with six feet of water, expect to
move into their home this week.

Nehawka
Mr. and Mrs. Gerald Kime,

Omaha, spent Sunday at the
George Kime home.

Bob Pelky, fraternity brother
of Vance Balfour, was a week
end guest at their home. He
lives at Boise, Idaho. Mrs. A. W.
Bedson, Miss Anna Nelson, Mr.
and Mrs. Harry Willis, Lincoln,
called in the afternoon.

Mr. and Mrs. Malcolm Pol-
lard, Mr. and Mrs. Glen Thack-
er and Mr. and Mrs. Vance Bal-
four were dinner guests Sunday
evening of Mr. and Mrs. Arlo
Wirth at Dunbar.

Mr. and Mrs. Harvey Bailer
and sons called at the Paul
Berner home at Otoe Thursday
evening.

Fred C. Schomaker was a week
end guest at the Henry Thiele
home at Plattsmouth.

Mr. and Mrs. Jack Hines were
dinner guests Monday at the
Fred Beatty home. Mr. and Mrs.
Wm. Cornell were their supper
guests Sunday.

Mrs. Melvin Sturm, Mrs. Jack
Reece and daughter called at
the O. T. Reece home in Ash-
land Thursday. Mrs. Jack Reece,
Mrs. Jim Sturm and Mrs. Melvin
Sturm shopped in Lincoln Fri-
day. Mrs. Jim Sturm was guest
for lunch of her parents, Mr.
and Mrs. Harry Metcalf, and
Mrs. Melvin Sturm and Mrs.
Jack Reece had lunch with Mrs.
Mary Albert and Ethel.

Mr. and Mrs. Farley Pittman,
Modesta, Calif., called on their
aunt, Mrs. Hattie Sutphin Mon-
day morning. They are visiting
relatives and friends in Union
and Nehawka.

Mrs. Wildon Switzer and Mrs.
Z. Margiel shopped in Omaha
Saturday.

Mr. and Mrs. J. J. Pollard en
tertained a group at dinner and
canasta Sunday evening.

Edwin T. McHugh
ATTORNEY

Office in Corn Growers

State Bank
Mordock Nebraska

Cairo, Egypt. Mr. Sloan and !

General Riley were in Cairo on
business and their wives accom-
panied them to go sightseeing.
They took a boat ride down the
Nile and took pictures of the
place where Moses was found in
the bullrushes. They also rode
the camels to the pyramids and
the sphinx. They drove past
King Farouk's palace with 150
acres of grounds. The Sloan
family have moved from Beirut
to Jerusalem, where they ex-
pect to stay for the next year.
From there thpv went tn Custer.

! S. D., on business and will re
turn here later for Mrs. Schwartz
who will return to North Platte
with them.

Nehawka
Mr. and Mrs. Dewey Boedeck-e- r,

Avoca, and Lovell Massie
were guests for the day Sunday
of Mr. and Mrs. Roy Splitt.

Mrs. James Roddy of Union
accompanied Mr. and Mrs. Carl
Wessel to Fort Calhoun Sunday
to spend the day with Mr. and
Mrs. Curtis Dixon.

Mrs. Rudy Guenther, Carolyn
and Linda of Valley; Mrs. Fritz
Guenther and three daughters,
Diller, Nebr., were recent guests
at the Fred Wessel home. Mrs.
Rudy Gunther returned two
weeks ago from Newfoundland,
where Mr. Guenther is working
on a government project. Mr.
Guenther remained in New-
foundland.

Mr. and Mrs. A. W. Gordon,

WINS WITH HAMSTERS
Winner of the $2800 Westing-hou- se

Grand Science scholarship,
Karl Muench of

Evanston, 111., is shown as he in-

oculates a Golden Hamster with
penicillin. Before and after
school Karl spent 25 hours a week
on his project trying to find
out whether eating meat from
chemically caponized roosters
might be injurious. Karl, who
plans to use his scholarship to
study medicine at Harvard, had
to learn hamster anatomy, and
pointed out errors in published

srticles on the subject

jNehawkans Take
! Part In Radio
Transcription

At the county wide meeting
held at Weeping Water for ex-
tension clubs Friday afternoon
several Nehawka people and

' their children took part in a
radio transcript made by KFAB.
The mothers described the
clothing which they made and
which were modeled by their
children in the style show. This
will be broadcast over KFAB
Saturday, May 11 at two o'clock
on Farm Facts and Fun. Those
who were interviewed were Mrs.
Arthur Johnson and Connie Lou,
Mrs. Hall Hansen and Stevie.
Mrs. John Schanbacher and
Mike. Miss Pearl Schultz, coun-
ty home agent, reviewed the
sewing clinic held earlier in the
year. The following children of
the Mixit extension club mem-
bers modeled clothes in the style
show: Billy and Tommy
Schlichtemeier, Connie Lou
Johnson, Stevie Hansen, Sandra
Spangler, Cathy Rice, Linda and
Norma Martin, Julia Johnson,
Eddie and Gary Fitch, Linda
Jose, Irene Chriswisser.

Nehawka

her daughter, Mrs. Jack Lefler
and family at Waverly.

Easv Credit1.

Plattsmouth

Bring in Your Tack

Expecting about 200 Head including

Shetland Ponies - Saddle Horses, all
kinds. Also Draft Horses.

Plattsmouth Sale Barn
Auctioneers

Rex Young Ellis Lacy Dan Perkins

This beautiful Smith --Corona is
the most popular portable we've
ever sold and youll see why the
minute you try it! Has 38 features.
full-siz- e professional
keyboard and the fast-
est

ONLY

action of any port-
able.
mnowt

Come in and see 89"

Ideal
Graduation Gift
Schreiner Drugs

HORSE

Holland BALE- R-

n n
u
o

high capacity "77" twine baler
with any other on the market.
No other baler has a record of
baling leadership to compare
with New Holland's more
than 10 years' experience as
America's pioneer and leading
manufacturer of automatic
pick-u- p balers!

Phone 4178

IF YOU WAtl MlDJltMir miD A new

Big Holiday Savings

bn n

take a good look at your pres-
ent baler equipment.

Can it be operated by one
man or does it require two,
three or four to get in the hay?
Have you a baler that'll handle
up to 10 tons an hour or only
half as much?

Compare New Holland's

ft 'ToctREADS U See how you save on what-
ever tires you need with
our biggest special in years!
Limited time only! Come

in TODAY!
NEW HOLLAND'S GREAT NEW "77" BALER IS BREAKING ALL SALES RECORDS. IT'S

THE ONLY ONE-MA-N BALER WITH A CAPACITY OF UP TO 10 TONS AN HOUR!

V4 plenY 7heBi t0lB

Don't Wait-- See us Nowl

In view of today's uncertain
conditions can you afford . to
wait until next year to decide
how you'll handle your haying?

Farmers faced with the high
cost and scarcity of labor are
mechanizing faster than at any
other time in history. And that's
why it'll pay you right now to

Your
141 5. 3rd

PLATTSMOUTH MOTORS
Your Friendly Ford Dealer G. E. and John Deere Dealer

PlattsmouthWashington Avenue


