
(First publication March 31, 1938.) 
NOTICE OF FINAL 

SETTLEMENT 
Estate No. 2634 

In the County Court of Holt 
county, Nebrarka. March 29, 1938. 

In the matter of the Estate of 
Daniel D. Murphy, Deceased. 

All persons interested in said 
estate are hereby notified that the 
Executors of said estate have filed 
in said court their final report and 
a petition for final settlement and 
distribution of the residue of said 
estate; and that said report and 
petition will be heard April 20, 
1938, at 10 o'clock A. M., at the 
County Court Room in O’Neill, Ne- 
braska, when all persons interested 
may appear and be heard concern- 

ing said final report and the dis- 
tribution of said estate. 

C. J. MALONE, 
County Judge. 

(County Court Seal) 46-3 
Julius D. Cronin, Attorney 

(First publication March 24, 1938.) 
LEGAL NOTICE 

John McKenna; The heirs, 
devisees, legatees, personal repre- 

MISCELLANEOUS 
IF you want glasses that fit your 
eyes and your appearance as well 
as your purse, see Perrigo Optical 

[Company 
at Gold- 

en Hotel, O'Neill, 
Sat., April 9. 

46-1 
___ 

WANT to get cattle to pasture for 
the summer.—C. A. Varner, Bas- 
set, Nebr. 44-4 

SALESMEN WANTED 

MAN WANTED for nearby Raw- 
leigh Route of 800 families. Write 
today. Rawleigh’s, Dept. NBI>- 
252-SA, Freeport, III. 47-1 

FOR RENT 

RANCH for lease or sale—C. A. 
Varner, Bassett, Nebr. 44-4 

FOR SALE 

TRAILER — 2-wheel, with good 
tires.—Vic Halva Shop. 47-1 p 

ONE F-20 Farmall, used 2 seasons, 
$600.—Otto F. Lorenz, O’Neill. 

47tf 

TEN yearling Hereford Bulls; your 
choice for $100.—R. E. Lucas, 
Middlebranch, 15 miles east and 9 
north of O’Neill. 47tf 

AFFIDAVIT forms for statement 
of age, for use by liquor stores and 
beer parlors. For sale at The 
Frontier office in pads of 100. 

HAY—No. 1 upland prairie and 
mixed; by car, truck or in stack. 
Situated near Martha, Nebr., on 

highway 281. Write Rupert West- 
phalen, Ewing, Nebr. 46-4p 

HOUSE, 3-rooms.—Robert Dono- 
hoe, O’Neill. 46-2p 

GOOD bottom hay in stack, or will 
bale.—Inquire at this office. 46-2 

FOR SALE OR TRADE—Have a 

choice 279 acre well improved 
Saunders county farm. Will con- 
sider a well balanced ranch in ex- 

change.—Address Elkhorn Valley 
Real Estate Co., Fremont, Nebr. 

46-4 

FOR SALE OR TRADE—for a 
small place in town, my 200-acre 
farm 5 miles north and 1 west of 
Phoenix.—Minnie Turner. 45tf 

GOOD barn, 20x30 with grain-tight 
loft.—Mattie Soukup. 44tf 

FOR SALE—Good ear corn; also 
hay—R. H. Parker, O’Neill. 43tf 

BABY CHICKS form purebred, 
free range flocks, custom hatching. 
Order early.—Atkinson Hatchery, 
Atkinson, Nebr. 4ltf 

i 
FOR SALE—Oil burner for fur- 
nace in a residence. Will sell real 
cheap. — R. H. Parker, O’Neill, 
Nebr. 19tf 

FOR SALE—0-room house, has 
bath room, and lights and water, 
nearly modern, close in. $1250 
will buy it.—See R. H. Parker. 6tf 

HOME LOANS 
FARM LOANS 

RANCH LOANS 
I Am Now Making Loans 

JOHN L. QITIG 

Dr. J. L. SHERBAHN 
Chiropractor 

Phone 147 
Half Block South of the Ford 
Garage—West Side of Street | 

ttmmtmmmmmmmtmmmtmm 

U 

W. F. FINLEY, M. D. jj 
Phone, Office 28 | 

O'Neill :: Nebraska j; 
ajKttKJtttUJJKRJtttttt::::::::::::::::::: 

ji DR. J. P. BROWN j 
Office Phone 77 

: Complete X-Ray Equipment p 
Glasses Correctly Fitted *• 

Residence Phone 223 

sentatives and all other persons in- 
terested in the estate of John 
McKenna, deceased, real names un- 

known; George Vifquain and all 
persons having or claiming any 
interest in Northwest Quarter Sec- 
tion 8, Township 28 North, Range 
12 West 6th Principal Meridian in 
Holt county, Nebraska, real names 

unknown, defendants are notified 
that on March 22, A. D. 1938, Guy 
F. Cole, plaintiff filed a petition 
and commenced an action in the 
District Court of Holt county, Ne- 
braska against you. That the object 
of said action is to have plaintiff 
decreed to be the owner of the 
real estate above described; to have 
the title to said premises quieted in 
plaintiff; to have you decreed to 
have no title to, lien upon or in- 
terest in said premises; to have you 
enjoined from asserting any lien 
upon, claim to or title to said 
premises and to remove the clouds 
cast on plaintiff’s title by reason 

of your claims. 
You are required to answer said 

petition on or before the 2nd day 
of May. A. D. 1938. 

GUY F. COLE, 
45-4 Plaintiff. 

(First publication March 31, 1938.) 
LEGAL NOTICE 

Rose Sibbernsen, Catherine Sib- 
bernsen, John Sibbernsen, Clarence 
Edward Sibbernsen; The heirs,devi- 
sees, legatees, personal representa- 
tives and all other persons having 
or claiming any interest in the 
estates of I. Sibbernsen, also know'n 
as Ingvard Sibbernsen, deceased, 
real names unknown, and of Clar- 
ence G. Sibbernsen, deceased, real 
names unkown and all persons hav- 
ing or claiming any interest in 
East Half, the South Half of 
Northwest Quarter and North Half 
of Southwest Quarter Section 8 
and East Half Section 17, Town- 
ship 28 North, Range 13 West Oth 
Principal Meridian in Holt county, 
Nebraska, real names unknown, 
defendants, who are impleaded 
with Drexeline Sibbernsen, Drexel 
J. Sibbernsen, Albert H. Sibbernsen, 
also defendants, are notified that 
on March 28, A. D. 1938, Alfred 
W. Martens and Lois Ann Martens, 
as plaintiffs, filed a petition and 
commenced an action in the District 
Court of Holt county, Nebraska, 
against the defendants above 
named. That the object of said 
action is to have plaintiffs decreed 
to be the owners of the real estate 
above described; to have the title 
to said premises quieted in plain- 
tiffs; to have defendants decreed to 
have no title to, lien upon or inter- 
est in said premises; to have de- 
fendants enjoined from asserting 
any lien upon or interest in said 
premises; to have any liens claimed 
by defendants decreed to be barred 
by the statutes of limitation of the 
State of Nebraska and to have been 
paid in full and to have merged 
with the legal title to said premises 
and to be unenforcible. 

You ure required to answer said 
petition on or before the 9th day 
of May, A. D. 1938. 

W. J. HAMMOND, 
46-4 Attorney for plaintiff. 

NOTICE 
To the Voters of O’Neill: 

The write-in campaign of my 
name for school board in Tuesday’s 
election, was started without my 
knowledge or contest. 

Mrs. H. L. Lindberg. 

PRESBYTERIAN CHURCH 
Sunday school at 10:00—C. E. 

Yantzi, superintendent. 
Morning Worship at 11:00—“The 

Highway of Praise." 
Young People’s meeting at 6:45 

—Veva Aim, leader. 
Evening service at 8:00—This 

will be a union service at the M. E. 
church. There will be services at 
the Methodist church Tuesday and 
Wednesday night. Friday night 
the service will be at the Presby- 
terian church. Thursday the sac- 

rament of the Lord’s supper will be 
commemorated in both churches. 
Special music is being planned for 
all services. 

H. I). Johnson, Pastor. 

METHODIST CHURCH NOTES 
A. J. May, Pastor 

Palm Sunday April 10. Sunday 
school at 10 a. m. 

At 11 a. m. the Choir will pre- 
sent an Easter Cantata, “The Res- 
urrection Story." All welcome. 

In the evening at 8 p. m. there 
will be a big Union service w'ith 
both Young People’s choirs sing- 
ing in a chorus and each present- 
ing an anthem. Rev. H. D. John- 
son of the Presbyterian church will 
preach the sermon. 

Epworth League at 7 p. m.—Mr. 
Rose, leader. 

Monday evenin„ at 7:30 a big 
Chorus of Children. Everybody 
welcome. 

Union services Tuesday and 
Wednesday at 8 p. m. with Rev. 
Johnson bringing the message. The 
Young People’s choir on Tuesday 
evening and the Children’s Chorus 
on Wednesday evening. 

Communion service Thursday 
evening at 8 p. m. 

Closing union service at the 
Presbyterian church Friday even- 

ing at 8 p. m. 

May we have complete coopera- 
tion in these services from all the 
members and friends. 

BRIEFLY STATED 

Mr. and Mrs. John McCarthy of 
Hastings spent Sunday as the 
guests of Mr. McCarthy’s parents, 
Mr. and Mrs. M. II. McCarthy. 

J. J. Harrington made a business 

trip to Valentine last Friday. 

Homer Mullen drove up from 
Omaha Saturday night and spent 
Sunday visiting with friends and 

relatives here. 

Mrs. William Brugeman went to 

Valentine last Thursday morning 
and spent the day visiting her 

father, returning home that even- 

ing. 

The M. M. Club held their week- 

ly meeting at the home of Mrs. 
C. W. Porter Wednesday night with 
a seven-thirty dinner followed by 
cards. 

Charles M. Bussard left last Sun- 

day morning for York for a few 

days visit at the home of his par- 
ents. He returned home Tuesday 
afternoon. 

Mrs. J. P. Brown, Mrs. L. A. Bur- 

gess, Mrs. F. E. Parkins, Mrs. R. 
M. Sauers and Mrs. C. E. Lund- 
gren drove to Sioux City last Fri- 

day and spent the day 

Work of excavating for the ad- 
dition to the Gamble store build- 
ing was started Monday morning 
and the addition will be rapidly 
pushed to completion. 

Mr. and Mrs. Max Golden re- 

turned from Omaha Thursday 
night. While there, Mrs. Golden 
submitted to a minor operation, 
and is now recovering nicely. 

Miss Hattie Ooetter, District 
Supervisor of the Northwestern 
Bell Telephone company, of Nor- 
folk, has spent the past week in 
O’Neill at the local exchange. 

Miss Catherine Stanton and Miss 
Hazel Bredehoff left for Lincoln 

Monday morning where they will 
take the state examinations from 
the State Board of Cosmetology. 

Ralph Oppen, who had been visit- 
ing the home folks over the week- 
end, left Tuesday morning for 
Omaha, where he is a student in 
the Nebraska University medical 
school. 

Mrs. O. F. Biglin and daughter, 
Genevieve, drove to Battle Creek, 
Nebr., Sunday, where they at- 
tended the BOth wedding anniver- 

sary celebration of Mr. and Mrs. 
John Hughes. 

Mrs. F. H. Butt came up from 
Nebraska City last Sunday for a 

visit of several weeks at the home 
of her sister, Mrs. D. H. Cronin. 

Jack Arbuthnot and Evelyn 
Stannard drove to Grand Island 
Monday and brought Mrs. Dave 
Stannard, who had been visiting 
relatives in California for the past 
three months, home with them. 

A marriage license was issued 
on April 6, in Hall county, to Doris 
Rieken, age 21, and Harvey Lee, 
age 24, both of O’Neill, by County 
Judge Paul N. Kirk at Grand Is- 
land.—Grand Island Independent. 

Mr. and Mrs. Harold Shoemaker 
and daughter returned to their 
home at Norfolk Wednesday morn- 

ing after spending a few days visit- 
ing at the home of Mr. Shoemaker’s 
parents, Mr. and Mrs. Bert Shoe- 
maker. 

Miss Anne Connolly, one of the 
efficient operators at the local tele- 
phone exchange, left Tuesday for 
Omaha where she will attend a 

convention of the Nebraska Tele- 
phone operators held in that city 
this week. 

Mrs. Eliza Wilcox sustained a 

fracture of her left arm between 
the wrist and elbow last Saturday 
when she slipped and fell on a 

rug in her home. One of the bones 
was broken by the fall and the 
other splintered. 

Miss Marjorie Lerner of Wayne, 
arrived April 1, to take over the 
duties of stenographer in the local 
FSA office. Miss Lerner will take 
Miss Jessie Parkhurst’s place, as 

Miss Parkhurst has resigned, ef- 
fective April 15. 

Mrs. Esther Cole Harris, regi- 
ster of deeds, filed Monday as a 

republican candidate for reelection 
to her present position. Mrs. Har- 
ris has been a capable and efficient 
official and has a strong following 
all over the county. 

While unloading some barbed 
wire in the rear of Coyne’s hard- 
ware store Saturday, a tank of 
Skellgas, which was being moved, 
slipped and fell on Joe Martin’s 
right foot, mashing the big toe on 

that foot quite badly. 

Work is progressing rapidly on 

the work of remodeling the old 
post office room north of the Golden 
into bed rooms for the hotel. Nine 
additional bed rooms will be sup- 
plied by this addition, which gives 
the hotel seventy rooms. 

Dr. F. A. Kopp, a federal veterin- 
arian, who had been located in Holt 
county for several years, was taken 
from the local hospital to Norfolk 
on Friday' and died there of heart 
disease on Saturday. Burial was 

to be at Milligan, Nebraska. 

Miss Roberta Arbuthnot. who 
left O’Neill April 1, to accept a 

position in Omaha, was operated 
on in St. Joseph’s hospital Monday 
for an abcess on her back. At pre- 

YOUR HOME-YOUR JOB 
Your Family-Your Friends 

Are In O’Neill 
SPEAK A GOOD WORD FOR O’NEILL! 

TRI STATE PRODUCE CO. 
O’NEILL, NEBRASKA 

Poultry, Eggs, Sugar, Feed and 
Baby Chicks 

Pre-EASTER sale 
Of Ladies’ Coats—Suits—Hats 

Three Days of Dollar Bargains 
Friday—Sa turday — Monday 

Ladies Hats 
All Hats formerly $1.49— 

now— 

$1.00 
Silk Hose 

Pure Silk Full Fash- 
ioned Chiffon Ne Shades! 

3 Pair $1,00 
Shirtings 

Fancy or Plain Colors 
Cheviot. 

10 Yards $1.00 

Drapery 
Fancy Crash, 50-in. wide 

—Regular 59c— 

2 Yards $1,00 
Dress Shirts 

For Men Just In 
New Patterns! 

98c 

Buy Mow! 
SAVE SAVE 

Ladies Suits 
Manish types and 

Tailored! 

20% Off 

Towels 
Extra heavy Pastel 

shades 22x44. 

4 $1.00 
Linings 

Fancy patterns in 49c 
quality. Gray, Tan, Brown, 
Navy and Black. 

SI Yards $1.00 
Work Shoes 

WOLVERINE 
Those good horse- 

hide shoes that 

all men know to be 

the best. 
Carried in all widths, A 

to EE. 
# 

$3.98 

Ladies Coats 
Including those good Hirsh- 

mauer tweed coats! 

20% Off 

Towels 
Fancy plaids and stripes 

guest size. 

12 For $1.00 
Print 

80 Square Fast Color 
New Spring Patterns! 

7 Yards $1,00 
Curtains 

House cleaning time means 
new curtains They’re 
here! 

49c to $1.98 
Girls y4 Hose.19c 

Fancy Anklets.10c 
White Slippers $1.98 
Wash Frocks 98c 

Buy No w! I 
SAVE SAVE 

BROW n • m CD O n ALD Co. 

sent she is reported to be getting 
along very well, and her condition 
is not serious. 

Mrs. Peter Todsen drove to Ful- 
lerton, Nebr., last Saturday where 

she attended the music contest, 
then going to Grand Island and 

returning to her home Sunday. Her 

mother, Mrs. W. I. Blaine, returned / 
with her and will remain here for 
a week or more. 

SPECIALS for Saturday 
SUGAR CC0 

BUTTER 00« 
Quartered—per lb._UZb 
COCOA 10n 
“Her.shey’s”—1-lb. can_| OC 

CRACKERS 1Cn 2-Ib. Box ..I DC 
TOMATOES 
No. 2 cans, 2 for_ I Uu 

BUTTER-NUT OQn 
COFFEE 1 lb /9C 

Every Day Prices 
LARD nEn In Cartons—2-lbs. ^jC 
MILK 0n Per Quart__ OC 

FOLGER’S QPn 
COFFEE Mb ZOC 
SOUPS inr “Campbell’s”—per can lUC 

KKJNTUCKY CLUB 
VELVET & PRINCE ALBERT, per can lUC 
PAXTON GAS ROASTED COFFEE OK* Glass Jar, Per Pound—only.Zjb 
CIGARETTES Cl 17 
By the Carton—only.I ■ 11 

Easter Novelties and Candy 
■ STANNARD’S * 

Friday and Saturday, April 8 and 9 

Morning Light Peaches 
Use these large, luscious peaches packed in a good syrup, for 

variety during Lent. The large No. 2,/i can for 16c 'or this 
sale. The big, full ripe halves for sauce and Sunshine Salad. 
The sliced for Peach Tapioca and Downside Up Cake. 

Ginger Snaps 
1 ears have not dimmed the popularity of old fashioned ginger 

snaps. Enjoy the spicy flavor of fresh baked ginger snaps at our 

special price of JQc per pound. 

Small Tender Peas 
When you desire especially nice peas we suggest Superb Sifted 

Peas. Small, sweet and tender. Uniform in size and the true 
garden fresh flavor. Try the 6 to 8 portion can at a special 
price of J3C- 

Honey Krushed 
Have you enjoyed the rich nutty flavor of the new “Hearth 

Baked” Honey Krushed Wheat Bread, This delicious health 
bread sold only at Council Oak. 

Navy Beans 
Nothing thrills hungry, hard working men more than a big 

jar of baked beans containing a bit of pork and sweetened with 
pure country sorghum. Large, bright, Northern Navy Beans 
for this sale at 4 lbs. for JJc. 

COUNCIL OAK 

Pure Country Sorghum 
Never so hot nor ever so cold that the family does not take 

keen delight in Ginger Bread, Ginger Cookies or Boston Brown 
Bread. The recipes for these 3 delicacies call for pure country 
sorghum priced for this sale at 38c for the 5 lb. can and (J9C f°r 
the big No. 10 can. 

Lipton’s Yellow Label 
The tea with the world wide distribution. Those who fancy a 

high quality black tea can buy a supply at this sale at a special 
price. The \\ lb. pkg. for 2(K an^ the \/t lb. pkg. for 38c- 

Shelf Paper 
You will change the paper on the pantry shelves when you 

clean house. This week-end Council Oak sells 2 dime folds of 
assorted self paper for J3C* 

COUNCIL OAK 

“Red Bag” Coffee 
Many buyers who can afford the most expensive brands con- 

fine their purchases to our popular priced Red Bag Coffee because 
its rich, smooth flavor just suits their taste. We grind this whole 

berry coffee as you direct. Try it at our special price of jyc per 
lb. or 3 lbs. for 49c- 

HaskinVw Castile cake 4c 
“Blue Barrel” 

The soap that does the work of three ordinary cakes. It’s kind 
to your hands. The price is 2 big pound bars for J3C* 

Sweet, Juicy 

Navel Oranges, Per Dozen. 18c 

I 
Extra Large Seedless 

Texas Grapefruit, Each 4c 


