
Roh, Welch Wed 
Saturday In 
Catholic Ceremony 

St. Ludger Catholic church, 
Creighton, was the scene for the 
September 15 wedding of Janice 
Carolyn Roh and Jack H. Welch. 
The 10:30 a.in ceremony was so- 
lemnized by the Rev. Raymond 
Roh, cousin of the bride. 

Parents of the couple are Dr. 
and Mrs. Roman C. Roh, Creigh- 
ton and Mr. and Mrs. William 
Dufek, Verdigre. 

The bride, escorted to the al- 
tar by her father, chose an origi- 
nal gown designed by Priscilla 
of Boston, of silk mist taffeta 
and peau d’ange lace. The fitted 
bodice with natural waistline, had 
a capelet of lace which included 
the short sleeves of unusual de- 
sign. The front of the capelet was 
lightly frosted with pearls and 
opalescent sequins. A sheath effect 
was designed into the skirt front. 
A wide band of lace at the bottom 
of the slipper tip skirt was em- 
broidered to the skirt with seed 
pearls. From either side of the 
sheath the taffeta of the skirt 
flared out to a graceful carriage 
train. An exquisite headpiece of 
pearl tips held the bride’s two 
tier bouffant veil of imported 
illusion. She carried a bouquet of 
french mums centered with a sin- 
gle white orchid. 

Shirley Roh. sister of the bride, 
was maid of honor. Carol Muet- 
ing, Omaha and Mary Jo Malm, 
Omaha, were bridesmaids. They 
wore identical dresses of silk fac- 
ed organza in ice blue. The bo- 
dice of the sheath featured a 
shallow scoop neckline and three 
quarter sleeves. The pencil slim 
skirts extended from a natural 
waistline front. An overskirt of 
urtpressed pleats graced the 
gowns. Their headpieces were 

pill-box hats, fashioned of the 
same material as the dresses, 
with short bouffant illusion veils. 
They carried white and copper 
wicker parasols with a cascade 
arrangement of bronze spider 
mums and french mums. 

Bill Vejvoda. Grand Island was 
best man. Groomsmen were Vir- 
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gil Vonasek, Verdigre and Joe 
Wingert, Arlington, la. Ushers 
were Jim Manion, Creighton and 
Arlie Nelson, Verdigre. 

Teri Manion was flower girl 
and Gary Zerbe was ring bearer. 

Following the ceremony a din- 
ner-reception was held at the 
Creighton Municipal Hall for 300 
guests. Mr. and Mrs. Kevin Ko- 
cina were hosts for the recep- 
tion. 

After a wedding trip to Colo- 
rado and Wyoming the couple 
will reside on the bridegroom’s 
ranch west of Verdigre. 

Barbara Richtig, 
Delano Scholl Wed 
In Catholic Rite 

St. Mary’s Catholic church, 
Leigh, was the scene of the wed- 
ding of Barbara Jean Richtig and 
Delano Scholl, Saturday, Septem- 
ber 15. 

The Rev. Eugene Kerwin of- 
ficiated at the 10 a.m. double 
ring ceremony. Parents of the 
couple are Mr. and Mrs. Lumier 
Richtig, Leigh and Mrs. Edith 
Scholl, Ewing. 

The bride, escorted to the al- 
tar by her father, wore a gown of 
bridal satin and lace. The fitted 
sequin covered bodice featured a 

scalloped neckline and long 
sleeves pointed at the wrists. The 
bouffant skirt was floor length. 
Her elbow length veil of French 
illusion was held in place by a 

jeweled crown. She carried a bou- 
quet of white mums. 

Marjorie Richtig, sister of the 
bride, was maid of honor. Patty 
Relohrod, Clarkson, cousin of the 
bride was bridesmaid. Miss Rich- 
tig wore a street length gown of 
melon colored satin with net ov- 

erskirt, Miss Belohrod wore a 

gown of cotillion blue, styled 
identical to that of the maid of 
honor. Each had matching head- 
pieces and carried bouquets of 
mums. 

A dinner was served to one hun- 
dred friends and relatives after 
the ceremony, with the parents of 
the bride as hosts, followed by a 

reception. 
Mr. Scholl, who has completed 

his service in the U. S. Army, 
has a farm near Leigh where the 
couple will make their home. 

Pledges Fraternity 
Rolland Johnson, son of Mr. 

and Mrs. Lowell Johnson has 

pledged Alpha Tau Omega fra- 

ternity at the University of Mis- 
souri in Columbia. 

Bride-of-the-Week 

Lorene Wetzler 

will wed 

Kenneth Jensen 

October 5 

The bride has selected her China and Crystal 
patterns at McIntosh Jewelry. 

Make McIntosh Jewelry your First Stop for 

China, Crystal, Silver and Wedding Gift needs 
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Faye Allen Marries 
Gary Eppenbach In 
Wolbach Rite Saturday 

Saturday afternoon at 2 p.m. 
in the Trinity Lutheran church 
in Wolbach, Miss Paula Faye 
Allen became the bride of Gerry 
Dean Eppenbach, St. Libory. The 
bride is the daughter of Mrs. 
Selma Alien, Wolbach and the 
late Ervin E Allen. The bride- 
groom is the son of Mrs. Elsa 
Eppenbach, O’Neill and the late 
Fred Eppenbach. 

The Kev. H. Vorrath perform- 
ed the double ring ceremony be- 
fore an altar appointed with bas- 
kets of peach gladiolas and li- 
lac carnations, accented with li- 
lac bows. The aisle was carpet- 
ed in white with white satin bows 
marking the pews. 

Clarice Thayer sang “All For 
You," The Wedding Prayer" and 
"1 Love Thee", accompanied at 
the organ by her mother, Mrs. 
Clarence Thayer. 

The bride, escorted down the 
aisle by her brother, Howard Al- 
len, wore a floor-length gown of 
Chantilly lace and tulle. The bas- 
que bodice featured a sweetheart 
neckline edged with hand-dipped 
scalloped lace and trimmed with 
iridescent sequins and tiny seed 
pearls. The voluminous skirt over 
an underskirt of tiers oi net ruf- 
fles, was of lace with diamond 
shape net inserts trimmed with 
lace rosette appliques. Her veil 
of sheer illusion floated to waist 
length from a queen’s crown of 
pearls. She carried a lavender 
Cattieya orchid on a white Bible 
from which showered streamers 
and garlands of seed pearls. 

Mrs. Warren Townsend was her 
sister’s matron of honor. She was 
attired in an apricot street-length 
dress of silk organza over match- 
ing taffeta. The fitted bodice fea- 
tured a round neckline and elbow- 
length sleeves. The full bell-type 
skirt had bows with streamers in 
the back. White net designed the 
headpiece which held a circular 
veil. She carried a colonial bou- 
quet of lilac carnations. 

Margaret Conway, O’Neill, 
niece of the bridegroom and Jo 
Ann Gillham were the brides- 
maids. They were dressed identi- 
cal to the-matron of honor in 
shades of lavender. They carried 
colonial bouquets of peach car- 

nations. 
Larry Gifford, Brainerd, Minn., 

was the best man. Groomsmen 
were: Philip Breiner, O’Neill and 
Gene Glause, St. Libory. Ushers 
were Warren Townsend and Hen- 
ry Eiler. 

Ronna Lee Nagorski and Linda 
Allen were the candlelighters. 
They wore lavender dresses witii 
white gloves and matching hats. 
Their corsages were of peach 
carnations. Cynthia Nagorski and 
Patricia Allen were the flower 
girls. They wore white dresses 
with matching gloves and hats 
and carried miniature bouquets of 
lilac carnations. Bobby Allen car- 
ried the rings on a heart-shaped 
pillow. 

A reception followred in the 
church parlors. The five tier cake 
was topped with a bride and 
groom ornament. Mrs. Darold 
Townsend was in charge of the 
guest book. Presiding at the gift 
table were Mrs. Gene Glause, 
Marlene Lange, Betsy Steenson, 
Connie Holm and Donna Hother. 

The bride graduated from the 
Wolbach high school ad is em- 

ployed at the Phonograph in St. 
Paul. The bridegroom graduated 
from the O’Neill public high 
school and is employed on the 
Melvin Glause farm at St. Libory. 

After a wedding trip to South 
Dakota, they will be at home at 
St. Paul. 

Mr. and Mrs. Paul Krugman 
announce the engagement of 
their daughter. Elaine Pauline, 
to Richard Houberg, son of Mr. 
and Mrs. Harry Houberg, Tal- 

mage. 
Miss Krugman is a summer 

graduate of Immanuel Hospital 
School of Nursing. She is pres- 
ently employed at Immanuel in 

Omaha. 
Richard is engaged in farming 

near Talmage. 
A November 18 wedding is 

planned. 

Joyce Ann Krogh 
Weds Lyle Wyatt 
By Candlelight 

Baskets of white gladioli de- 
corated the altar of the Assembly 
of God church for the candlelight 
wedding of Miss Joyce Ann 
Krogh and Lyle Edwin Wyatt. 

The Rev. Ivan Christofferson 
officiated at the 8 p.m. cere- 

mony. 
The bride, the daughter of Mr. 

and Mrs. Carl Krogh, was given 
in marriage by her father. Mrs. 
William Wyatt, Minneapolis, 
Minn., is the bridegroom’s mo- 
ther. 

For her wedding the bride wore 
her sister’s wedding gown of 
white silk bombazine and alecon 
lace fashioned with a sabrina 
neckline and cathedral train. A 
jeweled crown held her silk il- 
lusion elbow length veil. She car- 
ried a bouquet of red roses on 

a white Bible. Her only jewelry 
was a pearl pendant, a gift 
of the bridegroom. 

Mrs. LaVern Peterson, Spring- 
field, Mo., sister of the bride, 
was matron of honor. Mrs. Nyal 
Rowse, sister of the bride, was 
bride’s matron. They wore street 
length dresses of red velvet with 
black accessories and carried co- 

lonial bouquets of white and red 
pompons. 

Gayle Garwood, Chambers, was 
flower girl and Billy Jenkins, O’ 
Neill, served as ring bearer. Can- 
dle lighters were Nyal Rowse 
and Bob Jenkins. They also seat- 
ed the guests. 

Donald Wyatt, brother of the 
bridegroom, was best man. 
Groomsman was Harvey Colfax. 

Following the ceremony a re- 

ception for 150 guests was given 
in the church basement by the 
bride’s parents. Connie Brockman 
had charge of the guest book. 
Lorene Wetzter, Cheryl Rcdlinger 
and Delores Rosenkrans were in 
charge of the gift table. Marsha 
Slattery served coffee. The 
bride’s table was served by Nor- 
ma Walters and Sharlene Lar- 
son, 

The four tier wedding cake, 
topped by a miniature bride and 
groom, was baked and decorated 
by Mrs. Paul Nelson and Mrs. 
Axel Borg. Cake was served by 
Mrs. Rodney Jacobson, aunt of 
the bride. 

The bride is a 1961 graduate of 
O’Neill high school and the bride- 
groom graduated from Sunshine 
Bible Academy, Miller, S.D. He 

is employed by Wilson’s Service 
Station, O’Neill. 

Sobotka, Bohn Wed 

September 11 In 
Catholic Ceremony 

St. Patrick’s church, O’Neill, 
was the scene of the September 
11 wedding of Miss Helen So- 
botka, Inman and Maxwell F. 
Bohn, O’Neill. The bride is the 
daughter of Mr. and Mrs. James 
Sobotka. Mr. and Mrs. Dominich 
Bohn are the parents of the bride- 
groom. 

The Rev. Robert Duffy officiat- 
ed at the 10 a.m. double ring cer- 

emony and Nuptial Mass. 
Escorted to the altar by her 

father, the bride was gowned in 
a floor length gown of white silk 
organza over net and taffeta. The 
scoop neckline was outlined in 
silk lace and sequins. The back 
was accented with a large self 
bow of silk organza and ended in 
a short train. A crown of alter- 
nating petals of satin and lace, 
pearl trimmed, held her veil of 
silk illusion. She carried two 

cymbidium orchids on a white, 
lace covered, prayer book. 

Mary Lou Sobotka, sister of 
the bride, was maid of honor. 
Mrs. Richard Bohn and Barbara 
Meyers, Omaha, were brides- 
maids. They wore street length 
dresses of French red yum yum 
chiffon in sheath style with scooj} 
necklines and short sleeves. The 
skirt featured a flaring back pan- 
el with a bow and streamers. 
They wore matching beaded caps 
and white gloves and carried half 
baskets of baby white mums. 

The bride groom was attended 
by John and Richard Bohn, his 
brothers and Robert Fritton. his 
cousin. 

A bridal breakfast was held in 
St. Patrick’s parish hall follow- 
ing the ceremony. A reception 

followed, given by the bride’s 
parents in the parish hall. The 
serving table was covered with 
a white satin cloth and a large 
four tier wedding cake centering 
the table. Silver candelabra 
flanked the cake on each side. 

The bride is employed as a 

dental assistant for Dr. L. R. 

Suttcliff, O'Neill. The bridegroom 
is employed by the O’Neill Post 
Office. 

The couple will be at home in 
O'Neill after a short wedding trip 
to the Black Hills. 
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Flemings Honored 
On Anniversary 

Mr and Mr*. Henry Fleming 
Wtr* honored guest* Sunday at 
the borne of Mr. and Mrs. Frank 
Belmer, Ewing, the occasion was 
to celebrate their »ii\er wedding 
anniversary. 

A one p.m. covered dudi dinner 
was served The lour tier wed- 
ding cake, topped by an orna- 

mental silver '25 year*", center- 
ed the table It was baked and 
decorated by Mrs. Belmer and 
Mrs. Dora Townsend. Page. The 
afternoon hours were spent in- 

formally. Pictures were taken in 
color. 

Mr and Mrs. Fleming were 
married September 16, 15*37, at 
Hill City, S. D The ceremony 
was performed under the pine 
trees near the cabin of her sister, 
Mrs. Townsend The minister used 
a large rock for his pulpit Mrs. 
Townsend and Mrs. Belmer, 
daughters of Mrs. Fleming, were 
attendants. 

The bride of 25 years wore her 
wedding gown of a rose-brown 
color for the silver anniversary 
party and carried the same hand- 
kerchief. 

Mrs. Fleming presided at the 
guest book. 

Mr and Mrs. Fleming have 
been residents of the Ewing com- 
munity for many years and since 
retiring have made their home in 

Ewing. 
Mrs. Fleming takes active part 

in the activities of the Firth Meth 
odist church in Ewing. Her hob- 
bies are fancy work and collect- 
ing for her scrapbook. Mr. Flem- 
ing enjoys fishing and card 
games. 

The couple have two grand 
children, the daughter and son of 
Mr. and Mrs. Frank Belmer. 

Guests present for the anniver- 
sary celebration were: Mrs. Dora 
Townsend, Page; Mr. and Mrs. 
Leo Adams, Atkinson; Mr. and 
Mrs. Glen Adams and Mrs. Sarah 
Adams, Chambers; Mr. and Mrs. 
Ivan Burris, Pomona, Calif.; Mr. 
and Mrs. F. Weinrich, Mr. and 
Mrs. Eddie Weinrich, Mr. and 
Mrs. Clarence Heiter, Plainview; 
Mr. and Mrs. Harry Weinrich, 
Pierce; Mr. and Mrs. Walter 
Weinrich, Mr. and Mrs. Leonard 
Kruger, Mr. and Mrs. Peter 
Weinrich and Mr. and Mrs. Ben 
Pronneke, Norfolk; Mr. and Mrs. 
George Bonge and Bob, Orchard; 
Mr. and Mrs. Fred Serr, Clear- 
water and Mr. and Mrs. James 
Mlnarik, Ewing. 

Betty Ann Bohan, 
Jerome Jeffries 
Wed In Omaha 

Betty Ann Bohan became the 
bride of Jerome Martin Jefferies 
in a 10 a.m. ceremony Saturday, 
September 8, at Our Lady of Ne- 
braska chapel at St. Cecilia’s Ca- 
thedral in Omaha with the Rev. 
Ronald Boro officiating. The 
bride’s parents are Mr. and Mrs. 
Edward L. Bohan, Greenfield, 
la. Mr. and Mrs. Kermit Jeffer- 
ies, Ewing, are the bridegroom’s 
parents. 

Their attendants were Monica 
Heck, Omaha and Bill Bauer, 
Ewing. Mrs. Leonard Walling and 
Mrs. John Blumel, sisters of the 
bridal couple assisted at the re- 

ception held after the ceremony. 
After a wedding trip to the 

Black Hills, the couple will live 
at 4821, Underwood Ave., Omaha. 

Inman Woman Honored 
On 80th Birthday 

INMAN — Mrs. R. B. South, 
Inman, was honored Sunday, 
Sept. 16 on her 80th birthday. 

Amid a red table cloth was 
centered a three-tier, white birth- 
day cake decorated with red ro- 
ses and bows. The cake was bak- 
ed by Mrs. John Conard, her 
daughter, and decorated by Mrs. 
Don Gokie, Atkinson. Red and 
white candles in crystal candel- 
abra flanked two sides of the 
cake. 

Ice cream and cake were serv- 
ed to 44 friends and relatives. 
Mrs. Rex Oberle, Minneapolis, 
Minn., daughter, poured while 
Harden Anspach, son, O’Neill 
and R. B. South, husband, kept 
the guest book. Entertainment 
included songs by the Grant Pea- 
cock family. 

House Warming Party 
Surprise guests at a house 

warming party for Mr. and Mrs. 
Cliff Harding were Mr. and 
Mrs. Mick Jeffers, Mr. and Mrs. 
Bob Pospichal, Mr. and Mrs. 
Archie Bright, Mr. and Mrs. Don 

McKamy, Mr. and Mrs. Joe Ten- 
nis, Mr. and Mrs. Forrest Riley, 
Mr. and Mrs. Henry Frank, Nor- 
folk and Mr. and Mrs. Gerald 
Harding. The evening was spent 
playing cards. 

Mr. and Mrs. Harding have 
moved into the house formerly 
owned by Bob Morrison. 

A ir John F. Smith wluhi** to 

Ihiutk all hi* frleotl* from O'- 
Neill tor thetr "IM Wl*hr«" 
iuuI "< ongraltilathai*" through 
the Frontier ii|kui hi* marriage 
to Mi** Jjuiet Syrelt, Oltl (tie*- 

terton, (’ttmhrldge, I.ttgliuid, on 

May ft. They life re*l<llng al 

Itrandon. Knglaud, until his term 

of duty In the Air Foree I* over 

next July, ulirn John iuuI hi* 
wile util return to O’Neill to live. 

O'Neill Locals 

Honored on Hirthdny 
Ben Schmit was honored on his 

birthday anniversary Sunday with 
a dinner followed by a party. 
Thirty-seven guests were present 
Cards were played for entertain- 
ment. 

Henry Rohrer returned Sunday 
from a stay in St. Joseph’s hos- 
pital in Sioux City, la. 

Mr. and Mrs. Robert Riddell, 
Westminster, Colo., are visiting 
relatives and friends here. 

Mr and Mrs. W W. Waller re- 

turned Saturday from a two week 
vacation in the eastern states. 
The Wallers accompanied by her 
mother, Mrs. Ray Snell, Page, 
went to Hershey, Pa., where they 
met their son, Gary, who had 
spent the past year in Germany, 
received his discharge at Ft. 
Hamilton, N. Y. and accompan 
ied a buddy to Hershey. They 
visited Gettysburg, Washington, 
D. C., Niagara Falls, N. Y. and 
at Detroit, Mich., before return- 
ing. 

Mrs. Hans Egger was visiting 
her mother, Mrs. Goldie Liddy, 
last week. She was operating a 

resort this summer near Pons- 
ford, which they own. On her way 
to her home in Wausau, Wise., 
she stopped to see her daughter, 
Mrs. William DuWolf, Slayton, 
Minn. 

Mr. and Mrs. Thomas Bren- 
nan, Lincoln, are guests of his 
sister, Bernadette Brennan. 

Mr. and Mrs. Thomas Liddy 
and two daughters were here 
from Columbus. Tom participated 
in the Golf Tournament Sunday. 

Mr. and Mrs. John Brady, 
Grand Island, were weekend 
guests of Mr. and Mrs. Bob 
Kurtz. 

Mrs. Dick Heying and sons, 

Wagner, S D were overnight 
guests of her mother Mr* Dm 
lore* Straw anl Don* I*ibmvi4- 
ny. Atkinson 

Weekend guests in the Uoyd 
Godel home were their wona and 
families. Mr and Mrs Don U*» 
del. Winner, S. D. and Mr. and 
Mrs. Dick lit del, Grand Island. 
Ollier guests were Mr. and Mr* 
Larry Kernau and family and 
Larry Godel. I'hadnm 

Mr. and Mr* Lloyd Neabit amt 
family were weekend guests erf 
Mr and Mrs Maynard Morrow. 

Mr and Mrs John Donohue 
were ui Wayne Sunday to attend 
a Goltlen Wedding anniversary «rf 
Mr ami Mrs Ed Larson. 

Mr and Mrs Char lea Chare 
and son, Jim and Mra. If. J. 
Hammond were UI South Sioui 
City Saturday and came to O’- 
Neill Sunday Mrs Hammond has 
been in Omaha and Lincoln ‘Hie 
Chaces relumed to Lincoln that 
day. 

Mrs. Mary Uiglin and Mrs. 
Margaret Holer returned to O’- 
Neill last Wednesday from Om- 
aha. 

Mr ami Mrs Edward Dompert 
spent from Thursday to Sunday 
m Sleepy Eye, Minn at the Inane 
of her biuther. Clement Cleary, 
ami family. 

Mr and Mr*. Allen Ellerbrocdt 
and daughter, Omaha, spent the 
weekend with her parents, Mr. 
and Mrs. Norb Uhl. 

Returning to Lincoln tfcinday 
were Mr and Mrs. Tom Killers 
ami two sons. Mrs. Khlers .»i»ent 
the week with the Harold Liml- 
bergs. 

Susan liurney, Omaha, daugh- 
ter ol Mr. and Mrs. M. L. Bur 
ncy was in O’Neill last weekend. 

Mr. and Mrs. Henry loihaua 
were in Omaha Sunday to sect 
their daughter, Ellen. She under- 
went an emergency appendae 
tomy operation Friday night 

Mrs. A. P. Jus/.kowiuk ami 
Jeanne l.ohaus went to Omaha 
Saturday. 

Mr. and Mrs. Alvin Horse at- 
tended district one legion ami 
Legion Auxiliary convention in 
Valentine Friday. 

Lutheran laulirs Meet 
Christ Lutheran Ladies met In 

the church basement Thursday 
evening, Sept. 6. Mr. Anderson, 
Bethesa Children’s Home, Water- 
town, Wise., showed a film of the 
home. 

The annual smorgasliord will 
be held Oct. 17 

Hostesses were Mrs Harvey 
Krugman and Mrs. lion Younie. 

Mr. and Mrs. John Schmit, 
Nenzel .were Sunday guest* of 
Edward Schmit and family. 

Mrs. M. J. Golden went to Om- 
aha Saturday and returned Sun- 
day. 

■Irudi Club I'lcnic Held 
Member* of the Jeudi club and 

their husbands held u picnic last 
Thursday at the O’Neill Country 
club. 

ASSUMPTION IIVM < III JUH 
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