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Mr. and Mrs. Bud Kinport and 
family of Fremont returned home 
after visiting at the parental 
William Elsasser home. 

Mr. and Mrs. Dennis Kube and 
family were Sunday visitors at 
the Vincent Jehorek home Sun- 
day. 

Mr. and Mrs. Veldon Lee and 
sons of Sunshine Bottom and Mr. 
and Mrs. William Stauffer and 
Galvin D. Spencer were 6 o’clock 
dinner guests of Mrs. Gladys 

Spencer and Arden on Wednes- 
day, March 7. They spent the 
evening visiting and playing 
cards. 

Mrs. William Havranek re- 
turned home from several day’s 
visit with her daughters, Mrs. 
Ralph Moody at Niobrara and 
Mrs. Jack Samuelson at Harting- 
ton. 

Mr. and Mrs. Emil Micanek 
and Wayne Christensen returned 
home from Omaha where they at- 
tended the annual Farmer’s Un- 
ion convention last week. 

Mr. and Mrs. Elmer* Hull of 
Niobrara were Lynch visitors 
Saturday. 

Mr. and Mrs. Harrison James 
of Spencer visited with Mrs. 
Laura Wurtz on Sunday. 

Mrs. Lena Johnson of Lincoln 
is visiting with Mrs. Martha 
Schindler this week. 

Mr. and Mrs. Wayne Blair and 
family of Spencer were Sunday 

visitors at the Don Spencer home. 
Mr. and Mrs. Glen Stewart 

were O’Neill visitors last week. 
Mr. an<f Mrs. Beryl Moody and 

sons called at the Frederick 
King home Sunday. 

Monsignor Juricek of Omaha 
spent several days in Lynch the 
past week during the absence of 
Father Kamber, who was in Om- 
aha where he gave three lectures 
on Communism. Father Kamber 
returned home late Friday. 

Father William Foster of Spen- 
cer was a Lynch caller Friday. 

Mr. and Mrs. Clarence Kolund 
and family were dinner guests at 
the Charles Courtney home Sun- 
day. 

Mr. and Mrs. C. L. Haselhorst, 
Mr. and Mrs. Raymond Havranek 
and family, Mr. and Mrs. Beryl 
Moody and sons, Mr. and Mrs. 
Edward Streit and family and 
Mr. and Mrs. Lorie Micanekwere 
Sunday dinner guests at the Dale 
Audiss home Sunday. 

Mrs. Gladys Spencer, Mrs. Ed 
Johns, Mrs. Gracia Craig and 

Mrs. Myron Hodges attended the 
Sunshine extension club meeting 
held at the Veldon Lee home on 
Sunshine Bottom on Thursday. 

Mr. and Mrs. Carl Schlenzel of 
.O’Neill were Lynch Aallers Tues- 
day, March 6. Mrs. Schlenzel vis- 
ited at the Frank Weeder home 
while Mr. Schlenzel looked after 
business matters. 

Mr. and Mrs. Lloyd Tuch of 
Verdel visited relatives Saturday. 

Mr. and Mrs. Henry Vonasek 
and daughters of Verdigre and 
Mr. and Mrs. Dale Audiss of 
Butte were Sunday, March 4, 
guests at the Edward Streit home. 

Barry Baker of Lincoln was a 

Lynch caller last week. 
Mr. and Mrs. Carl Frisch of 

Winnetoon visited at- the Mary 
Wade home the past week. 

Audrey Compton was a busi- 
ness visitor in Spencer Thursday. 

LYNCH—The Boyd county Le- 
gion and auxiliary will hold then- 
quarterly meeting at Bristow 
Monday, March 12. 

3 Cars Damaged in 
Unnsnal Accident— 

In an accident Friday, March 2, 
about 9:30 p.m., on U.S. high- 
ways 275-20, two miles east of O’- 
Neill, four cars were involved. 

Fred Gross of Gurley, who was 

enroute to Page, had car trouble. 
He flagged Robert Pease of Cen- 
ter and Clifford Olson of Wausa. 
Both stopped behind the Gross 
machine to give assistance. Anton 
Gustafason of Wausa did not stop 
his car in time and his car struck 
one of the others. The impact 
caused the other machines to 
bump into each other. None was 

hurt. Three vehicles were dam- 
aged. 

Visibility was bad and the 
highway was slick. 

TOP STUDENT 
Miss Marilyn Lindberg, daugh- 

ter of Mr.a nd Mrs. H. L. Lind- 
berg, was included in the top five 
percent of her class for first 
semester work at Wesleyan uni- 
versity, Lincoln. 

Stock Growers Okay 
Brucellosis Plan 

At a regular quarterly meeting 
held at Alliance Monday, March 
5, the executive council and ad- 
visory board of the Nebraska 
Stock Growers association en- 
dorsed the voluntary five year 
brucellosis program. 

This plan for eradication of 
Bangs disease was worked out by 
Dr. J. L. George, state veterinar- 

i ian; Dr. D. F. Werring, federal 
i veterinarian representing the U.S. 
department of agriculture and the 
health and sanitary committee of 
the Nebraska Stock Growers as- 

sociation, headed by Forrest S. 
Lee of Brownlee. 

In the light of the current en- 
dorsement the Stock Growers as- 
sociation is urging its members 
to immediately adopt official 
calf-hood vaccination. 

“We recommend that our mem- 
bers and other livestock owners 
in the brand area avail them- 
selves of the benefits of the pro- 
gram, and cooperate to insure its 
success,” Mr. Lee said. 

To Limit Club 
Membership to 15— 

The “What Not” extension club 
met recently at the home of Mrs. 
Glenn Kennicott. Mrs. Claire 
Engdahl, Mrs. James Storms, 
Mrs. Elmer Murman, Mrs. Charles 
Houser and Mrs. Milton Baack 
became new club members. 

Business meeting was conduct-1 
ed by the president, Mrs. Charles 
Belllin. The dues and the size of 
membership for the club were 
discussed. Membership will be 
restricted to 15. 

Chambers News 
Frederick DeHart of Logan, la., 

was visiting relatives at Cham- 
bers a few days recently. He re- 
turned home on Tuesday, March 
6, accompanied by his sister. Mrs. 
Victor Harley, who spent the re- 
mainder of the week with her 
parents, Mr. and Mrs. Fred De- 
Hart. 

Family night was observed at 
the Methodist church Sunday 
evening, March 11. About 70 
people from the Chambers and 
Amelia communities Were present 
to enjoy the films shown by Mr. 
and Mrs. Lee Terwilliger of At- 
kinson. The pictures were taken 
by the Terwilligers on a trip to 
Germany about three years ago. 
Lunch was served following the 
program. 

Marine Cpl. Harold Dexter, 
who arrived recently from Japan, 
has been visiting in the Ed Dex- 
ter and Raymond Bly homes at 
Amelia and the Ralph Hoffman 
home at Chambers. Saturday 
night, March 10, he spent with 
Russell Miner at the Floyd Whit- 

, aker home. Corperal Dexter is a 
I son of Mrs. Olive Dexter of O’- i 
i Neill and has been stationed in 

Japan for over a year. He has a 
30-day leave. 

Mrs. Alfred Walter arrived 
home Sunday, March 11, from a 
two weeks’ visit with relatives at 
Pilger, Norfolk, Carrol}, and Stan- 
ton. While in Norfolk, she called 
on Mrs. Anna Morthorst, former- 
ly of Chambers. Mr. and Mrs. 
Louis Whoeler of Pilger, brother- 
in-law and sister of Mrs. Walter, 
brought her home. They stopped 
for a shart visit in Chambers with 
her brother and sister-in-law, 
Mr. and Mrs. Ruben Peltzer, be- 
for returning to Pilger. 

Miss Janet Euwer, high school 
teacher, took the following girls 
to Lincoln Friday, March 9: Mary 
Ellen Gillette, Carolyn Winter- 
mote, Edith Grimes and Doreen 
Gleed. The girls visited in the 
Orin Gibson home. They also 
spent some time on the Wesleyan 
University campus and on Satur- 
day evening attended the state 
basketball tourneyment. 

Supt L. J. Eckdall accompanied 
by Rodney Elkins, Douglas Dan- 
kert and Ralph Maas, drove to 
Lincoln Thursday to attend the 
basketball tournament. The next 
day Rodney developed a case of 
mumps and had to call his father 
to bring him home. The others 
remained over the weekend. 

The young adult group of the 
Chambers Methodist church met 
Thursday evening, March 8, for 
a social time. 

, Mr. and Mrs. Louis Neilson 
i drove to Grand Island Friday, 

March 9. Their mother, Mrs. 
Halloway, spent the day with 
Mrs. Glee Grimes. 

Mrs. Jennie Gibson, Mrs. Dar- 
rell Gillette accompanied by Mr. 
and Mrs. Jim Gibson to Inman 
where they visited the former’s 
brother, David Isaacson, and Mr. 
and Mrs. Herbert Nielson. 

Mr. and Mrs. Merlin Grossnick- 
laus and childen went to Platts- 
mouth Monday to visit his par- 
ents. 

Riverside Club Meets— 
The Riverside 4-H club held its 

first meeting of 1956 at the Matt 
Beha home. Theresa Boyle was 

elected president; Betty Jane 
Schneider, vice president; Rita 
Boyle and Catherine Vitt, song 
leaders; Marie Ann Boyle, treas- 

urer; Matthew Beha, news re- 

porter. 

WOMAN DIES 
ATKINSON — Mrs. Walter 

Hughes, 65, died Sunday, March 
4, in the Atkinson hospital. A 

Long Pine resident, she had been 
hospitalized two weeks. Her hus- 
band died exactly a year ago. 
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Bartaks Building 
Home Near School 

Two Other Families 
Plan Dwellings 

DELOIT—Mr. and Mrs. Lam- 
bert Bartak are building a mod- 
ern home south of the Deloit 
school. They purchased the build- 
ing location from the Huffman 
corporation. 

Mr. and Mrs. Ewald Spahn and 
Mr. and Mrs. Eamie Spahn plan 
to build new homes on the Spahns’ 
west place. 

Other Deloit News 
Mr. and Mrs. Henry Reimer 

were recent visitors at the Leon- 
ard Larson home. 

The HEO club met last Thurs- 
day at the Ewald Spahn home for 
a 1 o’clock dinner. Husbands of 
members were guests for the day. 

Mrs. Henry Reimer and Elayne 
attended the grade basketball 
tournament at Chambers Wed- 
nesday evening, March 7. The El- 
gin grade boys won two of the 
three games, winning from Ewing 
on Monday, March 5, and from 
Chambers last Thursday. They 
won a trophy. 

Mr. and Mrs. Leo Funk spent 
Sunday evening at the Bill Sehi 
home. 

Mr. and Mrs. Sylvester Bauer 
and family were Sunday dinner 
guests at the Royvan Day home. 

Due to the cold, stormy weath- 
er over the weekend, people stay- 
ed home and there isn’t much 
news. 

Mr. and Mrs. Bud Bartak at- 
tended the funeral of Mrs. Bar- 
tak’s aunt, Mary Gokie of Ewing, 
Tuesday morning, March 6. 

Elayne Reimer and Terry and 
Willard Harpster visited at the 
Fred Harpster home Friday eve- 

ning. 
Don Larson accompanied the 

Creighton seniors to Omaha on 

Monday, March 5. He is their 
sponsor. 

Mr. and Mrs. Barnes and four 
children of Atkinson moved dur- 
ing the weekend to the Rees 
ranch where the Barnes will be 
employed. They have three chil- 
dren in school. 

Pat Gokie Now 
At San Diego 

Pat Gokie, son of Mr. and Mrs. 
Clarence Gokie, enlisted in the 
Navy recently. He left for San 
Diego, Calif. After completing 
nine weeks of training he will be 
eligible for a 14-day leave. Pat is 
a 1955 graduate of St. Mary’s 
academy. 
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Normal Trainers 
Hear Health Talk*— 

T. R. Dappen, director public 
health education, and Dr. H. W. 
Heinz, director of dental health, 
both from the Nebraska state 
health department, were speakers 
at an all-day meeting held for the 
Holt county normal trainers in 
the court house assembly room 
Tuesday, March 6. 

Purpose was to aid future 
teachers with the screening tests, 
which will be given all school 
children next falL 

COMPLETE COURSE 
Shirley Ross of O’Neill, Ber- 

nard D. Holmberg and Richard D. 
Loock, both of Spencer, recently 
completed a four-week community 
living course at the University of 
Nebraska and were presented 
certificates. 

GETS CONDUCT MEDAL 
EMMET—a/lc John L. O’Con- 

nell, son of Mr. and Mrs. John 
O’Connell of Emmet, recently 
was promoted to his present 
grade and has been awarded the 
good conduct medal. 

Meeting Delayed— 
The meeting of the O’Neill Wo- 

men’s club that was to have been 
held March 21 has been post- 
poned. 

John R. Gallagher 
Attomey-at-Law 

First NaH Bank Bldg. 
O'NEILL PHONE 11 
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Black with Red, Pink or Orange Stripes 

GIRLS’ ITALIAN 
POLO SHIRTS 

98 
Popular new Italian style polo shirts are a big 

\ favorite of the younger set, too. Your youngster 
will practically live in these combed cotton knit 

shirts all spring and summer long. She’ll like the 

| gay stripes and the cool boat neckline. Pocket and 

short sleeves are solid color. Sizes 7 to 14. Better 

hurry in for these bright buys! 
118-78a» • 
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FRIDAY, 12 NOON TO 5:30 

tgOReUSTK 
NATIONALLY ADVERTISED 

CHILDREN'S 2-PIECE 

SLEEPERS T 99t 
VALUES TO 1.98 EA. 
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Miracle Nylon for Safe/ Easy Tubbing 

GIRL’S TOPPER 
Stays soft and fleecy through 
repeated washings—light as a 

feather, too! She’ll love its grown- 
up look, pretty single button and 
four-gore back. Slim red lines'm 
the background blend into a soft 
pink. Also in blue, sizes 7-12. 
IOM)11480 

This same fleecy nylon topper is also in pre-teen 1998 
sizes 8 to 14. Big and little sister can dress alike! IO 
106-6312-1090 
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For Rough ’n Tumble Wear ( 
Boys’ Oxfords < 

J Wool shoe for active dttie feet. 
Stitchdown brown leather, ( 
composition soles. 10*3. 
10S-KM ■ 
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Free and Easy on Her Feet 

Girls1 Two-Strap ' 
i 
i 

Little girls'brown leather strap d 
is a big favorite for spring. 
Composition soles. 81/2-3, B, D. { 
tos-ins 
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Built to Take Lots of Wear ( 
Boys’ Oxfords < 

298 ! Sturdy, low priced brown leather 
oxfords for your little man. fl 
Composition soles. Sizes 9-3. 
103-105 ■ 
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Girls' All-Time Favorite 

Saddle Oxfords 

398 \ 
Ever-popular white and black 4 
saddle shoes. White rubber 
soles, leather insoles. 8l£-3. Q 
10t-Kit 
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Just Right for Spring Wear ( 
Girls’ Oxfords i 

! Comfortable and sturdy shoe* 
for growing feet. Brown leather { 
with Nuron soles. 8 Vi-3, B, D. 
105-1548 { 
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New Springtime Color* g 
Tots’ Crawlers | 

]69 , 
Gay poplin crawlers with ( 
embroidered bib, button-on g 
suspenders. 12-18-24 mos. 9 
115-2111 
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For 

Low Cost Premiums 
in financially responsible 

Insurance Companies making 
prompt loss adjustments 

See or Write: 

L G. Gillespie 
Insurance Agent, 

O’Neill, Nebr. 

In business for the past 62 
years 

Or p'*one residence 218, 
315 South First Street, or 

114, Gillespie Radio Shop 

Dr. J. L. Sherbahn 
CHIROPRACTOR 

% Block So. of Ford Garage 
Complete X-Ray Equipment 

O’Neill, Nebraska 

t ■■ .. .. 

Marcellus Impl. 
Phone 5 

— WEST O’NEILL — 

=BEN FRAMICIIM—. 

Greet them on Easter 
4s with artistic 
GREETING CARDS 

Choose from Our Big, Beautiful Selection 

CARDS for Everyone! 2 f°r 5C & 10c 
“Happy Easter” said in the nicest way—with cards selected es- 

pecially for kin-folk and friends. Choose early from these love- 
ly cards that cost so little. 

favorite EASTER TOYS 

16-Inch Cuddly 

Rayon Bunny 
1.98 

Soft thick-pile rayon plush in gay 
Easter colors Pink eyes, straw 
whiskers, ribbon bow tie. Stuffed 
with cotton 

Hollow Mold Rayon Plush 

Chocolate 10-Inch 

Characters BUNNY 

10c Up 1.49 

Jelly Bird 
10-In. Cotton EGGS 

Sqneak 
BUNNY OOC L,D* 

Bright colors, 
0Q_ marshmallow 
Ojv centers. Asst’d 

fruit flavors. 

PATTON’S.O’Neill 


