
Sophie Murphy, 
Richard Ingraham 

United at Stuart 
STUART — Bouquets of white 

and blue mums decorated the 
altars of St. Boniface Cathode 
church at Stuart Saturday mor- 

ning, May 3, 1958, when Miss 
Sophie Murphy of Denver, daugh- 
ter of Mr. and Mrs. J. P. Mur- 

phy of Stuart became the bride ot 
Richard Ingraham of Denver, 
son of Mr. and Mrs William In- 

graham of White wood, S.D-, at 

9 a.m., with Rev. A J. Paschang 
performing the double ring cere- 

mony. Nupital music was Mass of 
S. Maria Gautte which was sung 
by the St. Boniface Male Choir 
with Sr Vera as organist. 

The bride given in marriage by 
tier father, uppeared in a lovely 
gown of white nylon silk, with a 

chapel length train. The fitted 
bodice of imported lace with sab- 
rina neckline was trimmed with 
seguins and seed pearls with 
an empire waistline and long tap- 
ered sleeves which came to a point 
at the wrist. Her finger tip veil 
was held in place with a seed 

pearl net crown. She carried a 

white orchid on a white prayer 
book with stephanotis and stream- 

ers, which was a gift from the 
bridegroom The old tradition was 

carried out with something old, 
new. borrowed and blue. 

The bride’s sisters were her 
attendants with Miss Mary Mur- 
phy of Denver, maid of honor, 
wearing a cocktail length gown of 
powder blue crystalette over taf- 
feta, with a Grecian waistline 
and a flowing sash. Her head- 
band was of nylon net entwined 
with pearls The bridesmaids, 
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Jane and Eileen Murphy of Oma- 
ha, wore identical gowns o f 
crystallete over taffeta and aJJ 
wore matching linen shoes and 
earned colonial tiouquets of pink 
and white carnations. 

Irvin Ingraham of Whitewood, 
S.D., acted as bestman tor his 
brother, with other attendants 
being brothers of the bride. Henry 
and James Murphy. Ushers were 

Patrick and Mark Murphy cou- 

sins of the bride. 
The bride's mother wore a 

mint green lace dress with white 
accessories and the bridegroom s 

motner wore a nylon print dress 
with pink and white accessories. 
Both wore baby orchard cor- 

sages. 
following the ceremony the 

bride's parents entertained at a 

dinner at noon for 150 guests at 
the Stuart auditorium which was 

preparted by the Christian Moth- 
ers. A reception was held for 
150 guests from 3 to 5 p.m., 
with the bride's sister, Rita Mur- 
phy, in charge of the guest Ixxik. 

Misses Evelyn and Helen Kaup, 
cousins of the bride were in 

charge of the gifts. The beautiful 
three-tier wedding cake was baked 
and decorated by Miss Connie 
Coufal and was trimmed in the 
bride's colors of blue and silver, 
The wedding cake was cut and 
served by the bride's aunt, Mrs. 
Clement Murphy and the groom’s 
cake was cut and served by the 
bride's aunt, Mrs Ed Schneider. 
Another aunt of the bride, Mrs. 
Sylvester Kramer poured. 

The bride wore as her going- 
away suit a powder blue cotton 
knit dress and after a short wed- 
ding trip, will be at home after 
May 10, at 1109 Marion St., Den- 
ver, Colo. 

Mrs. Ingraham is a graduate of 
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and St. John's NcMamara nur- 

sing schol at Rapid City, S.D., 
and is now employed at the Den- 
ver General hospital. 

The groom is a graduate of 

Spearfish, S.D., high school and is 
now employed with Mountain 
States Mattress Co., Denver, 
Colo. 

Out-of-town relatives attending 
the wedding were his mother, 
Mrs. William Ingraham and 
brother, Irwan, of Whitewood, 
S.D.; Mrs. Jerry Martin of Lead, 
S.D.; Mrs. James Meyer of Stur- 
gis, S.D.; Mr. and Mrs Orville 
Puckett of Pender; Mr. and Mrs. 
Jim Hindmarsh of Grand Island; 
Mr. and Mrs Peter Deucher and 
Paulette of Bison, S.D.; Mrs. 
Mary James, Kathryn McShane 
and Mr. and Mrs. Joe Judge of 
Atkinson. 

Educational Trip 
Next Week— 

The juniors and seniors of St. 

Mary's academy plan to leave 
next Thursday by bus on an edu- 
cational trip to Denver, Colo. Two 
)i the features of their sightsee- 
ing will be a trip to Red Rock 
theatre and through the mint. 

Faculty members accompany- 
ing the group are Mother M. 

Agnesine, Sr. M. Josephine and 
Sr. M. Constance. 

Mrs. Bernard Gribble of Cham- 
bers visited her mother, Mrs. 

Sylvester Zakrewski. She accom- 

panied Mrs. Elizabeth Venteicher 
and Mrs. Zakrzewski, who had 
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Mother-Daughter 
Banquet Held Here 

The first annual mother-daugh- 
ter banquet, sponsored by the 
Presbyterian Women's associa- 
tion was held at Fellowship Hall 
Monday evening. 

The program was centered 
around “Hearts and Flowers". 
Mrs. Milo Landreth of Page was 

toastmistress. Mrs. George C. 
Robertson read the theme, taken 
from proverbs 31. She gave a 

few comments on mothers in the 
bible and the charges for moth- 
ers for Mother’s day. 

Mrs. Harry Petersen gave the 
welcome, “Hearts” and the re- 

sponse, "Bouquet to Mother” was 

given by her daughter. Miss Jane. 
Recognition was given by Mrs, 

Roy Humrich who presented 
geranium plants to Mrs. V. C. 
Johnson and Mrs. Felix Hend- 
rick, who headed four generation 
groups. Those in Mrs. Johnson's 
family present were her daugh- 
ter, Mrs. M. L. Harmon and her 
two daughters, Mrs. A1 Vorce 
with Sheryl and Mrs. Roy Berner 
with Suzanne. Mrs. Hendrick’s 
daughter is Mrs. Landreth, the 
toastmistress, and her daughter,, 
Mrs. Raymond Harmon and 
Rhonda of Page. 

Mrs. Laura Walker, the mother 
of Mrs. L. A. Burgess, was the 
oldest mother present. Mrs. Paul 
Shelhamer was the youngster 
there. 

"Mother in Candleglow" narra- 

ted by Mrs. William EfTwards, 
was presented by Linda Shel- 
hamer, Ellen Artus, Cheryl Grav- 
es, Jeanne Crabb, Sheryl Brady 
and Alma Nutter. 

The Tappettes, under the direc- 
tion of Mrs. Vivian Melena, per- 
formed. They were Lu Ann Shep- 
herd, Tilen Al^art, Gaylene An- 
thony of Inman, Bobby Joe 
Moore, Bruce Ann McKamy and 
Maureen Shemaker. 

Miss Diane Gillespie accompan- 
ied Mis. Charles F. Nutter, Mrs. 
C. L. Brady, jr., and Mrs. Grant 
Peacock, who sang “Girl of My 
Dreams” and "Kentucky Babe”. 

Mrs. K. L. Van Voorhis is presi- 
dent of the Women’s association. 
Mrs. Roy Shelhamer was pro- 
gram chairman and Mrs. Earl 
Hunt was dinner chairman. 

The Men’s Council, headed by 
William Edwards, took charge of 
the serving and the kitchen. D. H. 
Clauson was chairman of the 
waiters. 

Beilins Head 
Adult Fellowship— 

New officers elected by the 
adult fellowship at the Methodist 
church Tuesday evening are; 

Mr. and Mrs. Charles Beilin, 
presidents; Mr. and Mrs. Helmut 
Arnold, vice-presidents; Mr. and 
Mrs. Frank Eppenbach, secre- 
tary-treasurers. 

Mr. and Mrs. A. Neil Dawes 
and Mr. and Mrs. Grant Peacock 
were in charge of the meeting 
which bore a gypsy theme. The 
group met in a tent and had a 
weiner roast over a campfire. 
Eleven members and three guests 
were present and were dressed in 
keeping with the atmosphere. 

.Sunday Guests — 

Sunday guests of Mr. and Mrs- 
Reginald Pinkerman were Mr. 
and Mrs. Guy Pinkerman and 
boys of Redbird. Afternoon call- 
ers were Mr. and Mrs. Wayne 
Christensen and Sharon of Lynch. 

Kay Christensen, who was an 

overnight guest Friday at the 
Pinkerman home, returned with 
her parents. 

Legal Notices 
(First pub. May 8, 1958.) 

John K. Gallagher, Attorney 
NOTICE OF SI IT 

To Claude Carey and Hallee 
Carey, husband and wife; Ralph 
Carey, a single man; Howard 
Carey, a single man; Fred L. 
Carey and Myrtle B. Carey, hus- 
band and wife; Boyd Carey and 
Evelyn Carey, husband and wife; 
Glen L. Carey and Irene Carey, 
husband and wife; Bertha E. 
Ramsey and Forrest R. Ramsey, 
wife and husband; Lillie Carey, 
the heirs, devisees, legatees, per- 
sonal representatives, and all 
other persons interested in the 
estate of Lillie Carey, Deceased, 
real names unknown; All persons 
having or claiming any interest 
in the Southwest Quarter of Sec- 
tion 21, Township 29, Range 11, 
West of the 6th P. M., in Holt 
County, Nebraska, real true 
names unknown, defendants. 

You and each of you are here- 
by notified that on the 6th day of 
May, A. D„ 1958, Leola Wilkin- 
son, as Plaintiff, filed her peti- 
tion and commenced an action in 
the District Court of Holt County, 
Nebraska, against you and each 
of you, the obect and prayer of 
said petition is for a partition of 
real estate according to the re- 

spective rights of the parties 
therein or if the same cannot be 
equitably divided that said prem- 
ises may be sold and the proceeds 
thereof be divided between the 
parties according to the respect- 
ive rights and that the defend- 
ants “all persons having or calim- 
ing any interest in the above de- 
scribed real estate, real names 
unknown may be decreed to have 
no right or interest therein or to 
the possession thereof", and may 
lie excluded from any right, title, 
lien or interest in or to said above 
described real estate. 

You are required to answer 

said petition on or before the 16 

day of June, 1958. 
LEOLA WILKINSON, 

PLAINTIFF 
BY JOHN R. GAIJAGHER 

Attorney for Plaintiff 
2-5c 

(First pub. May 8, 1958) 
John R. Gallagher. Attorney 

NOTICE OF HEARING ON 
PETITION FOR 

DETERMINATION OF 
HEIRSHIP 

Estate No. 4267 

IN THE COUNTY COURT OF 
HOLT COUNTY, NEBRASKA. 
IN THE MATTER OF ESTATE 

OF LILLIE CAREY, DECEASED. 
THE STATE OF NEBRASKA. 

To all persons interested in said es- 
tate, creditors and heirs take no- 
tice : 

1. That Leola Wilkinson has 
filed her petition alleging that 
Lillie Carey died intestate in Holt 
County, Nebraska on or about 
January 10, 1947, being a resident 
and inhabitant of Holt County, 
Nebraska and died seised of the 
following described real estate, 
to-wit: An undivided one-half in- 
terest in and to the following des- 
cribed real estate, to-wit: 

The Southwest Quarter of 
Section 21, Township 29, 
Range 11, West of the 6th P. 
M., in Holt County, Nebraska 

leaving as her sole and only heirs 
at law the following named per- 
sons, to-wit: 

Fred Carey, her husband, 
Claude Carey, Ralph Carey, 
Howard Carey, Fred L. Carey, 
Boyd Carey and Glen Carey, 
her sons, and Bertha E. 
Ramsey, Myrtle I. Young and 
Leola Wilkinson, her daugh- 
ters. 
2. That the interest of the pe- 

titioner herein in the above de- 
scribed real estate is an heir at 
law and daughter of the said de- 
ceased and praying for a deter- 
mination of the time of the death, 
the heirs, the degree of kinship, 
and the right of descent of the 
real property belonging to the 
said deceased, in the State of Ne- 
braska, which petition will be for 
hearing in this court on May 29, 
1958, at 10 o’clock, A. M. 

Dated at O’Neill, Nebraska, this 
6 day of May A. D., 1958. 

LOUIS W. REIMER, 
County Judge. 

(COUNTY COURT SEAL) 
2-4p 
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Announcement 
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DUE TO THE UNTIMELY passing of Mr. Charles E. 

Jones of O’Neill we announce the following change in 
our O’Neill office personnel: 

MR. FRANCIS TIGHE, formerly of Norfolk, becomes 
the manager of the O’Neill office and MR. ROBERT 
HAYTER the assistant manager. I 

THESE TWO gentlemen are well-qualified and highly 
experienced in loans and finance, and are insurance coun- 

sellors. They are prepared to continue the same fine ser- 

vice and consideration that has been available in the past. 

CENTRAL FINANCE CORPORATION 

.*• 0 

Membership in the St. Mary’s Alumni association Sunday evening was awarded to Miss CV 

<■01111 Ann Arbuthnot (right) at the annual alumni tanquet. Mrs. .lames Harley (left), association 

president, made the award. Standing in center is Miss Mary Louise Birmingham, toastmaster; seal- 

ed Is Very Rev. Timothy O'Sullivan.—The Fron -r Photo. 

I 
(First pub. May 8. 1958.) 

SHERIFF’S SALE 
Notice is hereby given that by 

virtue of an Order of Sale issued 
to me by the Clerk of the District 
Court of Holt County, Nebraska, 
in an action pending in said Court 
wherein County of Holt is plaintiff 
and Ethel Cowles et. al. are de- 
fendants, I will sell to the highest 
bidder for cash at the front door 
of the court house in O'Neill, Ne- 
braska, on the 9 day of June, 1958. 
at 10 o'clock A. M., the follow- 
ing described premises in Holt 
County, Nebraska: 

Lots 8, 9 and-10, in Block 2 of 
the Original Town of Page, in 
Holt County, Nebraska, to sat 

isfy the sum of $217.94 found due 
plaintiff and interest therenm ane: 

$40.19 costs of suit and accruing 
costs. 

Dated this 7 day of May, 1958. 
LEO S. TOM JACK 

Sheriff of Holt County, Nebraska. 
2-6c 

(Published May, 8, 1958.) 
NOTICE OF DISSOLUTION 

OF PARTNERSHIP 
Notice is hereby given that the 

farming and ranching partner- 
ship heretofore conducted anc 

carried on by Neil G. Chase anc 
Matthew McCabe near Page, ir 
Holt County, Nebraska, has beer 
dissolved by mutual consent and 
agreement, and all of the assets 
of said partnership sold tc 
Matthew McCabe. 

Said farming and ranching bus- 
iness in the future, will be car- 
ried on by Matthew McCabe un- 
der his own name. 

NEIL G. CHASE 
MATTHEW McCABE 

2c 

Many Out-of-Towners 
Here for Funeral 

Among the many out-of-towi 
persons here Wednesday, Apri 
30. to attend funeral services foi 
the late Charles E. Jones, 69 
were: 

Mr. and Mrs. Reuben Jones o 

Alpha, 111.; Mr. and Mrs. Harolc 
Jones of Fabens, Tex.; Mr. anc 

Mrs. Hilmer Jones, Mr. and Mrs 
Reuben Gustason, Emil Jones 
Mr. and Mrs. Paul Jones, Mr 
and Mrs. Harold Hanquist, Mr 
and Mrs. Leonard Peterson, Gor 
don Peterson and Conrad Peter 
son, all of Hordville. 

Mr. and Mrs. Lawrence Jones 
of Aurora; Mr. and Mrs. Willarc 
Lindburg, Mr. and Mrs. Dear 
Lindburg, Vem Jones, Mrs. Han 
nah Hahn, Mr. and Mrs. Enocf 
Peterson, Mr. and Mrs. Ben Pe- 
terson, Mr. and Mrs. Elmei 
Hanquist, Mr. and Mrs. Robert 
Nelson, Mr. and Mrs. Walter Nel- 
son and Albert Nelson, all ol 
Polk. N 

Mr. and Mrs. Harry Hassel 

and Mr. and Mrs. Ira Glasser of 
Grand Island; Mr. and Mrs. John 
Erickson of Hampton; Mr. and 
Mrs. Sherman Jones of Hastings; 
Mr. and Mrs. Ernest Bosquet 
and Mr. and Mrs. Robert McKil- 
lip of Lincoln; Everett England 
and Kenneth England of Harvard. 

| Mr. and Mrs. Earl Steever of 
Stroms burg; Mr. and Mrs. Fred 
Behlen, Mr. and Mrs. Walter 
Behlen, Mr. and Mrs. Mike Beh- 
len, Mr. and Mrs. Gilbert Behlen 
and Jerry Joseph, all of Colum- 
bus; Mr. and Mrs. Francis Tighe, 
Miss Ruth Rouse, Mrs. William 

Smith, Mr. and Mrs. Lurch K. 
Adkins, Mr. and Mrs. Jolm Ad- 
kins, Mr. and Mrs. Robert Adams 
and Mr. find Mrs. John Casey, 
all of Norfolk. 

Mr. and Mrs. Cloyd Stolzman 
of West Point; Dale Parkhurst of 
Yankton, S. D.; Mr. and Mrs. 
Emil Reutzel, sr* and Thomas 
Gableman of Neli^h; Robert Hay- 
tor of Ainsworth and T, Leslie 
Kizer of Omaha. 

Try Frontier want ads for 
quick results! 

POLITICAL ADVERTISEMENT POLITICAL ADVERTISEMENT 

Keating 
Republican 

FOR 

HOLT COUNTY 

ASSESSOR 
• (Qualified by Education and 

BiiNinrNN Experience. 
• Lifelong Refddent of Holt 

County. 
• Member of the American 

I^cgion Auxiliary. 

Will Appreciate Your Vote 

Primary Election May 13 
_ 

ITS REMEMBERING THAT COUNTS... 
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'RuXh'Bcm^ 
Nylon Hosiery 

51-gauge, 
15-denier 

60-gauge, 
15-denier 

Rich, glowing shades with 
handsome dark seams and ta- 

pered French-style heels! Co- 
ordinated leg lengths. 
Sheer or gossamer- 
sheer, 8t£-ll. 

“Colored Heels” 
Dark heel, toe, seams! 
51-gauge, 15 denier 

“Bareleg No-Seam” 
('ireular run-resistant 

laey mesh! 15-tlenler 

“Stretch Nylons” 
Smooth 15-denier self- 
seam stretch nylons 

“Tytwist Deluxe” 
Snag-resistant sheers! 
tM-gange, 15-denier 

Cotton Plisse Slip 
2 styles, eyelet or 

nylon embroidery 
trim. Size# 32-40. 

Cotton Half Slip 
Kmhroldered 3-In. 
IxiMom ruffle, 2 

style*. S, M, L._ 

PATTON’S O’NEILL, 


