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State Goal In Bond 
Drive Is Still Short 

Although the Fourth War Loan 
campaign closes officially on Tues- 
day, February 15, Nebraska coun- 

ties that have been snow-bound 
for the past week will have an 

opportunity to complete their 
county canvasses. 

W. Dale Clark, state chairman 
of the War Finance Committee for 
Nebraska, announced that sale of 
‘E,” “F” and “G” Series bonds 
will count in the campaign, pro- 
vided purchases are made prior to 
February 29 and if these addition- 
al sales are reported immediately 
to the Federal Reserve Bank in 
Omaha. 

“Many Nebraska counties are 

■ over the top in their over-all quo- 
f tas,” said Mr. Clark, “however, 

sales to individuals and sales of 
the Series “F” bonds have not 
been up to expectations. Adverse 
weather conditions are partially 
responsible, but we believe that a 

part of our poor showing in indi- 
vidual and “E” sales has been in 
some instances to complacency or 

over-optimism. 
“The war is a long way from 

being over and I urge Nebraskans 
who have not yet participated in 
the Fourth War Loan campaign 
through bond purchases, to ans- 

wer this urgent call for funds so 

badly needed to prosecute a suc- 

cessful war. 
“If every Nebraskan, with avail- 

funds, would buy an extra $100 
bond this week, I am sure Ne- 
braska would make its “E” bond 
quota and that the state’s individ- 
ual quota would also be reached,” 
Clark added. 

Chairmen of 93 war finance 
committees on Monday received a 

message from State Chairman 
Clark urging them to keep their 
campaign organization intact and 
continue the campaign until Feb- 
ruary 29th. 

“Nebraska can and will make 
the various quotas assigned, if 
every Nebraskan realizes that this 
ia his war and does his part as an 

individual,” Mr. Clark stated. 

Former O’Neill Girl Is 
Married In Virginia 

About a week ago Mrs. Thomas 
Donlin received a telegram from 
her granddaughter, Miss Maxine 
Harrington, informing her that 

r she had been married that morning 
» to Joseph Fraber, the ceremony 

being performed in St. Mary’s 
Catholic church in Alexandria, 
Virginia. Mrs. Fraber’s cousin, 
Miss Grace Ryan of Boncsteel, S. 
D., was bridesmaid and Mr. Fra- 
ber’s cousin was best man. 

The bride is the daughter of Mr. 
and Mrs. John Harrington, for- 
merly of this city but now resi- 
dents of Chicago, where Mr. Har- 
rington has a responsible position 
with the government, which he 
has held for several years. The 
bride attended school here for 
many years and has many friends 
in this city and county who extend 
to her and the man of her choice 
best wishes for a long and happy 
wedded life. 

St. Mary’s Defeats 
Chambers High 

The St. Mary’s Cardinals trav- 
eled to Chambers last Friday and 
won their tenth game of the seas- 

on 31 to 15. Rowse made two 
free throws to start the game giv- 
ing Chambers a 2-0 lead early in 
the first quarter, but then Camp- 
bell made two baskets to give us 

a 4-2 lead, which was from there- 
on never seriously threatened. 
The Cardinals held a 13-3 half- 
time margin and continued to 
score in the third and fourth quar- 
ters to give the Cardinals their 
tenth win of the season with a 

score of 31 to 15. Grady and 
Campbell led the winners with 
ten points each, while Svatos and 
Cooke led the Coyotes from 
Chambers, each having four points 
to their credit. 

St. Mary’s second team did not 
have such good luck as the Cham- 
bers second took the game 17-5. 
Ryan was high point man for the 
second team with three out of 
the five points that the Junior 
Cardinals made. 

New Retail Ceiling 
Prices On Meats 

New retail ceiling price lists for 
pork, beef, veal, lamb and mutton, 
effective immediately in Sioux 
City and surrounding areas, were 

issued by M. E, Rawlings, district 
director of the Sioux City office 
of price administration. 

Several sausage items, includ- 
ing salami, knackwurst, liver, 
braunsweiger and liver pudding 
have been added toi the new meat 
ceiling prices, but otherwise no 

change in prices has been made 
since publication of the previous 
lists last September. 

Lists for retail stores which, un- 

der OPA price regulations, must 
be posted conspicuously for cus- 

tomers’ reference, have been pro- 
vided local War Price and Ration- 
ing Boards. Retailers are being 
advised that the lists are now 

available and that the old posters 
Should be destroyed and replaced 
by the new ones. 

Meat nrices are set by zone 

areas. Sioux City is located in 
Zone 4 and 4A, which comprises 
all Sioux City, Iowa and South 
Sioux Citv. Nebr. Zone 4 covers 

retail ceilings on beef, veal and 
lamb. Zone 4A covers pork cuts. 

Boys From Holt County 
Inducted In February 

Following is a list of Holt coun- 

ty, Nebraska, boys inducted into 
the service of their country dur- 
ing the month of February 

Army 
Edward Roseler, O’Neill. 
LeRoy Lafayette Thurlow, At- 

kinson. 
Lawrence Arthur Tangeman, 

Chambers. 
Navy 

Thomas Perry Coleman, Ewing. 
Lyle Neil Fix, Atkinson. 
Robert Wayne Miller, Atkinson. 
Wayne Kenneth Montgomery, 

Stuart. 
Gardner Walter Gill, Stuart. 
Ivan Arlow Pollock, Atkinson. 

District Conservation 
Supts. To Be Elected 

Saturday, March 4, 1944, has 
ben selected as the day of election 
for four supervisors of the newly 
organized Holt Soil Conservation 
District. All persons, firms and 
corporations who hold title to any 
land within the boundaries of the | 
District— which includes all of i 
Holt County—are eligible to vote i 
in this election. One polling place j 
will be opened in the basement 
of the court house in O’Neill, be- 
tween the hours of 1:30 and 5:00 
on March 4. 

Nomination petitions were sub- 
mitted to the State Soil Conser- 
tion Committee for the following 
candidates: 

Calvin Allyn, Stuart 
Louis Bernholz, Page 
Hugo Holz, O’Neill 
A. Max Karo, Stuart 
Floyd Keyes, Inman 
E. J. Revell, Star 
Joe Roche, Atkinson 
Walter Sire, O’Neill. 
Non resident landowners, or 

those who wish to vote by mail, 
may apply in person or in writing 
to the District Election Officer, 
Louis Kepecky, Inman, Nebr., for 
a ballot. 

Land owners who find that they 
may not be able to vote at the 
polls on election day may vote by 
sealed ballot at any of the follow- 
ing places prior to the election: 

Chambers State Bank Cham- 
bers. 

First National Bank, Atkinson 
First National Bank, Stuart. 
Emmet State Bank, Emmet. 
Page Cooperation Credit As- 

sociation, Pege. 
Farmsrs State Bank, Ewing. 
U. S. Post Office, Inman. 
U. S. Post Office, Star. 
Production Credit Association, 

O’Neill. 
County Agent’s Office, O’Neill. 
County AAA Office, O’Neill. 

Rev. and Mrs. Longstaff 
Celebrate Anniversary 

On Thursday, February 3, the 
Rev. and Mrs. George Longstaff 
celebrated their 50th wedding 
anniversary at their home in 
Juniata. 

Married in Spennymoor, 
County Durham, England, in 
1894, Mr. and Mrs. Longstaff 
came to the United States in 
September, 1898, and have lived 
in Nebraska since that time. 
They have two daughters, Mrs. 
E. C. Goodenberger of Belgrade, 
Mont., and Mrs. J. C. Riddle- 
moser of Big Springs; and two 
sons, Captain John B. Longstaff 
of the United States Navy, sta- 
tioned in the Pacific, and Arnold 
R. Longstaff of Gordon. 

Mrs. Goodenberger Arnold, Mr. 
and Mrs. J. C. Riddlemoser and 
children, Jack and Susan, were 

present to help celebrate the 
occasion. Many friends called 
during the day and the couple 
were the recipients of many gifts, 
flowers and cards.—Hastings Daily 
Tribune. 

Rev. and Mrs. Longstaff were 

residents of this city for many 
years, where he served as pastor 
of the Presbyterian church and 
has many friends in this city and 
county who join us in extending 
him and Mrs. Longstaff many 
more happy anniversaries. 

Dist. Class C Tournament 
Starts Tuesday Evening 

The District Ciass C Tourna- 
ment will open Tuesday evening 
in the High School auditorium 
with three games being played. 
At 6:30 the first game brings to- 

gether Atkinson High School vs. 

Springview High; the second 
game, which will begin about 
7:45, brings together Lynch High 
School and St. Mary’s Academy. 
In the final game of the evening, 
which will begin about 9:00 with 
St. Joseph of Atkinson playing 
Spencer High School. 

The quarter finals will be held 
Thursday afternoon, starting at 
1:00, the semi-finals will be held 
Thursday evening starting at 8:00 
and the finals wiil be held Friday 
night, with the first game starting 
promptly at 7:30. 

Gene Stanton, who is with the 
United States Coast Guard, arriv- 

ed here last Friday to visit with 
( 

relatives and friends. He just got 
back from duty in the North At-, 
lantic. 

Clarence Sauser has enlisted in 

the Navy Reserves as a Car- 
penter's Mate 2nd Class. He will 
report for duty Tuesday at Omaha. 

Miss Mildred Stuart spent the 
week-end in Page visiting her 
parents. Mr. and Mrs. O. B Stuart 
and other relatives and frieends. 

Congressman Miller’s Weekly Letter 
Mirage Flats Approved. 

With the approval by the War 
Production Board for resumption 
of work on the Mirage Flats Irri- 
gation Project in my district it 
might be well to outline briefly 
the steps that had to be taken so 
that those who are interested in 
other projects will know just how 
much red tape must be unwound 
before they can get approval. Ap- 
proval by WPB is now based 
wholly on the question of getting 
the greatest food production in 
the shortest time. First, the Re- 
clamation Bureau must determine 
that there is sufficient water, and 
the amount of critical materials 
needed. It must also state that it 
can finish the project within a 

given time. Then the War Food 
Administration must approve it 
on the grounds of the amount and 
kind of food it will produce. If 
there is power involved it must 
have the approval of the Federal 
Power Commission. The War 
Manpower Commission must state 
there is sufficient manpower avail- 
able. If there is not enough man- 

power in the community and 
there are prisoners of war in the 
vicinity the approval of the Army 
must be obtained. Each agency is 
jealous of all the others, so there 
is bickering over authority. The 
“do-gooders” worry about the 
amount of wool in the blankets 
that will cover the prisoners as 
well as about their food and the 
hours of labor. The time it takes 
to get all these factions together 
and the approval of WPB is best 
shown by the fact that Mirage 
Flats was approved just six 
months from the day the hearing 
was held before the WPB Com- 
mittee, and this is a project that 
was more than half completed 
when the President put the stop 
order on it after war was de- 
clared. 

The Nebraska Delegation nas 
been working continuously with 
the several agencies to get the 
feasible projects in Nebraska ap- 
proved. In the Fourth District are 

several, any of which if started at 
once, could be producing addition- 
al food in 1945. Interested groups 
should work together on govern- 
ment agencies in order to get the 
best results. As a member of the 
Committee on Irrigation in the 
House I am doing and will con- 
tinue to do all I can for these 
projects. 

Support Prices Fail to 
Support. 

The administration’s policy of 
support prices under farm pro- 
ducts has broken down so often 
that farmers are losing confidence. 
Under an administrative direct- 
ive, eggs were to have a support 
price that guarantee the producer 
about 39c per dozen until six 
months after hostilities ended. 
While eggs have been selling in 
the east for from 55c to 70c, farm- 
ers in the middle west have been 
getting from 15c to 25c per dozen. 
Support prices on hogs have not 
been effective because of the 
weight limits on which support 
prices were given. Congress au- 
thorized the Department of Agri- 
culture to establish support prices 
at 90% parity. In the recent pro- 
gram announced by the Depart- 
ment support prices were placed 
at 85% of parity on all products 
except cotton and that was fixed 
at 90%. 

r lxing oi ceiling prices on iruits 

and vegetables have been of no 

more help to producers. Onions 
had a price of 5c per pound until 
after they were harvested and out 
of the hands of the producer, when 
the price jumped to 10c. Apples 
moved from 10c per pound to 20c 
after they were harvested. 

Other policies are causing con- 
fusion. The administration is ask- 
ing for 105 million pigs in 1944, 
about 30 million less than the 1943 
crop. It is bound to result in a 

scarcity of pork. One agency is 
asking for fewer milk cows and 
another is demanding more milk. 
One says the chicken crop should 
be cut by 16% while another says 
we must have more eggs. Just 
how are they going to fit these 
together? For almost a year now 

Congress has tried to get action 

I on a bill requiring the President 
to put the food program under 
one head, but the administration 
has kept the bill buried in com- 
mittee. 

Drive For World Peace 
Effective 

The concerted drive being un- 
dertaken by a strong religious de- 
nomination, to impress upon Con- 
gress the fact that many people 
desire this country to co-operate 
with other nations to insure a 

lasting peace built on the founda- 
tion of Christian principles, is 
very effective. Every member of 
Congress realizes that such a 
movement is in progress. This 
drive is the more effective because 
the members know that it is not 
instigated by selfish motives. 

Although members of Congress 
have different ideas as to how 
this greatly desired result can be 
best brought about, the over-1 
whelming majority believe that, 
next to winning the war in the 
shortest possible time, this is their 
most important duty. That this is 
true is evidenced in the large ma- 

jorities with which the House 
passed the Fulbright Resolution 
and the appropriation bill en- 

abling the United Statees to par- 
ticipate in the United Nations Re- 
lief and Rehabilitation Adminis- 
tration. 

On the Blacklist 
iuui rt?pi eaenuiiive in v^on* 

gress, along with all the other 
Nebraska representatives, has 
been placed on the CIO’s black- 
list. CIO’s Committee for Action 
will soon have its three million 
dollars available for the purpose of electing to Congress memoers 
who are sympathetic to what it 
considers tne “views of labor.” It 
is understood that as much as 100 
thousand dollars will be spent in 
certain districts to insure the de- 
feat of members unsympathetic 
to their views. Many leaders of 
this committee have in the past af- 
filiated with communistic groups. 
More will soon be heard about 
this from the Dies Committee. 
Many members of labor organiza- 
tions resent this political action 
and the use of their money, but 
they must pay their assessments 
or be kicked out. If they refuse 
and) are kicked out of their union, 
it means the los’ of their jobs. 

Academy Nominations 
I have made the following nom- 

inations for the three vacancies 
from the Fourth district at the 
military academy at West Point. 
Those who are chosen will enter 
in July, 1944. These young men 
were named on the basis of the 
grades they attained in an exam- 
ination given under the auspices 
of the civil service commission: 

Principal, Theodore Bruce Bue- 
chler of Grand Island; first alter- 
nate, Herbert Owen Brennan of 
O’Neill; second alternate, Richard 
A. Banta of Sidney; third alter- 
nate, Robert A. Thompson of At- 
kinson. 

Principal, John Albert Heyde of 
Scottsbluff; first alternate, Charles 
B. Martin of Kearney: second al- 
ternate, Leonard Bahensky of St. | 
Paul; third alternate, Charles J. 
Humphrey of Sutherland. 

Principal, Donald E. Craig of 
Sidney; first alternate, Charles W. j 
Hill of Kearney; second alternate,; 
Fay E. Fuscher of Irwin; third al-1 
ternate, Robert J. Reed of Morrill. 1 

Five Varieties Of 
Seedlings Exhausted 

Farmers and ranchers who are 

planning to order Clarke McNary 
seedlings this spring will be anx- : 

ious to learn that the supply of 
four varieties of broadleaf seed- 
ligs are already exhausted and 
several others are running low. 
Supplies of Boxelder, Russian 
Olice, Caragana, Soft Maple are 

gone. 
There is a good supply of Red 

Cedar and some other varieties 
left but tarmers who plan on plac- 
ing orders are encouraged to do 
so at once. 

At the present time there have 
been orders for 31,900 seedlings in 
Holt county. This number ranks 
well up to the top of the orders 
in Nebraska. 

BONDS OVSR AMERICA 

Early in the 19th cen- 

tury a storekeeper and 
gristmill operator at 
Henderson, Kentucky, 
took to studying birds 
as an antidote for en- 

nui and added much to 
man’s knowledge of 
ornithology. His name 
is a byword to this 
day. It is John James 
Audubon. 

John Audubon 

Keep On 
Backing Ike Attack 
With War Bonds 

Only the knowledge of 
despotism, destruction, 
killing, maiming brings 

I one to the surface of 
Naziism. It has no place 
for gentle souls; only 
Himmlers, Schleichers, 
von Papens, Heydrichs. 

Bond Drive On Fourth 
War Loan Still Lags 

The Fourth War Loan Drive has 
been extended on E, F and G 
bonds until February 29th. Holt 
county is lagging in the drive, but 
an extension of time will permit 
the citizens of Holt county to go 
over the top in this drive. Tabu- 
lations as of February 15 show 
that about two-thirds of Holt 
county’s quota has been purchas- 
ed to date. 

There is still ample time and 
sufficient funds available in Holt 
county to reach our quota of 
$650,000. We are appealing to the 
farmers and ranchers who have 
not, as yet, invested in any type 
of government securities to prove 
their loyalty to the boys on the 
fighting front and to the Ameri- 
can flag to make this purchase 
within the next ten days. 

If you are an American citizen, 
this is your war as much as it is 
those who are supporting the war 
effort and you cannot conscien- 
tiously sit back and refuse to buy 
bonds or support the financing of 
this war, knowing that in the fu- 
ture when Holt county’s veterans 
return to the homes they have 
been protecting that they will 
have the knowledge of who has 
been supporting their efforts in 
the campaign that they have suc- 

cessfully completed. 
This appeal comes from Holt 

County’s War Finance Committee 
and it is high time to take an in- 
ventory and invest in bonds. So-1 
licitors are urged to renew their 
efforts in order to put Holt county ; 
over the top before the close of: 
this campaign, which would mean | 
that all purchases should be issued 
not later than February 26 so that 
they may clear through the Fed- 
eral Reserve Bank, at the close of 
business on February 29. 

Township yuota 
Antelope _ $ 6,006 
Atkinson 24,193 
Atkinson City 53,014 
Chambers .13,420 
Chambers City 15,236 
Cleveland 7,066 
Coleman 
Conley 
Deloit _ 

Dustin _ 

Emmet 
Emmet Village 
Ewing 
Ewing City 
Fairview .. 

Francis 
Golden 
Grattan 
Green Valley 
Holt Creek 
Inman _ 

Inman Village 
Iowa 
Josie_ 
Lake 
McClure 
O’Neill City 
Paddock 
Pleasantview 
Rock Falls 
Sand Creek _ 8,872 
Saratoga 6,676 
Scott 11.271 
Shamrock 5,577 
Sheridan 14,254 
Shields 
Steel Creek 
Stuart 

7,501 
10,641 
15,828 
5,811 

10,250 
3,497 
6,949 

26,741 
5,258 
4,907 

12,681 
29,023 

8,288 
2,353 

19,318 
8,086 

10,836 
_ 2,197 

8,405 
5,616 

99,469 
15,587 
6,559 

11,271 

Stuart City 
Swan ... 
Verdigris 
Page Village 
Willowdale 
Wyoming 
Total quota Holt Co. 
Total bonds purchased 

15,711 
10,172 
29,413 
29.841 
8,210 

21,008 
13,156 
8,950 

10,875 

rurcnaseci 

$ 418.60 
13,285.85 
41,635.00 

8.522.75 
14,694.50 
2.009.05 
2,294 75 
2.621.85 
5.658.75 
2,163.55 
4.861.75 
2.662.30 
3.228.75 

12,301.75 
5.746.05 
4.126.30 
6.958.85 
8.416.85 
2.681.25 
1,853.00 
6.377.15 
2,718.90 
2.854.30 

572.05 
3.248.25 
2.822.25 

110,495.65 
11,037.15 
3.339.75 
3.489.75 
2,697.60 
4.081.75 
5.308.50 
3.045.75 

11,438.70 
9,566.70 
9.674.50 

12,080.25 
12,765.55 

521.90 
14.083 00 
15,462.90 

944.30 
5.137.15 

650,000.00 
399,905.25 

Ramold-Peter Wedding 
At Emmet Tuesday A. M. 

A very pretty wedding took 
place in the Church of Epiphaney 
in Emmet on Tuesday morning, 
February 15, at 9:30 o’clock, when 
Miss Mary Ramold, daughter of 
Mr. and Mrs. Joe Ramold, of^ At- 
kinson, became the bride of Cyril 
Peter, son of Mr. and Mrs. Frank 
Peter. The double ring ceremony 
was performed by Rev. Vaclav 
Kovar. 

The bride wore a long white 
crepe dress with a sweetheart 
neckline, with a finger tip veil 
and carried a boquet of white 
carnations. 

The groom wore a dark navy 
blue suit and his buttonnier was a 

white carnation. 
The hrides oniy auenuani was 

Tessie Ramold, sister of the bride, 
and she wore a long ice blue, ray- 
ontafTeta dress and carried a 

boquet of white carnations. 
The groom’s attendant was 

George Peter, brother of the 
groom, who wore a: dark suit and 
his buttonnier was a white car- 

nation. 
The wedding dinner was served 

at the bride’s home for the clergv 
and relatives. A three-tier wed- 
ding cake was the center decor- 
ation, with a minature bride and 
groom on top. The cake was 

baked by the bride’s sister, Anne 
Ramold and cousin, Rita Liable. 
The newly weds entertained their 
relatives and friends at a wedding 
dance in the Memorial hall in At- 
kinson. The happy young people 

i will make their home on a farm 
three and a half miles south of 
O’Neill. 

These young people have the 
sincere and heartfelt congratu- 
lations of a host of friends for a 

long and happy married life. 

Miss Effie Bloomfield is a new 

employee at the Elite Cafe, start- 

ling work last Monday. | 

John Sullivan Files For 
State Legislature 

John Sullivan, who represented 
this district on the County Board 
for about twenty years, until his 
defeat at the last general election, 
filed the first of the week for the 
nomination from this district for 
the unicamerial legislature, a po- 
sition now held by Senator Tony 
Asimus. Mr. Asimus declares 
that press of business matters 
forces him to forego running for 
re-election this fall. Mr. Sullivan 
is the first candidate to file for 
the position. Since his retirement 
from office he has been working 
at defense work in Grand Island. 

Telephone Co. Employees 
Liberal War Bond Buyers 

A local bond drive, being con- 
ducted jointly by the Northwest- 
ern Union of Telephone Workers 
and the management of the North- 
western Bell Telephone Company 
in an effort to do their share dur- 
ing the Fourth War Bond Drive, 
to date has produced the follow- 
ing results for the period January 
1 to February 15: 

Number of employees partici- 
pating, 12. Cash purchase of new 
bonds (Series) $525.00. 

In addition to the above cash 
purchases, the above employees 
have received, because of continu- 
ing payroll deductions in excess of 
an average of 10% of each em- 

ployee’s pay, bonds (Series E) 
amounting to the total of $550.00 
during the period of January 1 
to February 15. This represents a 

grand total of $1,075.00. 
Pep meetings, war bond posters, 

and one mass rally provided the 
stimulus for this excellent show- 
ing. 

In addition to the employees’ 
purchases, the Northwestern Bell 
Telephone Company’s allotment 
to Holt county of $1,800.00 and the 
American Telephone & Telegraph 
Company’s allotment to Holt 
county1 of $1,525.00 makes a grand 
total of $4,400.00, as the telephone 
industry’s contribution to the 4th 
War Bond Drive in Holt county. 

Chambers Boy 
Killed In Action 

Word was received Friday in 
Chambers by Mr. and Mrs. Dan 
Crandall and Mr. and Mrs. Clair! 
Grimes of the death of Pvt. Calvin 
Crandall in Italy on January 7. 

Mrs. Calvin Crandall of Omaha i 
had notified the two families, j 
after receiving a telegram 'from I 
the War Department. 

His wife had received a mess- 

age regarding him about ten days 
previously, that stated that he was 

‘‘missing in action.” He was serv- 

ing as a machine gunner with the 
Fifth Army in Italy at that time. 

The people of the south country, 
as well as all over Holt county, 
deeply sympathize with Mrs. | 
Crandall, formerly Lela Grimes, 
his parents, Mr. and Mrs. Dan 
Crandall and his two sisters, Mrs. 
Richard Smith of Chambers and 
Miss Luella Crandall of San Diego, 
California. 

St. Mary’s Cardinals 
Defeat Newport High 

The St. Mary’s Cardinals bas- 
ketball team rang up their 
eleventh win of the season Wed- 
nesday when they defeated New- 
port High 39 to 15 in the local 
gym. The Cardinals started with 
a bang and rang up a 15-1 first j 
quarter margin and from then on 

they substituted frequently 
throughout the game. Campbell 
was high point man for the win- 
ners scoring nine points with j 
Froelich and Wilson tied for 
second with six points each. An- 
derson was high point man of the 
game having scored ten points. 

The St. Mary’s Cardinals second 
team won themselves another 
game with a 15-1 win. Bill Marne 
and Joe Ryan were high point 
men on the second team each hav- 
ing four points to their credit. 

St. Mary’s next home game is 
with the O’Neill High this Friday 
night and the Cardinals will be 
trying hard to avenge an earlier 
17-16 defeat given them by the I 
Eagles. It will be a good game. , 

Food For Victory 
Loans Announced 

J. O. Walker, Field Supervisor! 
for the Emergency Crop and Feed 
Loan Office, announced today that 
"Food for Victory” loans are avail- 
able. 

The loans furnish credit to 
farmers to pay expenses and pur- j 
chase supplies needed to plant, 
produce and harvest special war 

goal crops, victory home gardens, j 
regular cash crops, feed and soil; 
conservation crops and purchase j 
or produce feed to increase pro-! 
duction of vitally needed farm! 
products. The loans can be used 
to purchase seed, feed, tractor fuel 
and oil, machinery repairs, fertil- 
izer and other supplies. 

To obtain information on where 
to make application, farmers 
should get in touch with the 
County Agent, AAA County Com- 
mittee or Township Committee- 
man or write to J. O. Walker, 
O’Neill, Nebr. 

A. M. First Class Owen David- 
son, U. S. Navy, arrived Saturday 
from Pensacola, Florida, to spend 
his leave visiting his mother, Mrs. 
James Davidson and other rela- 
tives and friends here. 

Fifteenth I)ist. Members 
Of Bar Hold Meeting 

The members of the Fifteenth 
Judicial District Bar Association 
held their annual meeting in the 
court room in this city last Sat- 
urday afternoon.All the members 
of the bar from the counties of 
Holt, Boyd, Brown and Rock 
counties were in attendance, the 
only absentees being the two 
members of the Association from 
Keya Paha county. The meeting 
was presided over by President 
Ben Burritt of Ainsworth. 

The following officers were 
elected for the ensuing year; J. 
J. Harrington, O’Neill, president; 
William C. Smith, Long Pine, vice 
president; Arthur Weber, Bassett, 
seereta ry treas urer. 

Judge Harrington is celebrating 
his fiftieth year as a practicing 
attorney in this Judicial District, 
which makes him one of the oldest 
—in years of service—practicing 
attorneys in his section of the 
state. The fifty years, with the 
exception of two terms he served 
as District Judge in the old Dis- 
trict, has been spent in practicing 
in this section of Nebraska. Fifty 
years is a long time for a man to 
be engaged in any line of business 
or profession but the Judge 
seems to enjoy the life for he is 
still going strong. 

In the evening a banquet was 
served the members of the associ- 
ation in the dining room of the 
Golden Hotel, where the wants of 
the inner man was satisfied. 
Judge Lyle Jackson and Senator 
Elmer Rakow, both of Neligh, 
were guests at the banquet. Judge 
Mounts served as toastmaster and 
several of the speakers on this oc- 
casion complimented Judge Har- 
rington for the many years he 
had spent as a member of the bar 
of this city and state and ex- 

pressed the wish and hope that he 
would be able to continue in prac- 
tice for many years to come. 

Information From 
OPA District Office 

Processed Foods: Green stamps 
G, H and J in Book 4 good Janu- 
ary 1 through February 20; green 
stamps K, L and M in Book 4 good 
February 1 through March 20. 

Meats and Fats: Brown stamp 
V in Book 3 valid January 23 thru 
February 26; brown stamp W in 
Book 3 valid January 30 through 
February 26; brown stamp X in 
Book 3 valid February 6 through 
February 26; brown stamp Y in 
in Book 3 valid February 13 thru 
March 20;brown stamp Z in Book 
3 valid February 20 thru March 
20. Look for the new retail ceil- 
ing price list in your butcher shop. 

Sugar: Stamp No. 30 in Book 4 
good for 5 pounds January 16 thru 
March 31. Stamp No. 40 in Book 
4 good for 5 pounds canning sugar 
February 1 through February 28. 

Shoes: Stamp No. 18 in Book 1 
good for one pair indefinitely. Air- 
plane Stamp No. 1 in Book 3 good 
for one pair indefinitely. 

Fuel Oil: Period No. 3 coupons 
good November 30 for 10 gallons 
per unit through March 31. Per- 
iod No. 4 coupons good February 
8 for 10 gallons per unit through 
September 30. Period No. 5 cou- 

pons good February 8 for 10 gal- 
lons per unit thru September 30. 

Gasoline: No. 10 coupons in A 
book good for 3 gallons each thru 
March 21. B2 and C2 supple- 
mental ration coupons good for 5 
gallons each. 

Tire Inspections: For C book 
holders, must be comnleted by 
February 28. For B book holders, 
also by February 28. For A book 
holders, by March 31. 

Token program begins Febru- 
ary 27: Under the token program 
all blue and red .stamps in War 
Ration Book 4 will be worth 10 
point' each— a’l tokens will be 
worth 1 Doint each. Red tokens 
will be given in change for both 
brown and red meat stamps from 
February 27 through March 20. 
Blue tokens will be given in 
change for both green and blue 
processed t^od stamos during the 
same period. The following stamps 
become valid February 27: 

Meats and Fats: RA RB and RC 
in Book 4. Proeessed vo'->r,r'' 8 A, 
8E, 8C 8D and 8E in Book 4. 

Prominent Atkinson 
Business Man Dead 

Nicholas Donat Segar, one of 
the pioneers of Atkinson anil for 
the past 35 years one of its prom- 
inent business men, passed away 
at his home in Atkinson la%t 
Thursday morning. He was 77 
years of age and had been suffer- 
ing from a heart ailment for 
some time. He. is survived by one 

son, John, of Omaha: two broth- 
ers, Max of Stuart and Paul of At- 
kinson. Funeral services were held- 
last Monday morning from St. 
Joseph’s Catholic church and bur- 
ial in the Atkinson cemetery. 

Subscriber Says The Frontier 
Getting Better Week By Week. 

In sending a renewal of her 
subscription to The Frontier for 
another vear. Mr.s. George Herzog 
of Chambers says: “I enjoy read- 
ing it very much, and think the 
paper is Petting better each week.” 
Thanks Mrs. Herzog. The Fron- 
tier staff are trying to give the 
people of Holt county a good read- 
able newspaoer. with items of in- 
terest throughout the county and 
we are nleased to learn that our 

efforts are appreciated by at least 
some of our readers. 
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