
Cards Whip Lynch, Lose to Chambers 

50-YARD FLIP 
HELPS STUART 

Ewing Tigers Buckle 6-13 
in Heated Battle with 

Stuart Bronchos 

STUART—50-yard pass, flip- 
ped by Stuart’s Back Schaeffer, 
helped the Stuart Broncos upset 
the Ewing Tigers under the lights 
here Friday night, score 13-6. 

Coach Marvin Miller’s Ewing 
aggregation, fresh from a 7-0 win 
over Neligh in the season’s open- 
er, buckled under a savage bar- 
rage of passes and elusive run- 

ning. 
Ewing sustained a loss early 

in the game wtien Right Guard 
Fry was chased off the field for 
unnecessary roughness. 

> 
It was Stuart’s first game of 

the season. 

Mr. and Mrs. George McCarthy 
and Mr. and Mrs. Ralph Walker 
left Friday on a business trip to 
Omaha. They returned Monday, 
day. 

Mrs. Rhoba Asher, of Santa 
Clara, Calif., arrived Saturday to 
visit her neice Mrs. Levi Fuller. 

Try a FRONTIER want ad! 
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William W. Griffin 
ATTORNEY 

First National Bank Bldg. 
O'NEILL 

Insurance Bonds 
GEO. C. ROBERTSON 

O'Neill. Nebr. 
Office: %-block north of 

First National Bank 
Real Estate Loans 

W. F. FINLEY, M. D. 
^ OFFICE PHONE: 28 

First National Bank Bldg. 
O'NEILL 

DBS. BROWN 8c FRENCH 
Office Phone: 77 

Complete X-Ray Equipment 
Glasses Correctly Fitted 

Residence 1 Dr. Brown, 228 
Phones ( Dr. French. 241 

O'NEILL SPANKS 
PLAINY1EW 19-7 

3 Sustained Drives Enable 
Eagles to Triumph 

in Opener 
Three sustained drives, one in 

each the first, second and fourth 

quarters, enabled the O'Neill 
Eagles to trample the visiting 
Plainview high grid team 19-7 
under the lights here Friday 
night It was the season’s in- 

augural for both elevens. 
Coach F. E. Saindon’s Eagles 

wient to work immediately after 
the kickoff. Several fumbles, 
caused by early season ragged- 
ness, cost possession of the ball 
when drives appeared to be un- 

derway. When the Eagles grab- 
bed possession of the ball for the 
third time, they marched 60 
vards to score, with Halfback 
Tibbetts, O’Neill high’s 120- 

pound flyweight, squirming off 
right tackle from the 15. Tibbetts 
scored again in the second frame 
on a similar ‘T’ formation play 
from the 4. The second counter 
culminated a 50-yard drive. 

O’Neill high was leading 13-0 
at halftime. 

O’Neill’s third touchdown re- 

sulted from a 30-yard flip, Tib- 
betts to Left End Bob Mathews, 
who was alone in the end zone. 

Mathews and Right Tackle Ar- 
dell Bright stood out for Sain- 
don’s crew on the defensive, 
while Plainview’s Halfback Bill 
Bivens carried on like a one-man 

gang for the visitors. 

'Little Ragged/ 
The Eagles were given no re- 

spite this week, despite their de- 
cisive opening win over Plain- 
view, as Coach Saindon bore 
down in rehearsals to iron out 
some of the early season rough 
spots. “They were a little ragged 
at times.” Saindon said in sum- 

marizing the Eagles’ per- 
forance. 

O’Neill high will go to Bassett 
tomorrow (Friday) and on the 
following Friday will play at Ew- 
ing. 

LIFE WITH CITY CLUB 
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| SPECIAL CALF and YEARLING 

A-U-C-T-I-O-N-S II 
111 ♦♦ 

fci 22 

THE ATKINSON LIVESTOCK MARKET I 
ATKINSON, NEBRASKA 

Will Be Held on the Following Dates: 

MONDAYS: Oct. 7th — Oct. 21st — Nov. 4th i 
Starting at 1 o'clock P. M. 

DUE TO POPULAR DEMAND, we are again j 
holding “Special Calf and Yearling Auc- j; 

tions.” These were discontinued during the war 

years, but will be an annual event from }: 
I now on. We will hold three Special Sales, all on j 

Mondays—October 7, October 21, November 4. \ 
ALL CALVES WILL BE SOLD in the order in I 

which they are listed, so list them early j 
for whatever date you want to sell them on and j 
assure yourself a good position in the auction. 

ALL OF THESE SALES will be extensively ad- j 
vertised and we will stake our reputation h 

that they will be among the most successful calf fj 
and yearling auctions that will be held in the | ; 

Sandhills. 
WRITE or CALL us for further information ! j 

ATKINSON LIVESTOCK MARKET 
PHONE: Atkinson 89 

p. S.—We will hold our regular cattle auction EVERY 
TUESDAY, as before, but will discontinue the practice of |: 
giving preference to the selling of calves on that day, so list j: 

your calves for one of these special events. t: 

2 HOLT GRIDDERS 
AT WAYNE STATE 

WAYNE — Two Holt county 
gridders are counted on the 
Wayne State Teachers’ college 
1940 grid squad They are Ver- 
non (Pete) Kozisek, < 

former 
Stuart high athlete, wfiose career 

at Wayne was interrupted by 
Uncle Sam, and Archie Bright, of 
O’Neill. 

Kozisek is a 200-pound back. 
His experience is expected to 
carry him a long Ways with the 
Wildcats this season. Bright tips 
the beam at 180 pounds, stands 
six feet one mch, and may be 
used at a tackle position. Kozisek 
is a letterman, Bright is not. 

KFAB TO BROADCAST 
ALL HUSKER GAMES 

Radio station KFAB at Lincoln 
will broadcast play-by-play de- 
scriptions of all University of 
Nebraska football games this 
season. The broadcasts will be 
sponsored by the Champlin Re- 
fining Company. 

The Now Deal Oil Company, 
owned by Tony and Carl Asimus, 
handle the Champlin products 
here. 

40 Girls Join Pep Club 
at St. Mary’s Academy 

Over 40 girls have already 
joined St. Mary’s academy pep 
club. The sponsor this year is 
Sister Emelia, who is taking Sis- 
ter Laurisso’s place. 

The cheerleaders are Maxine 
Golden,Alice Biglin and Betty 
Gallagher. The junior leaders 
elected were Kathryn Golden, 
Marjorie Troshynski, Ua Mae 
Carter, of Cody and Darlene 
Steeler, of Clearfield, S. D. 

The uniforms are red and 
white. 

General Motors Far 
Below 1941 Output 

Total passenger car production 
by General Motors in the United 
States this year to date is 384,250 
compared with 1,397,849 for the 
same period in 1941, according 
to figures made public Wednes- 
day by the General Motors 
Corporation. 

Meanwhile, truck production 
remained below weekly levels 
last week due mainly to a virtual 
shutdown by tho GMC truck and 
coach division, caused by a crit- 
ical shortage of cab sheet steel. 

Group Holds Dinner; 
Works on Church — 

The Young Adult Fellowship 
group of the Methodist church 
met in th echurch parlors Wed- 
nesday for a covered dish, and 
the spent the evening varnishing 
the woodwork inside the church. 

O’NEILL LOCALS 
Mrs. Robert E. Gallagher left 

Sunday for a few weeks visit 
with her son and daughter-in- 
law, Mr. and Mrs. John R. Gal- 
lagher and infant son, Michael 
Eugene, at Omaha. While there, 
she also expects to spend some 

time with her sister, Mrs. J. A. 
Frenking. 

Mrs. Fred Grage returned Fri- 
day after spending a week her 
mother, Mrs. John Carr, at Sioux 
City. 

Robert Moore and Bill O’Con- 
nell departed Tuesday for Wash- 
ington, D. C., where they plan 
to enter Georgetown university. 

John L. McNanamy returned 
Saturday after nearly two years 
in the Army. He was separated 
at Ft. Knox, Ky. He is with his 
wife here at the home of Mrs. 
Susan Kubischeck. 

MISS THOSE 
ROCKS AND 
SHOALS! 

Chart a SAFE course to Debt- 
Free Farm Ownership by financ- 
ing your farm land with a long- 
term, low-interest Land Bank 
Loan through the 

NATIONAL FARM 
LOAN ASSOCIATION 

Lyle P. Dierks. Sec.-Treaa. 
O'Neill. Nsbr. 

Low FARM Long 
Interest LOANS Term 

* 

Break Even in Season’s 
First Tests; Injuries 

Hamper Play 
— 

The St Mary’s Cardinals broke 
even in thei# first two tilts of the 
season, walloping Lynch 43-6 at 

Lynch Friday, and then drop-1 
ping a 12-31 decision to Chamb- 
ers here Tuesday night 

— 

Tomjack's 3 Counters 
Help Wallop Lynch — 

LYNCH—Capt. Jerry Tomjack, 
St. Mary’s swivcL—hipped half- 
back, romped to three touch- 
downs here Friday as the 
academy spanked Lynch high 
43-6 in the season’s opener for 
both six-man grid teams In ad- 
dition, Tomjack helped set up 
several other counters With long 
runs. 

Halfback Dick McNichols scor- 

ed twice, and Quarterback Shorty 
Miles and Back Pat Hickey each 
each crossed the goal once to 
boost the Card’s total. 

The Cards, tutored by Rev. R. 
J. Lisco, had things pretty much 
their own way throughout. 

Chambers Spurts in 
4th to Win — 

The Chambers high gridders 
turned on the heat in the fourth 
quarter here Tuesday night to 
down a n injury riddled St. 
Mary’s club 12-31. The count 
was tied at 12-all at intermission 
and the match was fairly even 

until the last frame, when the 
visitors loosed their backs with a 

series of long runs that netted 
three touchdowns 

Rev. Lisco’s club was seriously 
hampered by injuries. In addit- 
tioi> to the loss of Jim Donohoe 
and Jim MParne, who are out for 
the season. Capt. Tomjack was 

limited to signal-calling because 
of a bad charleyhorse, and 
Center Ed Hynes was having 
trouble with a bad wrist. Dick 
McNichols injured a knee in the 
fourth quarter. 

McNichols scored both of the 
Cards’ counters, one in the first 
quarter and the other in the sec- 

ond. Chambers’ Left Halfback 
Bernard Cooke sparked the vis- 
itors. 

The St. Mary’s band staged a 

demonstration a t intermission. 
Patty the Goat, the Pep club’s 
mascot, also staged a demonsta- 
tion when she stole the spotlight 
by crossing the Chambers goal 
line. 

New Date for 
Sacred Heart Tilt — 

The date for St. Mary’s tilt with 
Sacred Heart of Norfolk, at Nor- 
folk, has been setback from Sun- 
day, October 6th, to Thursday, 
October 3rd. The band will 
accompany the Cards and par- 
ticipate In Sacred Heart’s home- 
coming activities. 

This is Sacred Heart’s first try 
at football. Unless there are 
more injuries in practice, the 
Cards will be back a t full 
strength. 

CHAMBERS NEWS 
CHAMBERS — Mrs. Ralph 

Cudaback, of Central City, visit- 
ed her parents, Mr and Mrs. Er- 
vin Hillasos and family last week 
and attended the fair here. 

Ralph Cooke, Celesta Gleed, 
and Mrs. Frank Porter, ac- 

companied Mr. Porter to Grand 
Island Thursday. Ralph drove 
a truck down and back. 

Mr. and Mrs. Clarence Thorin 
and family, of Neligh, visited rel- 
atives at Chambers and attended 
the fair here. 

Mrs. Marilyn Mille and a girl 
friend, of Shreveport, La., are 

guests of Mrs. Mille’s parents, 
Mr. and Mrs. Earl Medcalf 

Mrs. Bertha Doherty, of Lex- 
ington, is spending two weeks 
visiting her sister, Mrs. Jake 
Hoffman, and other relatives. 

Mr. and Mrs. Jim Kirkland, of 
Atkinson, visited Sunday in the 
A. A. Walter home. 

Mr. and Mrs. Gilbert Leiswald 
and son, Lester, of Meadow 
Grove, visited Sunday at the 
home of his parents, Mr. and 
Mrs. Emil Leiswald, sr. 

Mr. and Mrs. Wilbur Edwards 
and family and Mr. and Mrs. 
Raymond Edwards and family, 
of Cushing, visited their mother, 
Mrs. Valo Edwards and attended 
the fair here last week. 

Donald Edwards, of Ord, spent 
last week visiting relatives at 
Chambers. 

Mr. and Mrs. Lee Mitchell and 
sons, and Miss Loraine Mitchell, 
of Hastings, and their grand- 
mother, Mrs. Short, of Burr Oak, 
Kans., visited in the Carl 
Mitchell and Frank Tracy home 
last week. 

Visit at Lynch — 

Mrs. Floyd Long and Mrs. 
Lloyd Collins and Curtis spent 
Saturday at Lynch visiting their 
grandmother, Mrs. M. A. Long. 

DANCE 
At 

SUMMERLAND 
Ewing 

SUNDAY, Sept. 29 
Music by 

BUS PRETTYMAN 
and His Orchestra 

Roller skating every Friday 
night and Sunday afternoon 

PAGE NEWS 
Hurst Home Scene 
of Club Dinner — 

PAGE — Members of the Con- 
tract Bridge club entertoined at 
a 7 o’clock dinner Friday at the 
Earl Hurst home, honoring Mrs. 
Esmond Weber, who leaves for 
Denver, Colo., this week. Guests 
of the club were Mrs. E. E. Al- 
len, Mrs. Jerry Lamason and 
Miss Alice French. Mrs. E. E. 
Walker received high score and 
Mrs. A. L. Dorr second high. 

OTHER PAGE NEWS 
Mr. and Mrs. Roy Stewart re- 

turned home Thursday from 
Rawlins, Wyo., where they had 
attended funeral services for 
their daughter, Mrs. Earling 
Walby. 

William Reige, sr., of Norfolk, 
visited his sons at Page last 
week. 

Irvin Christen of Newport, vis- 
ited Sunday with Miss Alma 
Borden and at the Walter Chris- 
ton home. 

Mr. and Mrs. Francis Brandt, 
of Atkinson, spent Sunday with 
her parents, Mr. and Mrs. Bryan 
Stevens. Ronnie Parks, who 
had spent several days with his 
aunt and uncle, retui'ned to his 
home at Page. 

Mr. and Mts. Leo Wiseman 
drove to Fremont Sunday to get 
their son, who had spent several 
days there with his grandmother, 
Mrs. E. E. Wilber. 

Mr. and Mrs. Herbert Stein- 
berg and daughter, Naomi, and 
Mrs. Elsie Cork spent Sunday at 
the the Harold Cork home at 

Spencer. 
Mr. and Mrs. Bert Finley re- 

turned Wednesday after spend- 
ing four weeks at Ft. Collins, 
Colo. 

Mr. and Mrs. Charles Sorenson 
and daughter and Mrs. Nona 
Bedford left September 18 for 
Ohio, where will visit Mr. and 
Mrs. Ross Taylor and Mr. and 
Mrs. Jimmie Smith and family. 
They were accompanied as far 
as Marshalltown, la., by Mrs. 
Soren Sorenson, who •will visit 
relatives there 

INMAN NEWS 

Miss Sadie Harte, of California, 
is visiting relatives here 

Mrs. Harvey Tompkins attend- 
ed a Methodist church school 
meeting in Grand Island Mon- 
day and Tuesday. 

Orville Hansen and Merle 
Milne, of Creighton, returned 
from a three week’s trip to Cali- 
fornia and spent a few days at 
the Clarence Hansen home on 
their return trip home. 

Mrs. Eva Murten is staying 
with Mr. and Mrs. G. E. Moor 
while Mrs. Louise Anspach is 
taking a few days rest. 

Mr. and Mrs. Robert Stevens 
and family recently left for a 

trip in western Nebraska. 
Mr. and Mrs. Clarence Hansen 

and Miss Murl Keyes returned 
Friday from a trip in western 
Nebraska, Wyoming and the 
Black Hills. 

Visit at Bancroft — 

Mr. and Mrs. Edward Donlin 
and daughter, Mary Margaret, of 
Bancroft, spent Sunday visiting 
at the home of Mr. and Mrs. 
Thomas A. Greene. 

Visit At Kemper — 

Mr. and Mrs. C. J. Gatz spent 
the weekend with son, Cadet 
Clinton J. (Jack) Gatz, at Kemp- 
er Military school, Boonville, Mo. 
«" 11 .. 11 '■ 

Robert Schulz Returns 
from Denver — 

Robert Shulz rteurned Tues- 
day from Denver, Colo., after a 

week’s vacation there. 

SJ* R.tt Shriner 
Theft GENERAL INSURANCE Plate Glass 

Liability O'Neill Nebraska LIto Stock 
Automobile PHONE 106 Farm Property 

Wind & Tornado. Trucks & Tractor, Personal Property 
REAL ESTATE. LOANS. FARM SERVICE, RENTALS 

SET YOUR SIGHTS 
It takes 

planning 
to achieve 

a goal 
• I 

Some young men know what they want and plan for It. Other* are 

still looking for their niche. The new Regular Army can help both. 

Perhaps you want to go to college but can’t afford it. If you 
enlist in the Army, you’ll get your chance. Honorably discharged 
after a three-year enlistment, you are eligible for 48 months of edu- 
cation at any college, trade, or business school for which you can 

qualify. The Government will pay your tuition, laboratory fees, 
etc., up to $500 per ordinary school year, plus $65 a month living 
allowance—$90 a month if you have dependents. 

If you haven’t found your spot, an Army enlistment offers you 
training in any of 200 trades and skills. You leave the service eligible ./ 
for further training at the best civilian schools. 

You can assure yourself of the benefits of the GI Bill of 
Rights if you enter the Army on or before October 5, 1946. 
Sec your nearest Army Recruiting Station for details. 

HIGHLIGHTS OF REGULAR ARMY ENLISTMENT 

1. Enlistments for 1 Vi, 2 or 3 years. 
(1-year enlistments permitted for 
men now in the Army with 6 or more 
months of service.) 
2. Enlistment age from 18 to 34 
years inclusive (17 with parents' 
consent) except for men now in 
Army, who may reenlist at any age, 
and former service men depending 
on length of service. 
3. A reenlistment bonus of $50 for 
each year of active service since such 
bonus was last paid, or since last 
entry into service, provided reenlist- 
ment is within 3 months after last 
honorable discharge. 

4. A furlough for men who reenlist 
within 20 days. Full details of other 
furlough privileges con be obtained 
from Recruiting Officers. 
5. Mustering-out pay (based upon 
length of service) to all men who 
are discharged to enlist or reenlist. 
6. Option to retire at half pay for 
the rest of your life after 20 years’ 
service—increasing to three-quarters 
pay after 30 years' service. All pre- 
vious active federal military service 
counts toward retirement. 
7. Choice of branch of service and 
overseas theater (of those still open) 
on 3-year enlistments. 

NEW, HIGHER PAY FOR ARMY MEN 

In Addition to Food, Lodging, 
Clothes and Medical Care 

In Addition to Column One 
■t the Right: 20% In- 
creasa for Service Over- 
seas. ,50% Increase if Mem- 
ber of Flying or Glider 
Crews. 5% Increase in Pay 
for Each 3 Years of Service 
May Be Added. 

Master Sergeant 
or First Sergeant 

Technical Sergeant 
Staff Sergeant 
Sergeant 
Corporal 
Private First Class 
Private 

MONTHLY ,, 
RETIREMENT 

Starting |NCOME AFTER: 
■oia Pay 

Par 20 Yaora" 30 Yuan’ 
Month Service Service 

£165.00 £107.25 £185.63 
135.00 87.75 151.88 
115.00 74.75 129.38 
100.00 65.00 112.50 
90.00 58.50 101.25 
80.00 52.00 90.00 
75.00 48.75 84.38 

Jtfen toi "Warrlort of Peace," "Voice of 
fhe Army," "Proudly We Hall," and Mo/or 
Football Broodcath on your radio. 

ENLIST NOW AT YOUR NEAREST 

U.S. ARMY RECRUITING STATION 

ROOM 301. POSTOFFICE BLDG.. NORFOLK. NEB. 
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OPENING GAME 
SEPT 28 

NEBRASKA 
MINNESOTA 
(at Minneapolis) 
HEAR THE GAME 
PLAY-BY-PLAY 

BROADCAST DIRECT 
FROM THE 

PLAYING FIELD 

New Deal Oil Co. 
WEST O’NEILL PHONE 363 


