
l^tty June Wyant, 
, Lawrence Bourne Wed 

Miss Betty June Wyant, a ! 

daughter of Mr. and Mrs. A. R. 
i Wyant, of O’Neill, and Lawrence 

Bourne, son of Mrs. Marie 
Bourne, of Atkinson, were mar- 
ried Saturday at Neligh in an 
informal double-ring ceremony 
at the Methodist church parson- 
age. Rev. Dawson Parks, church 

, pastor, officiated. 
Mr. and Mrs. Donald Asher, of 

r O’Neill, attended the bridal pair.' 
Mrs. Asher and the bride are sis- 
ters. Mrs. A. R. Wyant was also 
present. 

The newlyweds will reside on 
a farm near O’Neill, where Mr. 
Bourne will be employed by 
James Corkle. Mrs. Bourne 

I graduated from O’Neill high 
school with the class of 1946, and 
Mr. Bourne is a recent dischargee 
from the Navy. 

It pays to read The Frontier 
Want Ads. 

I 

Fasrbanks-Morse 
LIGHT PLANTS 

Now you can have the com- j 
fort, convenience, and labor- 
saving aid of electric light 
and power. Fairbanks-Morse 
Light Plants are again avail- 
able. They’re dependable, 
long-lived, and cost very 
little to operate. 

We have the size and type 
^/that will serve you best... or 

f can get it for you promptly. 
f Come in and let us help 

analyze your needs. 

MARCELLUS 
Implement Co. 

O’NEILL 
m -.....— —. 

Teresa Ramold 
An Emmet Bride 

EMMET—A pretty wedding 
was solemnized at the Church of 
the Epiphany at Emmet on May 
28 when Miss Teresa Ramold, 
daughter of Mrs. Anne Ramold 
and the late Joseph Ramold, be- 
came the bride of Raymond 
Schaaf, son of Mr. and. Mrs. Mike 
Schaaf, of Stuart. The single- 
ring ceremony was performed by 
Rev. John O’Brien, church pas- 
tor. • 

The bride \*es attired in a 

floor-length gown of white-satin 
with a short train and sweetheart 
neckline. Her fingertip veil was 

held in place with a tiarra. She 
carried a bouquet of pink and 
white carnations. 

The bride’s sister, Miss Anne 
Ramold, acted as bridesmaid. She 
wore a floor-length gown of p>nk 
net with a short matching veil.1 
She also carried a bouquet of 
pink and white carnations. 

Raymond Timmerman, of Stu- 
art, was bestman. Both the 
bridegroom and his attendant 
wore dark blue suits with white j 
carnation butonnieres. 

After the ceremony, a wedding 
breakfast was served at the; 
bride’s home. 

Mr. and Mrs. Schaaf will make 1 

their heme on a farm nenr Stuart. 

Miss Ava Jones a 

June 1st Bride 

Miss Ava Jones, daughter of 
Mr. and Mrs. Preston Jones, and 
R. V. Crumley, son of Mrs. Jose- 
phine Crumley, of Page, were 

united in marriage at O’Neill, on 

Saturday. June 1st a-* 11 o’clock 
at the Presbyterian manse with 
Rev. Kenneth S. Scott, church 
pastor, officiating. 

The bride is a graduate of the 
O’Neill high school, finishing | 
with the class of 1941 end has 
since been teaching in Holt coun- 

ty- 
The bridegroom resides near , 

Page, where he has been engaged 
in farming 

The couple was attended by 
Mr. and Mrs. A. T. Crumley, 
brother and sister-in-law of the 
bridegroom. 

Immediately following the cer- 

emony, the bridal party left for 
the home of the bride’s parents, 
where a on^ o’clock luncheon 
was served to the immediate rel- 
atives. 

Mr. and Mrs. Crumley will be 
at home on a farm near Page af- 
ter a week’s wedding trip to the 
Black Hills. 

CHAMBERS — The Lutheran 
church opened its vacation Bible 
school Monday morning and will 
continue it for two weeks. 

■■ ■ ■ ■■■ ■ 11 —i»» 

K 
„ 

Headquarters 
for Long-Wearing Clothes 

for Outdoor Work 

OTHER MAKES 

Tan Only 
Sanforized and 

Fast Color 

QO QO 
SHIRTS_ 

QO QO 
PANTS_jO'UL. 

We now have an 

ample supply of 

SANFORIZED fan 

coveralls. 

SIZES: 38-to-46 

PaMI 
DICKIE 

QUALITY 

SHIRTS 

and 

PANTS 

Sanforized Sunlan 
ARMY TWILL 
Per Garment 

Tan and Postman 
Blue, Sanforized 

vat-dyed 
HERRINGBONE 

Per Garment 

!! V 

Inquire About Our 

6065 WORK SHOE 
A Bearcat for Sturdy Wear 

$3.98 
1 - 
I 1 
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Constance Biglin, 
Dale French Wed 

Here Saturday 
Among the most charming 

weddings in O’Neill this spring ! 

was the marriage of the popular 1 

daughter of the Frank J. Biglin's, 
Miss Constance Biglin, who be- 
came the bride of Dale French on 

Saturday morning, June 1st, at 8 

o’clock, in St. Patrick’s Catholic 
cnurch, with Rt Rev. J. C. Mc- 
Namara officiating. 

The bride, a member of a 

prominent pioneer family of O’- 
Neill, grew up in this city, at- 
tended St. Mary’s Academy, and 
is a graduate nurse of St. Vin- 
cent’s hospital of Sioux City. She 
has been employed as a member 
of the nursing staff of St. Eliz- 
abeth’s hospital in Lincoln for 
the past eight months. 

For her wedding she wore a 
traditional bridal gown of white, 
fashioned of embroidered slipper 
satin and lace. The fitted bod- 
ice of the satin was made with 
a small peplum, and tiny self- 
covered buttons down the back. 
The sleeves were long and fitted 
and the neck was cut in the 
smart sweetheart line. The long 
skirt of conventionally patterned i 

lace, ended in a long square pan- | 
eled train, lace edged, with lov- | 
ers’ knots of lace decorating the 
panel ends The bridal veil was 
of net, fingertip length, and held 
by a coronet of pearl orange j 
blossoms. Single blossoms were 

caught in the folds of the veil at 
intervals. She carried a bridal 
bouquet of white roses. 

Sister Is Attendant 
Miss Alice Biglin, sister of the 

bride, was her only attendant, 
and she was dressed for the oc- 

casion in a formal frock of pink; 
the bodice was of lace made with 
a scalloped peplum, and the full 
net skirt fell over taffeta. With 
it she wore a halo open-crown 
hat of pleated pink net with rib- 
bon streamers, Joanna Hill roses 
made up the bouquet of the maid 
of honor. 

The bridegroom is the son of I 
Dr. and Mrs. O. W. French of O’- 
Neill, who came to this city with 
his family when they moved here 
from Ptage. He is a graduate of 
the O’Neill high school. He is 
now a student at the University 
of Nebraska in Lincoln, where 
he is affiliated with Sigma Nu 
fraternity. 

John Shoemaker, jr., a long- 
time friend of the couple, served 
as best man. 

Mrs. Frank J. Biglin, mother of 
the bride, wore a smart suit of 
gray with accessories of brown. 
Her corsage was of talisman ros- 
es. The mother of the bride- 
groom, Mrs. O. W. French, was 
dressed in an afternoon frock of 
havy blue, with matching acces- 

sories, and a corsage of Joanna 
Hill roses. 

Breakfast Served 
Following the ceremony, a 

wedding breakfast was served at 
the Hotel Golden for 31 guests, 
including the bridal party and 
members of the families. After 
the breakfast, a reception was 
held at the home of the parents 
of the bride, Mr. and Mrs. Frank 
Biglin. Over 100 guests were re- 

ceived by the newlyweds and 
their parents. Presiding at the 
beautifully appointed table in 
the dining room of the home, 
were. Mrs. Duke Kersenbrock and 
Miss Constance Golden. Silver 
candelabra holding tall pink ta- 
pers and a silver bowl of pink 
roses centered the table, with the 
silver tea and coffee services at 
•the ends. Punch was served in 
the living room. 

After the reception, the bridal 
couple left on a honeymoon trip. 
The bride’s going-away outfit 
was a spring model suit of pearl 
gray gabardine, simply tailored 
with which she wore a dusty 
pink flower hat. Her shoes were 

patent platform pumps. 
Mr. and Mrs. French will make 

their home in Lincoln, while Mr. 
French continues his studies at 
the University, where he will 
enter his sophomore year. 

O’NEILL LOCALS 
Shirley and Charles Psotta of 

Pilger spent the weekend here 
visiting thir aunt and uncle, Mr. 
and Mrs. Frank Clemens. 

Leo Matthews left Monday for 
Omaha, to spend a few days visit- 
ing his brothers, James and Ber- 
nard Matthews. 

Mr. and Mrs. E. P. Driscoll, of 
Phoenix, Ariz., arrived Sunday 
for a visit in the home of Mrs 
J. P. Gallagher, and with other 
relatives and friends. Mr. Dris- 
coll, recently retired after 30 
years in the U. S. postal service 
at Phoenix, came to O’Neill in 
1896. His first wife was Mrs. 
Mary Murphy, a sister of tha late 
J. P. Gallagher. Mr. and Mrs. 
Driscoll will visit relatives in St. 
Louis, Mo., and Cincinnati, O., 
before returning to Phoenix. 

Dentistry has made wonderful 
progress in the restoration of 
teeth. The artificial denture of 
today is much better than the 
false plate of yesterday.—Dr. 
Fisher, Dentist, O’Neill, adv. 2tf 

Harry Gribble, of Fremont, vis- 
ited relatives and friends here to- 
day (Thursday.) 

SUMMER SCHOOL i 
OPENSAHMMET 

EMMET—Summer school ses- 
sions are being sponsored by the 
Church of the Epiphany and the 
Methodist church. 

The two-week session at the 
Catholic church began Tuesday | 
with daily classes from 9 a m. to 
12 noon. Two Sisters from St. i 

Mary’s Academy in O’Neill are in 
charge. 

The following children are at- 

tending the summer school at the 
Methodist church in O’Neill: 

Patty Kazda, Mary Lou Con- 
rad, Lyle Fox, Larry Fox, Gor- 
don Fox, James Puckett, Lois 
Puckett, Sharon Wagon, Kay 
Johnson, Jenene Johnson, Kath- 
leen McConnell, Larry McCon- 
nell, Norma Lou Foreman, 
Jeanne Cole. 

The parents and other mem- 

bers have volunteered to see that 
the children are taken to O'Neill 
each morning. 

Ladies Aid Meets 

EMMET—The Methodist Lad- 
ies Aid met Friday with Mrs. 
Sewell Johnson with eight mem- 

bers and four visitors present. 
The “election day” menu was 

planned and the dinner will be 
served June 11 at the church 
basement. 

Mrs. Johnson served a lunch 
The next meeting will be with 
Mrs. John Kee on June 28. 

Bible Group Meets 
EMMET—The next Bible study 

group of the Methodist church, 
will meet with Mrs. Leon Beck- 
with Friday. 

Other Emmet News 
Mrs. D. H. Allen, and Mrs. Ag- 

nes Gaffney visited at the Claude 
Bates home Thursday. 

Mr. and Mrs. Joe Winkler and 
family spent Decoration day vis- 
iting relatives at Stuart. 

Roger and Barty Givens of Stu- 
art are spending this week vis- 
iting their grandparents, Mr. 
and Mrs. George Pongratz. 

Mr. and Mrs. Robert Fox and 
Melvin Luben visited at the Joe 
Bartos home in Atkinson Thurs- 
day. 

Mrs. James O’Connor and 
daughter, Marybelle, left Thurs- 
day for Ainsworth to spend a 
week visiting Mrs O’Connor’s 
sister, Mabel Perkins, and other 
relatives. 

Mr. and Mrs. Bernard Dusatho 
*>pd son, Jimmie, of O'Neill, | 
spent Sunday visiting Gerrold 
Dusatho. 

Merle Foreman trucked the 
household goods for the Bill 
Serch’s Monday from O’Neill, to 
the building Serch purchased 
from Clarence Shaw. They ex- 

pect to open a cafe about June 15. 
Mr. and Mrs John Conrad and 

daughter, Mary Lou, spent Mon- 
day fishing at Lake Andes, S.D. 

Harold Gene Clausen, of At- 
kinson, spent Sunday visiting 
Robert Winkler. 

Miss June Burge left Friday to 
visit at her brother’s home near 
Amelia. 

Miss Arlene and Daryld Beck- 
with spent Sunday visiting Jew- 
ell and Bob Blackmore in Atkin- 
son. 

Miss Doris McGrew returned 
to her home at Seward Saturday 
after spending last week visiting 
Lois Cole. 

Mr. and Mrs. Ralph Leidy and 
children of O’Neill called at the 
Grant Peacock home Monday. 

Mr. and Mrs. E. R. Young of 
Neligh spent Memorial day visit- 
ing relatives here. 

Mr. and Mrs. Henry Kloppen- 
borg and family attended the 
Memorial day exercises in Atkin- 
son. 

Mr. and Mrs. DeVere Fox and 
family, of Atkinson, and Mr. and 
Mrs. Robert Fox visited Mrs 
June Luben and Melvie Sunday. 

Jimmie Puckett returned Sat- 
urday after spending several 
days visiting at the Eli McCon- 
nell home in Atkinson. 

Clayton Burge and his nieces, 
Carol and Lois Burge, of Amel- 
ia, spent last Wednesday until 
Friday visiting at the Bessie 
Burge home. 

4 DOCTORS I 
i BROWN & FRENCH 

Oftce Phwie 77 
e J 
I Complete X-Ray Equipment K 
t Glauses Correctly Fitted 
t Residence ( Dr. Browa, 223 £ 
f$ Phones { Dr. French, 2«J £ 

O’NEILL LOCALS 
Mr. and Mrs. A. M. King, of 

Phoenix, Ariz., arrived Wednes- 
day for a few weks’ visit with 
relatives and friends. 

M!iss Lois Jean Robertson, of 
Kansas City, Mo., arrived Tues- 
day for a ten-day visit with her 
parents, Mr. and Mrs. Sam Rob- 
ertson. 

Mr. and Mrs. Gerald Graybiel 
returned to their home in Chica- 
go Monday after spending the 
past ten days visiting Mrs. Gray- 
biers mother, Mrs. Agnes Sulli- 
van. 

Mrs. P J. Bigjin and daughter, 
Helen, went to Grand Island 
Monday to meet their daughter 
and sister, Miss Marie Biglin, of 
Salt Lake City, Utah, who will 
spend the next two weeks here. 

Mr. and Mrs. J. C. Reynolds 
and sons, of Twin Falls, Ida., ar- 

rived Monday for a visit at -the 
home of Mrs. Raynold's parents, 
Mr. and Mrs. Herbert Jensen. 

Mr. and Mrs. John Connolly 
and daughter, and Mr. Connolly’s 
mother, Mrs. Theresa Connolly, 
of Los Angeles, Calif., arrived 
Tuesday for a visit with rela- 
tives They are former residents 
here. Bardy Connolly, of Scotts- 
bluff, arrived Monday to spend a 

few days with them here. 
Mrs. Ray Eidenmiller went to 

Denver, Colo., this week to visit 
at the home of her daughter, Mrs. 
Lloyd Serck, and family. 

Mrs. John Protivinsky went to j 
Thermopolis, Wyo., Monday to' 
visit rel tives. 

Mrs. Helen Simar went to Om- 
aha Sunday to visit friends for a 
few .days. 

Mr. and Mrs. L. G. Gillespie 
were in Omaha during the week. 
Mr. Gillespie representing Gar- 
field Lodge A F. & A M. at a state 
gathering and Mrs Gillespie rep- i 
resenting the local Woodmen 
Circle lodge at the state conven- 
lion. She was honored at the 
convention by being chosen state 
auditor for the order. Mrs. Gil- 
lespie returned home Wednesday 
though her previous plans had 
been to leave Omaha for Long 
Beach, Calif., on a visit. Her 
plans were changed upon re- 

ceiving word fro mher sister, 
Mrs. Horace Davies, Portland, 
Ore., that she was coming to O’- 
Neill for a visit soon. Mr. Gil- 
lespie will return from Omaha 
Friday. 

Attorney J. D. Cronin was in 
Springview today (Thursday) on 
business. 

Mrs. E. M. Gallagher and 
daughter, Betty, and Miss Dor- 
othy Froelich left Tuesday for 
Chicago where Miss Donna Gal- 
lagher will join them and from 
there they will go to Washing- 
ton, D. C., to visit Mrs. Gallag- 
her’s mother, Mrs. M. E. Slat- 
tery. Miss Dorothy Froelich will 
visit her aunt, Miss Kay Kirwin. 

MARRIAGE LICENSES 
William Vesely, 26, of Verdel, 

and Vivian J. Fisher, 22, of 
Lynch, June 4. 

Donald E. Loy, 21, and Phyllis 
Johnson, 19, both of O'Neill, 
June 3. 

R. V. Crumly, 37, of Page, and 
Ava Jones, 21, of O’Neill, June 1. 

Dale French, 22, and Constance 
Adel Biglin, 22, both of O’Neill, 
May 31. 

Roy G. Gilg, 24, of Atkinson, 
and Catherine A. Kaup, 21, of 
Stuart, M!ay 31. 

■ i. a j 
RECEIVES DIPILOMA 

PAGE—Miss Rosara Snyder, 
who graduated from the Page 
high school, has recently received 
her diploma from the secretarial 
department of the Lincoln School 
of Commerce. The commence- 
ment exercises were held at the 
Cornhusker hotel on May 23. 
Among the special guests were 
Mr. and Mrs. Harry D. Snyder 
of Norfolk. Miss Snyder is now 
employed in Norfolk. 

Mrs. Albert Bruss of Fondulac, 
Wisconsin, spent from Sunday 
until Wednesday visiting at the 
home of her uncle, B. H. Stevens. 

U pays to read The Frgxx£ieB.r 
Want Ads. 
—_• 

Expected to Win! 

DWIGHT GRISWOLD 
Dwight Griswold, Ne- 

braska's outstanding gov- 
! ernor, is expected by many 

[ to win the Republican nom- 

I ination for United States 
Senator at the polls on 

Juno lllh. 
Known throughout the 

nation as Nebraska's fore- 
most leader, Griswold 
would enter the Senate 
with prestige c.nd a thor- 
ough knowledge of Nebras- 
ka problems gained during 
three terms as governor. 

Dwight Griswold has 
many friends in this com- 

munity and has visited in 
this county many times.— 
(Pol. Adv.) 
-- ■■■ ■ — ■ -< 

Old 
Friends 
are the 
Best! 

C0F3.1946, FA1STAFF BREWING CORP.. ST. LOUIS OMAHA NEW ORLEANS 

I W. F. FINLEY, M. D. | 
Phone. Office 28 

^Office First National Hank BM^l? 
I O’Neill : Nebraska S 
a 8 
m:n:»»m:»:m:Ktn:KnuKnn:tu 

FRANK NELS02* 

O'Neill, Nebraska. 

Candidate for Nomination, mrru. 

Non-Political Ballot 
for the 

State Legislature* 
28th District 

Born in Nebraska; 40 year^ bob*— 
dence in northern Holt county- an 
successful farm owner and oper 
ator; have never sought prthfit 
office before except local; haw* 
bom elected to most of the Icnaf 
offices and filled many positinn*^ 
of trust in the home community. 

Your Support at the Primary 
Will be Appreciated. 

• JOHN L. COPELAND Y 
Mariaville, Nebraska 

CANDIDATE STATE LEGISLATURE 
28th District—Rock, Kcya Paha, Holt, Boyd 

Born in Rock county 52 years ago; lived there 
ever since. Own, operate, and live on a farm 
on Niobrara river, 12 miles north of Newport 
;_ 

wAWKSHART 
The Man Who KNCrtfS Nebraska > 

■ 1W ONLY 
S 

l(X 1EXPERjEHCE 
Reel 

RepwblloaitI 

GOVERNOR 
Ht It Endorsed For GOVERNOR By The Republican Party . 

Re-Elect 

A. L. MILLER ! 
*£■ 

TO CONGRESS 1 
♦4 

Will appreciate your 
vote and promise my 
best efforts in your 
behalf. 

*4 

St£ 2 
us 

•« 

No opposition in Primary | 
June 11 

♦ 
♦ 

VOTE FOR 

Ed Swanson 
Republican for 

Railway 
Commissioner 

E.H.CHAC 
Canriidaio for 

State Legislature 
28th District 

Will Appreciate Your Sup 
In the Primary Jun® 1 

Non-Political Ballc 

Born and raised in Ntbrask-; 27 years in mercan- 

tile business in Atkinson. One of first in the state 
to develop the loekeT and frozen foods industry. 
Farm and ranch owner, and at present time oper- 
rting a ranch stocked with grade and registered 
Hereford cattle. Active in civic affairs; president 
of Atkinson Service Club and member of the At 
kinson school board. 

Will work for the full interns! of the people of our dist 


