
The Frontier 
D. H. Cronin, Editor and Proprietor 
Entered at the Postoffice at O’Neill, 
Nebraska, as Second Class Matter. 

One Year, in Nebraska $2.00 
One Year, outside Nebraska— 2.25 

Every subscription is regarded as 

an open account. The names of 
subscribers will be instantly re- 

moved from our mailing list at ex- 

!Oration of time paid for, if pub- 
isher shall be notified; otherwise, 

the subscription remains in force | 
at the designated subscription price. 
Every subscriber must understand 
that these conditions are made a 

part of the contract between pub- 
lisher and subscriber. 

Display advertising is charged 
for on a basis of 25c an inch (one 
column wide) per week. Want ads 
10c per line, first insertion, sub- 
sequent insertions, 5c per line. 

TAX! 
"When you light the evening lamp 

You pay a tax. 

When you buy a postage stamp 
You pay a tax. 

When you buy the baby clothes, 
When you read the morning news, 

When you buy a pair of shoes, 
You pay a tax. 

When you watch the screen girl 
■wink, 

You pay a tax. 

For the water that you drink, 
You pay a tax. 

When you smoke a cigarette. 
For the dinner that you get, 
For the beautiful coquette, 

You pay a tax. 

When you buy an ice cream cone, 
You pay a tax. 

When you buy a small soup bone, 
You pay a tax. 

When you buy a loaf of bread, 
When the doctor says you’re dead, 
And the final prayers are said, 

You pay a tax. 

SO WllAT? 
Author Unknown. 

THE NEBRASKA 
SCENE 

By the Lowell Service 
The aged of Nebraska, after be- 

ing shown the rainbow tinted vision 
of old-age pensions and homestead 

exemptions, have witnessed a sud- 
den fade-out of all their hopes. 
Terry Carpenter’s Omaha head- 

quarters have folded up; Charley 
Bryan no longer sings the song of 
relief for old people. Cecil Mat- 
thews is hard to find; from Bowker 
there comes no word. The cam- 

paign for old-age alleviation has 
fizzled with a suddenness that has 

provoked angry words from its 
disillousioned followers-: 

Ed Schroeder, at one time credit- 
ed with being Bryan’s arch-lieu- 

tenant, asserts that the whole plan 
has been given up. He explains 
that the circulation of petitions 
must be financed; that collections 
of a dollar a head wjll not ade- 

quately support the circulators of 

petitions. So the ambitious scheme 
has been abandoned. 

This leaves Bryan with no im- 

portant issue. Terry Carpenter is 
also weaponless. Dr. A. P. Fitz- 
simmons pursues his campaign for 
the democratic congressional nomi- 
nation in the First district. This 
bars Bryan from opposing Luckey. 

Clinton J. Campbell, Lincoln law- 

yer, is being discussed as a possible 
opponent of Governor Cochran for 
the gubernatorial nomination on 

the democratic side. Reactions 
from the white-spot advertising 
campaign, some democrats insist, 
have created the pressure directed 
toward the candidacy’of Mr. Camp- 
bell. The advertising campaign 
has annoyed a number of govern- 
ors and has made trouble for the 
Nebraska delegation in congress. 

During the last week the Omaha 
bridge row terminated in the in- 
troduction of a bill to reorganize 
the Dodge street board. Congress- 
man McLaughlin introduced the 
measure at the request of the 
governor. 

Boosters for Cochran discount 

anything like a possible blast from 
Washington that would be antag- 
onistic to the governor. They in- 
sist that he has stood for all the 
New Deal legislation and has co- 

operated 100 per cent with the 
federal departments. 

* 

The Circle N Ranch boosters of 

Hastings and elsewhere in the 
state have hurled the sombrero of 
Kenneth H. Gedney of Hastings 
into the political ring. Gedney, an 

architect, will compete with Speak- 
er Charles J. Warner for the re- 

publican gubernatorial nomination. 
C. E. Linn, Hastings business man, 
declares that the Circle N has been 
launched as a protest against 
machine politics, too much over- 

head, and political abuses in gen- 

eral. The objective is a state-wide 

organization. , 

Emil Placek of Wahoo, when in 
Lincoln last week, announced that 
he had a plan by which Nebraska 
farmers can obtain adequate stor- 

age for their crops. He has ar- 

ranged, with the cooperation of the 

FHA, for the building of portable,| 

sectional, wooden storage bins, of 

eight-sided construction, bolted to- 

gether. The farmers who buy them 
will be financed thru the First Na- 
tional bank of Wahoo, of which Pla- 

cek is president, so that the bins 
can be bought on monthly, quar- 

terly, or semi-annual payments. 
The FHA has promised to take any 

slow paper, up to ten per cent. 

Open cribs for ear corn will hold 
yOO bushels, and bins for wheat and 
shelled corn will hold up to 850 
bushels each. 

Ray C. Johnson of Lincoln, form- 

erly of Oakland, has filed as a 

republican candidate for state aud- 
itor. 0. M. Campbell filed on the 

republican ticket several weeks 

ago. Auditor Price so far has not 

encountered opposition for renomi- 
nation. 

William Thomas of Omaha, was 

elected president of the Nebraska 

young republicans at the state 

meeting at Grand Island. He suc- 

ceeds William A. Stewart jr., of 

Lexington. 

In support of a quo warranto 
action to oust Lieutenant Governor 
Walter H. Jurgensen from office, 
Attorney General Richard C. Hun- 
ter has filed a brief in the Supreme 
court asserting that Jurgensen is 
a “mere intruder,” and is not the 

legal incumbent of the office. Hun- 
ter claims that the conviction of 

Jurgensen March 7 on an embez- 
zelment charge automatically re- 

moved him from office. Arguments 
in the Supreme court on the quo 
warranto suit were set for June 0. 

George H. Turner, clerk of the 
state Supreme court and secretary 
of the Nebraska Bar association, 
has sent to 2,500 Nebraska lawyers 
and district and county judges the 
first complete directory of Nebras- 
ka attorneys that has ever been 
compiled. The order of the Su- 
preme court establishing an “in- 
tegrated bar” made this compila- 
tion necessary. 

A justice of the peace has no 

authority to remit fines, according 
to an informal opinion from the 
office of the attorney general, giv- 
en out in reply to an inquiry from 
Alvin J. Ginerich, justice of the 
peace at Humboldt. Francis V. 
Robinson, assistant attorney gen- 
eral, states: “That power to remit 
fines is an executive rather than a 

judicial or legislative power. No 
statute gives to a justice of the 
peace such power.” 

Last year, 56 persons were in- 
jured in automobile accidents dur- 
ing the week-end which included 
Memorial day. It. F. Weller, chief 
of the state highway patrol, issued 
an appeal to all drivers to exercise 
special care during the Memorial 
day week-end this year. He urged 
careful driving, at reasonable 
speed, and asked drivers who found 
themselves tired and sleepy to stop 
and take a rest. 

Carlyle Edgell of Rushville, a 

former Sheridan county judge, who 
was recently sentenced to from two 
to four years in the state peniten- 
tiary on the charge of embezzling 
county funds, is now isolated in 
one of the penitentiary hospital 
rooms suffering from small pox. 
Vaccination is the order of the day 
at the prison, but Dr. B. A. Finkle 
prison physician, says that he 
thinks there will be no spread of 
the disease to other prisoners. All 
who have not previously been im- 
munized and others who request 
it are being vaccinated as rapidly 
as possible. 

Among the pleas to be heard by 
the state board of pardons at its 
meeting June 8 is that of Kenneth 
C. Matheson, formerly treasurer 
of Sheridan county. Several let- 
ters asking for clemency have been 
sent to the board, one being from 
County Attorney Frank Apian, 
who prosecuted Matheson for em- 

bezzlement, and one from Allen 
Strong of Gordon, member of the 
unicameral, who declares that 
Matheson was the “victim of un- 

scrupulous advisers whom he had 
trusted to interpret correctly the 
law by which he was guided.” The 
board has also been petitioned on 

behalf of A. T. Cavanaugh, form- 
erly city treasurer of Wayne, by 
membersof that community, among 
them E. W. Huse, publisher of the 
Wayne Herald, and Joe Smolski of 
Wayne. 

John K. Selleck, business man- 

ager of student athletics at the 
University of Nebraska, sorrow- 

fully admits, since the recent de- 
cision of the United States Su- 
preme court that the federal gov- 
ernment can impose levies on ath- 
letic contests at state universities, 
that about $20,000 in federal taxes 
collected at the university will soon 

be turned over to the United States 
treasury. Pending the outcome of 
the litigation, which was concern- 

ing a federal admission tax on 

tickets to intercollegiate football 
games at the University of Geor- 

gia and Georgia Tech, the money 
has been kept in a separate fund 
since July 1, 1937. In case the tax 

had been ruled invalid, the money 
would have been used for improve- 
ments on the Nebraska stadium 
and athletic field. 

During April, 119,268 Nebras- 
kans received relief amounting to 

a total of $2,567,365, according to 

State Assistance Director N. C. 
Vandemoer. This came from fed- 
eral, state and county governments 
and a minute compilation has been 
made by the statistical division of 
the assistance department. 

The government is supplying 
the Kansas farmers with grass- 

hopper poison. The government 
agricultural experts don’t like 

grasshoppers. They prefer to 

destroy crops in their own way. 

We are living in strange times. 
The New Deal agricultural experts 
are predicting disaster because we 

are facing the prospect of good 
drops. 

When it comes to putting over a 

real organization bill you have to 

hand it to Adolph Hitler. 

BRIEFLY STATED 
Mr. and Mrs. Kay Eidenmiller 

and daughter, Vira, and Mrs. Flora 
Lewis drove to Lincoln Sunday and 
spent Memorial duy visiting with 
friends at Lincoln and Elmwood. 

« —- — 

Miss Luree Abart and Esther 
Cole Harris drove to Atkinson on 

Wednesday night where they at- 

tended the annual Alumnae ban- 
quet of the Atkinson public school. 

Lyndle R. Stout, Holt county 
agricultural agent, left Sunday for 
Lincoln taking with him a group 
of 4-H club members and they will 
attend a state-wide 4-H club meet- 

ing. 

O’Neill friends have received 
word that Harlan Agnes, formerly 
a resident of O’Neill but now living 
in Sioux City, is to be married on 

June 14 to Miss Katherine King of 
Sioux City. 

Mr. and Mrs. L. W. Hartleib and 
daughter, Lucille, drove up from 
Omaha Saturday and were guests 
at the home of their daughter, 
Mrs. Larry Cain and family over 

the week-end. 

O’Neill Food Center 
# * * 

THRIFTY BUYERS’ 
COLUMN 

# * * 

Bananas _ 

4 lbs. for. 

Pineapples « 5. 
Large Size.UC 
Marshmallow «» 
1-lb. package.ljv 

Tomatoes 
Per lb__ 9C 
Red Pitted 

Cherries 
No. 10 Can..0«#V 
Called Gallon 

Armour’s 

Milk 
Large can, 3 for.Mt 1 V 

Salmon ~5lt 
Per Can.IjC 
Macaroni «« _ 

3 lbs. /ilk 

Catsup 10 

Crackers «,_ 
2-lb. Box_IOC 

Cal-X Water Softener 
and Soap Saver % ^ 
25c Value.Ijt 

Bologna u 

CornStarch j- 2 packages. A9C 

Dr. and Mrs. L. B. Duffy and 
children returned to their home at 
Jackson, Minn., Tuesday after 
spending the week-end here as the 
guests of Mrs. Duffy’s sister, Mrs. 
W. J. Hammond. 

Mr. and Mrs. Charles M. Bussard 
and children left Sunday for Lush- 
ton, Nebr., where they spent Dec- 
oration Day with relatives and old 
friends. They returned home 
Tuesday evening. 

Mrs. Ed Whelan, Mrs. Nell Gold- 
en, Quentin Whelan and Miss Sue 
Whelan arrived Thursday from San 
Diego, Calif., and will spend a few 
days visiting Mrs. Whelan’s broth- 
er, Tom Quilty, and other relatives. 

Mrs. Alma Evans and Mrs. How- 
ard Bauman left Wednesday for 
Omaha where they will attend the 
graduating exercises of Creighton 
University, as Mrs. Evans’ daugh- 
ter, Ruth, is a member of the grad- 
uating class of St. Catherine’s hos- 
pital. 

Mrs. James Davidson and Jack 
left Wednesday for Omaha, where 
they will attend the graduating ex- 

ercises of Creighton university on 

June 2, at which time Miss Eileen 
Davidson will be graduated from 
St. Joseph’s Hospital School of 
Nursing. 

Mrs. Donald Enright and daugh- 
ter, Janet, and nephew, Donnie 
Colman, drove to Norfolk Sunday 
and spent the day with Mrs. En- 
right’s parents. Mrs. Enright and 
Donnie returned Monday, but Janet 
will spend the summer with her 
grandparents. 

Major and Mrs. F. M. Brennan 
and children arrived Saturday to 

spend Memorial day with Major 
Brennan’s mother, Mrs. Neil Bren- 
nan. Major and Mrs. Brennan re- 

turned to Fort Leavenworth, Kans., 
Monday, but the children will stay 
for a longer visit,. 

Howard Greeley and daughter of 

Weston, Nebr., were in the city. 
Tuesday visiting old time friends. 
Mr. and Mrs. Greeley and daughter 

were in Atkinson for Memorial Day 
services and Howard and daughter 
drove down Tuesday for a few 
hours visit with old friends. 

Mrs. L. A. Simonson, Mrs. Geo. 
McCarthy and children and Miss 
Edna Simonson drove to Long Pine 
Friday, where they attended the 
graduating exercises of the Long 
Pine high school, as Mrs. Simon- 
son’s granddaughter, Helen Fay 
Goree was a member of the class. 

Mr. and Mrs. Frank Phalin left 
Wednesday night for Chicago, 
where they will visit their daugh- 
ter, Miss Loretta, and Mrs. Pha- 
lin’s sister, Miss Tressa Finley. 
From Chicago, they will go to 

Gary, Ind., where they will visit 
their daughter, Mrs. Otto Reising, 
and their son, Larry. 

Mr. and Mrs. Carl Dahlstein and 

family moved to Central City, 
Nebr., Wednesday afternoon where 
they will make their future home. 
Mr. Dahlstein will operate a filling 
station and restaurant in that city. 
Carl had been manager of the 
Texas company service station here 
for the past several years, which 
position he resigned a month ago. 

Miss Helen Sullivan and Eleanor 
Kavam left Saturday night for 
Omaha, where they spent the week- 
end visiting. Miss Kavan will 
spend the summer vacation visiting 
at her home in Albion, while Miss 
Helen will visit relatives in Omaha 
for a week, as she is taking her an- 

nual vacation from the duties in 
the office of the county superin- 
tendent. 

Henry Grady returned Monday 
night from a two weeks visit to Dal- 
las, Texas, and other cities in that 
section of the state. Henry went 
down to attend the funeral of Wil- 
liam McCormick, formerly of Oma- 
ha, who passed away at his home 
there after a short illness. Henry 
says there is a great wheat crop 
being harvested in that section of 
Texas and up thru Kansas. He 
says he saw combines working on 

nearly every farm and the people 
in that section are of the opinion 

Get The Habit 
Eat 

“MASTER BREAD” 

me Sncrcjiff • • ■ • AIways Fresh! 

SPECIALS FOR SATURDAY 

JELLY ROLL, each .... 8c 
Assorted COOKIES, doz. 10c 
DOUGHNUTS, doz. ... 15c 
Cottage ROLLS, doz.... 5c 

Potato Chips Made Fresh Every Day 
Bread and Rolls Baked Fresh Twice Daily 

McMillan & markey bakery 

It it a triumph in excel- 
sis when a man sternly 
denies himself present 
luxuries, so jhis family 
may not suffer for fu- 
ture necessities. 

The 
O’NEILL NATIONAL 

BANK 
Capital, Surplus and This Bank Carries No 

Undivided Profits, Indebtedness of Officers 
$140,000.00 or Stockholders. 

Member Federal Deposit Insurance Corporation 

that they are harvesting the great- 
est wheat crop in the history of the 
nation. 

The Situation In China 
Definite danger exists that 60,- 

000,000 persons will starve in de- 
vastated areas in China before 
September, 1938, unless help 
reaches them. It is impossible to 
plant crops. Untold millions of 
homes have been destroyed. 
Enough camps to care for refugees, 
even in larger cities, cannot be con- 

structed and maintained because of 
lack of funds. 

The committee which acts for 
the American Red Cross in Shang- 
hai estimates that 1,000,000 children 
orphaned and homeless, are wand- 
ering through the few provinces 
where surveys have been possible. 
In American currency $1.00 will 
feed, clothe, and shelter a Chinese 
child for one month; $18 will care 

for an adult refugee one year. 
Medical authorities in China say 

that, with hot weather approach- 
ing, devastating epidemics will be 
inevitable. Many refugees are 

now dying of typhoid, beri-beri, 
starvation, pneumonia. It is im- 
possible to give medical attention 
to all wounded because of lack of 
personnel and supplies. 

Civilian refugees exceed suffer- 
ers from warfare wounds eight to 
one. Estimates of observers on 

the scene say refugees are increas- 
ing at an average rate of 500,000 
per day. 

While reports of warfare fill 
newspapers, the fact that 6,000,000 
are homeless in the Yellow river 
valley in North China from record 
floods has gone unnoticed in the 

-1-- 
foreign press. Practically nothing 
can be done for them. 

Foreigners in China are impress- 
ed by the great desire of the Chin- 
ese people to help themselves. 
Oversees Chinese have sent $7,000,- 
000 to Chinese for relief work 
during recent months. Many 
wealthy Chinese have given large 
percentages of their personal for- 
tunes for relief of their country- 
men. ^ 

Money received by the American 
Red Cross is being allocated to ex- 

isting relief agencies in China by a 
committee of American business 
men appointed by United States 
Ambassador Nelson T. Johnson, 
and called the American Advisory 
Committee. The Ambassador has 
cabled his approval of work being 
done by Chinese relief agencies 
on numerous occasions, and says 
they are working as efficiently as 

possible. 
Contributions can be made to 

Dr. L. A. Carter of O’Neill, chair- 
man of the Holt County Chapter 
of the Red Cross, or to any local 
chairman. 

Dr. C.W. Alexander 
OMAHA 

Eyesight Specialist 
will be in O’Neill 

Monday, June 6 
AT GOLDEN HOTEL 

Eyes Examined Glasses Fitted 
Reasonable Prices 

You Can Have One 
Of These Lanterns 

As A Free Gift! 
u A '4*1 ,, 

You will find this lantern very useful. It 
is two lights in one, a long range focusing 
light in front and a broad beam flood light 
on top, both operated by a single switch on 

the back of the lamp. Farmers find it very 
useful as it eliminates the danger of fire 
which is present in lights using a flame. It 
is also very useful around a car at night, or 

for any short errand in the dark where light 
may be needed for a few minutes. 

This lantern uses standard flashlight bat- 
teries and bulbs, so it is something that will 
serve you for a long time, and that will not 
be useless when the first set of batteries are 

used up. 

A YEARS ADVANCE SUBSCRIPTION 
ENTITLES YOU TO ONE FREE! 

Anyone who pays a years advance sub- 
scription to The Frontier, will receive one of 
these lanterns free, as a gift. The offer is 
open to anyone. Don’t fumble in the dark 
or take chances with matches. Play safe by 
letting one of the Kwik Lite lanterns light 
your way. 

If your subscription is paid in advance 
and you do not care to advance it further at 
this time you may have the lantern free by 
merely paying 40c to cover the cost of the 
two batteries and bulbs required to operate 
it. No other obligation. 

The Frontier 


