EDUCATIONAL MATTERS

varieties of reform are proposed as there are

SPECIAL NOTICES

Advertisements for these columns will be taken until 12 m. for the evening and until 8 p. m. for the morning and Sunday editions.
Advertisers, by requesting a numbered check, can have answers ad-

dressed to a numbered letter in care

The Bee. Answers so addressed

will be delivered on presentation of he check only. Rates, 1 1-2c a word first insertion; le a word thereafter. Nothing taken for less than 25c for the first insertion. These advertisements must be

run consecutively.

WANTED_MALE HELP.

CANVASSERS TO TAKE ORDERS; NEW LINE ANVASSERS TO TAKE URDERS, was any of work, no herry goods to carry, salary of commission. C. F. Adams Co., 524 Sc, 15th St. 11-351

SALESMAN FOR CIGARS, 115 A MONTH AND expenses; old firm; experience unnecessary; inducements to customers. C. C. Bishop & Co., St. Louis.

AGENTS AND BRANCH MANAGERS; SALARY and commission. Hunter Tallering & Shirt Co., Cincinnati, O. B-Miss April 2* Co., Cincinnati, O. \$100 CAS'I AND LIBERAL COMMISSIONS FOR good, experienced organizers; up to date plan; easy to work. Henry C. Akin, Supreme Regent, Imperial Mystic Legion, Omaha, Neb. B-533-F3

IF YOU ENJOY A GOOD, ESTABLISHED trade in teas and cigars and wish to change houses, address, with full particulars, Box 945, Chicago.

B-M952 26

WANTED, MEN TO LEARN BARBER TRADE; here is a chance that can't be had elsawhere; constant practice, expert instructions, lectures, examinations, diplomas, two years time saved; only two months required; growing demand for graduates; 3 placed today at \$12 weekly; room rent free; tools donated; wages Saturdays; '98 catalogue mailed free. Moler System Barber School; Chicago and St. Louis. B—M201 24* WANTED, LADIE SAND GENTLEMEN TO represent us for some of the best selling articles on market. Address 504 Edmison Illds Sloux Falls, S. D. 11-M994 24* WANTED, HARNESSMAKER; GERMAN PRE-ferred. Address Theo. J. Steen, Boelus. Neb. B-M163 25

WANTED-TRAVELING BALESMEN: SAL ELING State Burt at, sion, Call 1714 Burt at, 131-24* TRAVELING SALESMAN, TO SELL COM-

GOVERNMENT POSITIONS, DON'T PREPARE tion without seeing our illustrated catalogue of information; sent free. Columbian Correspondence College, Washington, D. C. B-M112 29* WANTED, SALESMAN FOR LUBRICATING oils, greates and specialties; largest time market, Equitable Refining Co., Cleveland, 11-M220

WANTED-FEMALE HELP.

100 GIRLS FOR ALL KINDS OF WORK; 33 TO 47 week. Canadian Office, 1522 Douglass, C-363 WANTED, AN EXPERIENCED SECOND GIRL references required. Mrs. H. G. Burt. No. 19 S. 39th St. C-197-24 25 LADIES TO DO TAPESTRY WORK AT home; easily make \$4 to \$7 per week. Call im-mediately. Gem Mfg. Co., 1704 Capitol avenue. C-M166 24*

FIRST-CLASS COOK AND LAUNDRESS; \$5 per week, 617 S, 18th. C-164 OOOK WANTIED IN A SMALL FAMILY: wages, \$1.00 per week; second girl kept. 208 Douglas st. C-M179 208

GIRL FOR GENERAL HOUSEWORK, 1136 S C-106-25*

FOR RENT_HOUSES.

CHOICE HOUSES AND COTTAGES ALL OVER city, \$5 to\$75, Fidelity, 1st floor N. Y. Life. D-M191 MOVING HOUSEHOLD GOODS AND PIANOS Om. Van & Storage Co., 1511½ Farnam. Tel. 1529 D-373 HOUSES. WALLACE, BROWN BLOCK, 16TH and Douglas. D-568 LARGE LIST. M'CAGUE, 15TH AND DODGE HOUSES, FLATS. GARVIN BROS., 1612 FAR'M HOUSES FOR RENT. BEMIS, PAXTON BLK. HOUSES, J. H. SHERWOOD, 423 N. Y. LIFE D-372 HOUSES IN ALL PARTS OF THE CITY. THE O. F. Davis Company, 1505 Farnam. D-365 HOUSES. BENEWA & CO., 108 N, 15TH ST D-366 HOUSES, COTTAGES & STORES, ALL PARTS of city, Brennan & Love Co., 219 S, 16th, D-367 9-ROOM MODERN BRICK DWELLING, NO. 501 S. 28th st. 530.
Apply to W. B. Meikle, 1st Nat'l Bank Bidg.
D-913

SEVERAL DESIRABLE HOUSES NEAR HANscoin park and most desirable one on Park
Ave. at \$25.00. F. D. Wend, 18th & Douglas,
19-982-27 8-HOOM HOUSE, NEWLY PAINTED AND PA pered, 2914 N. 25th Ave., \$12. Fidelity Trus Co. D-M170

S-ROOM BRICK, 35. 6-room cottage, \$11. 9-room cottage, \$13. 50t Bee bldg. D-M168

FOR RENT, NEWLY FURNISHED ROOMS reasonable prices, 2421 Dodge, E-M586 VERY PLEASANT ROOM, WITH OR WITH-out hoard, near Hanscom park; modern house, E. 5, Hee, E-786 LARGE SOUTH FRONT ROOM WITH AL-cove; modern 2580 Harney St. E-937 25* NICELY FURNISHED ROOMS, ALL MOD-ern conveniences, Reference required, 2001 For-nam. EM-126-24* FURNISHED ROOMS, 2576 HARNEY ST. E-M180 F22* TO RENT, TWO ELEGANTLY FURNISHED rooms, "en suite;" steam heat and bath; references. Apply room 1, Davidge Bldg., 18th and Farnam Sis., city.

FURNISHED ROOMS AND BOARD. THE MERCHAM, FIRST CLASS FAMILY HO tel. 25th and Dedge Sts. F-M707

TWO NICE ROOMS, 2659 DOUGLAS ST. F-708 KLONDIKE HOTEL, CORNER 16TH AND Webster streets European plan, 199 rooms, steam heat, free baths; good rooms, \$1.59 per week; best medium-priced hotel in Omaha, I, N Watson, Proprietor. F-M884 STEAM REATED ROOMS WITH BOARD, 2009 Harney. F-M866 Feb.15* UTOPIA, 1721 DAVENPORT; TRANSIENTS AC commodated. F-M769 F17* HANDSOME PARLORS EN SUTTE, SMALLER rooms, good board. The Rose, 2020 Harney, F-M972 NICELY FURNISHED ROOMS, MODERN, EX-cellent table board, \$22 North 19th St. F-M972 28* ELEGANT FRONT ROOM, STEAM HEATED first class board, 1969 Capitol Ave. F-M173 25*

NICE ROOMS, WITH BOARD, 1824 BINNEY near expasition. F-M188 29* PURNISHED ROOMS WITH BOARD: HOT water heat. 2402 Cass St. F-M355 29* IN PRIVATE FAMILY, WITH OR WITHOUT board. 1919 Bodge. F-M192 26* 21ANDSOME LARGE SOUTH FRONT ROOM in private residence: steam heat; excellent board; references. 202 No. 18th St. F-M204 21* LARGE SOUTH ROOM, STEAM HEAT board; references, 202 N. 18th. F-M211 24*

FOR REXT_STORES AND OFFICES.

FOR RENT, IN THE BEE BUILDING:
One large corner room, 2d floor, with vault and
private office, water, etc.
One large front room, 2d floor, divided into two
rooms by partition; water, etc.
One large corner room, 2d floor, with vault,
water, etc.

water, etc.
One front room, divided by partition, 3d floor,
One corner room, with vault, 3d floor.
One large room, 3d floor, with partition dividing
it into one large room and two smaller
private rooms; water, etc.
Two large ground floor rooms, fronting 17th St.,
with vault,

with vault.

Beversi small rooms on 4th floor with vaults.

All these rooms are heated with steam electric lights, supplied with first-class janitor service. Elevators run day and all night; building strictly firsproof. Apply to Euperintendent, Room 104, Bee building.

I-198 FOR RENT-The 4-STORY BRICK BUILDING at 9-6 Farnam St. This building has a fireproof cement basement; water on all floors, gas, etc. Apply at the office of The Bee.

FOR RENT-DESK BOOM IN GROUND FLOOR office. Bee building; water, steam heat, electric light and janitor service. Apply to Superintendent, Bee building.

FOR RENT_STORES AND OFFICES.

(Continued.) FIRST CLASS MEAT MARKET LOCATION 1-M214 HOTELS, STORES, BEMIS, PAXTON BLI FINE STORE NEAR EXPOSITION, CHEAP E 20, Bee. 1-MP34 25* FOR RENT, BRICK WAREHOUSE, HTH AND Leavenworth Sts.; 22,0% sq. feet, U. P. track-age; frame warehouse, 7th and Douglas, 140% sq. feet; B. & M. trackage, S. S. Curris, 1808 Harney St.

AGENTS WANTED.

WANTED, AN ACTIVE AGENT IN EVERY town to solicit subscriptions for the sale of shares in the Alaska Gold Mining & Development Company. Office 445 Chamber Commerce Bidg., Omaha.

WANTED_TO REST.

WANTED TO RENT, A HOUSE OF 6 OR rooms; with gas, bath, etc.; within walkin distance of The Bee office; will lease for a num distance of The Bee omce; will lease to be care ber of years. Address D 46, stating price, care of The Bee, K-605* WE WANT A GOOD STORE ROOM, WELL, located, at once, for a first-class permanent tenant. Fidelity, 1st floor, N, Y. Life, W-979

WANTED, BY YOUNG LADY, BOARD AND room convenient to South Omaha street car line if possible. E 35, Ree. K-M154 24* A NICELY FURNISHED MODERN HOUSE

STORAGE.

PACIFIC STORAGE AND WAREHOUSE CO. ACIFIC STURAGE AND STORES; general storage and forwarding M-375 OM. VAN & STORAGE, 15115; FARN'M. TEL 155 M-377 RANK EWERS, STORAGE, 1214 HARNEY Hauling and packing, cheapest rates, Tel. 956, M-378

WANTED-TO BUY.

WANTED TO BUY-A FEW THOUSAND dollars of Omaha Sayings bank certificates cash; state amount and price asked. Address E 28, Eee office. N-959-31* WANTED, CHEAP FOR CASH, AN UPRIGHT gasoline engine. Lock box 111, Lexington, Neb N-M971 27 MAHA SAVINGS BANK ACCOUNTS BOUGHT Give price and amount to T. H. W., care Bec N-M157 24*

FOR SALE_MISCELLANEOUS. INE WHITE SAWDUST FOR FLOORS, ETC coarse for ice, at \$3.75 per cord. Tel, 458, 90 Douglas. Q-379 BILLIARD HALL AND BOWLING ALLEY doing good business; established 1990 Loc. box 25, Johnson, Neb. Q-M212-Jan-24*

FOR SALE, 1,000 DOORS AND WINDOWS AND 300 bedroom sets from World's Fair hotel, cheap. J. Ruel, 231 65th Street, Chicaso. Q-M341 21* FOR SALE, DRY, HARD WOOD KINDLING 26th and U. P. Rallway. Telephone, 973 FOR SALE, MILK, APPLY 2200 SPENCER ST Will deliver it if not over 6 or 7 blocks away Q-M185

CLAIRVOYANTS.

PROF. AMES. GREATEST LIVING SUCCESS ful palmist and clairvoyant medium, 2207 Far nam St.; sittings 50c; satisfaction positively guaranteed.

MASSAGE, BATHS, ETC.

MME. BRISSON OF PARIS, CHIROPODIST medicated baths and massage. 107 N. 12th S T-434-F-1* MME, AMES, MASSAGE AND DATHS, 1623's Howard street. T-M219 20* MRS. DR. LEON, ELECTRIC MASSAGE BATH

parlors; restful and curative, 417 S. 11th, up stairs, T-M216 30* PERSONAL.

VIAVI CO., UTERINE TROUBLES, 346-8 BEE Bldg; physician consultation or health book free. U-381 BATHS, MASSAGE. MME. POST, 3151/2 S. 15TH U-382 CLOTHES CLEANED, PRESSED AND RE-paired; day or night; dress suits for hire. Pantorium, N. E. Cor. 14th and Farnam. Tel. 963. U-383

HOW BECOME LAWFUL PHYSICIANS, pharmacists, V. D's, dentists or lawyers. Lock box 196, Chicago. U-748 F12* PRIVATE HOME FOR LADIES BEFORE AND durding continement. Bables adopted or cared for. Mrs. M. J. Ladlow, 2202 Chark St., Omaha, U-964-Feb-12*

ANY PERSON IN DOUGLAS, WASHINGTON or Sarpy counties who has any claim against me will please call at Wier's place, near south Omaha, where I can be found till March I, 1898. John Nath. U-985-Feb-25* PRIVATE HOME FOR LADIES BEFORE AND during confinement; bables adopted and cared for. 1136 N. 17th. U-959 27* WANTED-CHILDREN TO BOARD AND CARE for. Mrs. K. Hanna, general delivery, Omaha. UM-157-24*

IP WM. H. FLANNERY WILL COMMUNI cate with F. R. Nealy, 1742 Market st., Sa Francisco, Cal., he will learn something of in terest to him. U-M206 26* A LADY TYPEWRITER, AT ONCE, WANTED for steady but light work. Address E 46. Beau U-M217 24*

MONEY TO LOAN_REAL ESTATE.

MONEY TO LOAN AT LOW RATES. THE O. F. Davis Co., 1505 Farnam St. W-385 ANTHONY LOAN & TRUST CO., 315 N. Y. L. quick money at low rates for choice farm lands in lows, northern Missouri, eastern Nebraska W-385 LOANS ON IMPROVED & UNIMPROVED CITY property. W. Farnam Smith & Co., 1320 Far'm, W-387 MONEY TO LOAN. BEMIS, PAXTON BLOCK W-961 MONEY TO LOAN ON IMPROVED OMAHA real estate Brennan-Love Co., 219 S. 16th, W-339 \$100,000,00 SPECIAL FUND TO LOAN ON first class improved Omaha property, or for building purposes. Fidelity Trust Company.

W-320

6 PER CENT MONEY, \$1,600 AND UPWARDS on gilt-edged improved Omaha real estate Bemis, Paxton block. W-392

MONEY LOANED ON IMPROVED REAL ES-tate in Omaha, Council Hiuffs & South Omaha, Pusey & Thomas, 503 First Nat'l Bank, Omaha, W-303 WANTED-CHOICE FARM AND CITY LOANS. R. C. Peters & Co., U. S. Nat'l Bank Bldg. W-M455 MORTGAGES FOR SALE. PROPERTY OF NON residents cated for. W. B. Melkie, 1st Nat'l Bk W-321

WE HAVE MONEY TO LOAN ON FARMS IN eastern Nebraska and western Iowa. Brennan-Love Co., 219 South 16th street. W-M539 F5 6 PER CENT MONEY ON NEB. FARMS & OMA-ha property. W. B. Meikle, 1st Nat'l Bank Bldg. W-M415

6 PER CENT CITY AND FARM LOANS, Garvin Bros., 1613 Farnam St. W-M967

SHORTHAND AND TYPEWRITING. A. C. VAN SANT'S SCHOOL 513 N. Y. LIFE

AT OMAHA EUS. COLLEGE, 16TH & DOUGLAS H. B. BOYLES, COURT REPORTER, PRIVATE lessons; day and evening. 407 Bee bidg. -238

OMAHA SHORT-HAND COLLEGE, BOYD'S theater - MTS Feb. 13

MONEY TO LOAN_CHATTELS.

\$10 TO \$10.600 TO LOAN ON
HOUSEHOLD FURNITURE AND PIANOS.
HOUSEHOLD FURNITURE AND PIANOS.
HORSES WAGONS AND CARRIAGES,
WAREHOUSE RECEIPTS, ETC.,
at lowest raice in
Omaha, South Omaha and Council Biuffs.
No remeval of geods; strictly confidential; you
can pay the loan off at any time or in any
amount's.
OMAHA MORTGAGE LOAN CO..
206 South 16th St.
THE OLDEST, LARGEST AND ONLY INCORPORATED LOAN COMPANY IN OMAHA.
X-594

BUSINESS CHANCES

(Continued.) \$1.600 00-AVAIL YOURSELF OF THIS MODE f acquiring wealth. By it many homes are the ecipients of fortune"s golden shower. No 1,900 CASH WHAL BUY A FIRST-CLASS bakery; everything complete; now turns out 1,890 to 2,000 toaves daily; good cake trade; pur-chase money can be made clear this season; cuson for selling sickness. Address E 27. Des. Y-M17: 25*

GRAND OPPORTUNITY FOR A MAN WITH \$10.00 capital to invest in a safe, sure business for himself paying 100 per cent; quick profits. Call on or address \$ 122) Farnam at. Y-M213 25* A LIVE BUSINESS MAN WITH SMALL CAPI-

tal can double original investment every manu-tal can double original investment every manu-until exposition opens, Address E 45, Bec. Y-M218 M*

FOR EXCHANGE. WILL EXCHANGE VERY DESIRABLE clear vacant Omaha lots for Chicago property.
Address with full particulars, Hox 182, Omaha.
Z-M504

for SALE OR EXCHANGE LOT 50 BY 150 feet, with eight-room cottage with all modern improvements, also good bain; located in choicest residence part of Omaha, two blocks from Hansom park; one block from street cars and school; paved street and brick walks; \$2.500 incumbrance, four years at 5 per cent; will sell equity cheap for cash or will exchange for a desirable stock of shoes. Address D 66, Bee, Omaha.

Z-M:37 Feb. 13

TO TRADE FOR FARMS, STOCK OF DRUGS, lumber yard and mill, set of butcher tools and pedigreed poland china hogs for clear wild land; Mo, farm for Neb, farm, make offer. D. J. Perry, Exeter, Neb. Z-M197 15*

Huntsberger & Clements. Lyons, Ne-RE-M389

braska.

\$22.500 FOR 2-STORY BRICK BUILDING, 44 feet frontage, near 14th and Douglas Sts. 2,560 for improved property on near 25th street. J. N. Frenzer, Opp. P. O. RE-M759

H PER CENT GROSS INVESTMENT, 2-STORY brick business building, price \$3,509. Address E 1, Bee. RE-M751 MUST BE SOLD, 480-ACRE STOCK FARM ON Kinwa river, Bennett station, on K. P. R. R. 70 acres alfalfa under ditch; all fenced 20 acres timber; plenty outside range; 21 miles east of Denver, Wm. Mordiah, 2005 Larimor St., Denver, Colo. RE-M905 25*

FARM LANDS, C. F. HARRISON, 912 N. Y. L. RE-911 F17* WANTED TO BUY OR TRADE FOR A TEN or fifteen-acre tract near Omaba; must be good and cheap; state lecation and lowest price. Address E 28, Bee office. RE-958-31* OLD ONCE FOR \$3.60; NOW \$755; CHOICE building lot, 604 Bee Bldg, RE-M102 SNAP, TWO OF THE BEST LOTS IN WEST

Cummings addition; only \$150.00 e.c., this week. The McCague Investment Co. RE-M136 30* FOR SALE, THE A. G. BRACKETT LAND. 240 acres, two miles south of Elkhorn, S. S. Cur tis, 1808 Harney St. RE-M199 30*

FINANCIAL.

MONEY LOANED ON LIFE INSURANCE POL-icles or bought. L. P. Van Norman, Minne-apolis, Minn. -M773 Ment4*

PYPEWRITERS FOR RENT, \$4.00 PER MONTH The Smith-Premier Typewriter Co., 1625 Fa. nam St.; telephone, 1284. —639

SEWING MACHINES AND SUPPLIES. NEW HOME, HOUSEHOLD & WHITE SEW-ing machines & supplies, 1514 Cap. ave. Tel. 1574, 403.

EMPLOYMENT OFFICES .

STREET BUREAU, 1417 FARNAM st Rooms 2 & 3. Tel. 1404 545 STENOGRAPHERS.

WE SOLICIT AND FURNISH POSITIONS FOR Stenographers free. The Smith-Premier Type-writer Co. Telephone, 1284. —485

BURLINGTON NUT. BEST, CHEAPEST. PRICE \$1.75 per ton. 'Phone 848. Harmon & Weeth Co.

DRESS CUTTING SCHOOLS. REMOVED, THE JOY TAILOR SYSTEM dress cutting school, 1911 Cuming st.

—MS70 Feb.15

FURNITURE PACKED.

M. S. WALKIN, 2111 CUMING. TEL. 1931,

NURSERIES. WANTED-A GOOD PARTNER FOR SOUTH ern fruit farm. Also customers for 10c choics, lots; also several small tracts of land nea Omaha. Address, J. R. Rice, Council Bluffs, In BELECT, 200

BRICK SEWER SIDEWALK & HULLDING ANY QUAN-tity; tel. 402, Louiseille Brick Co., 250 Ed. Trade.

PAWNBROKERS. H. MAROWITZ LOANS MONEY, 418 N. 16 ST. -467

CONTRACTOR AND BUILDER

G. W. GILBERT, CARPENTER AND CON-tractor; jobbing solicited. INIS St. Mary's ave. -M340 Jan 29*

GOVERNMENT NOTICES.

CHIEF QUARTERMASTER'S OFFICE—Omaha, Neb., January 20, 1898, Scaled proposals, in triplicate, will be received here until 12 o'clock m., February 21, 1898, and then opened for furnishing preases, type, etc., and all material and labor of every description that may be required for printing at Headquarters, Department of the Platte, during fiscal year commencing July 1, 1898, Circular silving full information, with forms for bidding, will be furnished on application. The U. S. reserves right to reject any or all bids, Envelopes containing proposals to be marked "Proposals for printing," and addressed to Sam R. Jones, Q. M.

PROPOSALS FOR FLOUR—OFFICE PURchasing Comissary of Subsistence, Omaha, Neb., January 24, 1888. Sealed proposals, in duplicate, subject to the usual conditions, will be received at this office until 11 o'clock a.m., February 3, 1898, at which time and place they will be opened in presence of bildders, for furnishing the Subsistence Department, U. S. Army, on or before February 23, 1898, as may be required, with Flour for issue and Flour, choice family, at the following places of delivery, viz. On board of cars at Omaha, Nebraska, or at subsistence storchouse at Forts Crook, Niobrara, Robinson, Neb., D. A. Russell, Washakie, Wyo, and Fort Meade, S. D. Preference will be given to articles of domestic production. The right is reserved to reject any or all bids, or any part of any bid. Blank proposals and specifications showing in detail the articles and quantities required, and giving full information as to conditions, will be furnished on application to this office, or any of the Commissaries at posts named above. Proposals will also be received by the Purchasing Commissaries at posts named above. Proposals will also be received by the Purchasing Commissaries at posts named above. Pebruary 3, 1898, for the furnishing and deflevery of the above Subsistence. Between Colo., at 10 a. m. mountain standard time, February 3, 1898, for the furnishing and deposts named. FRANK E. NYE, Major and C. S., U. S. A.

BUSINESS CHANCES.

TO GET IN OR OUT OF BUSINESS GO TO J. J. Gibson, 314 First Nat'l Bank. Y-326

FOR RENT. BRICK STOREROOM. 60X22. ALL conveniences; best location in city; splendid business town. John H. Lindale, West Point. Neb.

WANTED, ACTIVE PARTNER IN A GOOD paying, established business; best location; 1600 required. Address E 38. Bes. Y-Mis 15

GOVERNMENT NOTICES.

(Continued.)

PROPOSALS FOR LEASING THE SUR-plus grazing lands on the Klowa and Comanche and Wichita reservations, United pius grazing lands on the Klowa and Comanche and Wicalta agency. Anadarko, Oklahoma, via Chickasha. I. T. Scaled proposals for grazing horses or scale (but not sheep or hogs) on the surplus lands of the Klowa and Comanche and Wichita reservations of the Klowa and Comanche and Wichita reservations of klanoma, indorsed Troposals for leasing tribul lands for grazing purposes. and addressed to the acting agent of the Klowa and Comanche grazing purposes. and addressed to the acting agent of the Klowa and Comanche grazing purposes. and addressed to the acting agent of the Klowa and Comanche grazing purposes. and addressed to the pastures on the Klowa and Comanche grazing purposes. and addressed to the pastures on the Klowa and Comanche grazing purposes. and addressed to the pastures on the Wichita reservation will be leased for one year from April 1, 188, and the pastures on the Wichita reservation will be leased for one year from April 1, 188, no bid for a different period on either reservation will be leased for one year from April 1, 188, no bid for a different period on either reservation will be leased for one year from April 1, 188, no bid for a different period on either reservation will be leased for one year from April 1, 188, no bid for a different period on either reservation will be leased for one year from April 1, 188, and the description of the pastures on each reservation will be leased for one year from April 1, 188, and all other necessary information will be leased for one year from April 1, 188, and all other necessary information will be required to pay upon the actual number of acres found to be embraced in each, as shown by the survey. Certain of the pastures on both reservations are also unforced to pay upon the actual number of acres found to be embraced in each, as shown by the survey. Certain of the pastures on both reservations are also unforced to pay upon the actual number of acres found to be embraced in each, as shown by the survey. Certain of the pastures of better the founce of the p dians and become their abosinte property
to TRADE FOR PARMS, STOCK OF DRUGS.

Imper yard and mill, set of butcher tools and
pedigreed poland china hogs for clear wild
land; Mo. farm for Neb. farm, make offer.
D. J. Perry, Esster, Neb. Z-Mist 15*

FOR SALE REAL ESTATE.

KOUNTZE PLACE BARGAINS, 12,509, 13,750 TO
16,500. J. J. Gibson, 514 First Nat. Bank Bidg.
RE-399

BARGAINS, HOUSES, LOTS AND FARMS;
sale or trade, F. K. Darling, Barker bis.
Sale or trade, F. K. Darling, Barker bis.
Also fire insurance. Bemis, Paxton block,
also fire insurance. Bemis, Paxton block
RE-M401

NEW COTTAGE, MONTHLY PAYMENTS. 604
Bee Bidg.

RE-M501

LOGAN VALLEY FARMS AND MERCHANdise. Huntsberger & Clements, Lyons, Nebralse.

RE-M502

LOGAN VALLEY FARMS AND MERCHANdise. Huntsberger & Clements, Lyons, Nebralse.

RE-M505

LOGAN VALLEY FARMS AND MERCHANdise. Huntsberger & Clements, Lyons, Nebralse.

RE-M505

LOGAN VALLEY FARMS AND MERCHANdise. Huntsberger & Clements, Lyons, Nebralse.

RE-M505

LOGAN VALLEY FARMS AND MERCHANdise. Huntsberger & Clements, Lyons, Nebralse.

RE-M505

LOGAN VALLEY FARMS AND MERCHANdise. Huntsberger & Clements, Lyons, Nebraska.

RE-M505

LOGAN VALLEY FARMS AND MERCHANdise. Huntsberger & Clements, Lyons, Nebralse.

RE-M505

LOGAN VALLEY FARMS AND MERCHANdise. Huntsberger & Clements, Lyons, Nebralse.

RE-M505

LOGAN VALLEY FARMS AND MERCHANdise. Huntsberger & Clements, Lyons, Nebralse.

RE-M505

LOGAN VALLEY FARMS AND MERCHANdise. Huntsberger & Clements, Lyons, Nebralse.

RE-M505

LOGAN VALLEY FARMS AND MERCHANdise. Huntsberger & Clements. Lyons, Nebralse.

RE-M505

LOGAN VALLEY FARMS AND MERCHANdise. Huntsberger & Clements. Lyons, Nebralse.

RE-M505

LOGAN VALLEY FARMS AND MERCHANdise. Huntsberger & Clements. Lyons, Nebralse.

RE-M505

LOGAN VALLEY FARMS AND MERCHANDISE.

RE-M506

LOGAN VALLEY FARMS AND MERCHANDISE.

RE-M507

LOGAN VALLEY FARMS AND MERCHANDISE.

RE-M508

LOGAN furnish security in an amount equal to the deferred payments for the faithful per-formance of the conditions of the lease through some acceptable security or guar-anty company. Personal bonds will not be accepted. Everything being satisfactory it if proposed to award the grazing privileges of each particular pasture to the bidder proposing to pay the highest price there-for, but the right is hereby reserved to reoroposing to pay the highest price there-for; but the right is hereby reserved to re-lect any and all bids if deemed for the best interest of the Indians and the lenses executed hereunder will be subject to the approval of the secretary of the interior, Each proposal must be accompanied by a certified check or draft upon some United States depository or solvent national bank certified check or draft upon some United States depository or solvent national bank in the vicinity of the bidder's place of residence, made payable to the order of the commissioner of Indian affairs, for at least 5 percentum of the entire amount of the proposal, which check or draft shall be forfeited to the United States for the use and benefit of the Klowa, Comanche, Apache and Wichita Indians, in case any bidder receiving an award shall fail to enter into the prescribed lease for the lands bid upon, and to secure a suitable bond for the faithful performance of his part of the contract; otherwise to be returned to the bidder, Proposals not conforming to the requirements of this advortisement will not be considered. FRANK vertisement will not be considered, FRANK D. BALDWIN, Capt. U. S. A., Acting Indian Agent, Klowa and Comanche As Anadarko, Oklahoma, J24di J24(112tM

ARTICLES OF INCORPORATION.

ARTICLES OF INCORPORATION OF THE W. J. PERRY LIVE STOCK COMMISSION CO.

Notice is hereby given that a corporation has been formed under the laws of Nebraska, in the manner and for the purposes hereinafter specified, and its articles of incorporation have been filed in the offices of the county clerk of ponglas county and of the county clerk of ponglas county and of the secretary of state.

First, The name of the company is "W. J. Perry Live Stock Commission Company."
Second, The principal place of transacting its business is South Omaha, Nebraska, Third, The general nature of the business to be transacted is the buying selling, feeling and handling of live stock on commission, or otherwise; the advancing of money to feeders, shippers and others; the making, endorsing and guaranteing of clerks, drafts and notes, whenever necessary in and about

NOTICE TO CONTRACTORS.

Sealed bids for the construction of the balustrades, docking and finish around ingoon on the exposition grounds will be received until 11 o'clock a. in. Friday, January 28, 1898, Plans and specifications can be seen at the Department office, corner istin and Spencer streets, or sets will be furnished bidders at cost.

The right is reserved to reject any or all bids.

F. P. KIRKENDALL.

Mgr. Grds. & Bidgs. Dept.

Transmississippi and International Exp.

BUILINGTON & MISSOURI
River Railrond—"The Burlington Houte"—General Offices, N.
W. Corner Tenth and Farmann
Streets, Ticket Office, 1002
Farnam Street, Telephone 120,
Depot, Tenth and Mason
Streets, Telephone 128
Lincoln, Denver & west
Lincoln, Denver & colobrado, Utah, California

rado, Utah, California,
Biack Hills, Montains
and Fuget Sound... • 4:25 pm
Lincoln Local • 7:85 pm
Lincoln Past Mail • 2:55 pm
• Dally, • Dally except Sunday.

KANSAS CITY, ST. JOSEPH
& Council Bluffs Railfoad—
"The Burlington Routo"—
Tickets Office, 1502 Farnam
Street, Telephone 250, Depot,
Tenih and Mason Streets, Telephone 128,
Leave, Arrive Burlington

CHICAGO, BURLINGTON & Quinsy Railroad—"The Burlington Route"—Ticket Office, 1502 Farman Street, Telephone 28d. Depot, Tenth and Mason Streets, Telephone 128. Burlington Route

fileago Vestibuled Ex. 5.05 pm hirago Express . 518 an hirago Ext. Louis Ex 5.18 an hirago Ext. Louis Ex 7.12 pm acific Junction Local. **11:49 am ast Mail * Daily ** Daily except Sunday

CHICAGO, MILWAUKEE & ST.
Paul Railway-City Ticket
Onice 150: Farnam Street,
Telephone 251, Depat, Tenth
and Mason Streets, Telephone
128.
Leave. Arrive MILWAUKEE

RAILROADS

(Continued.) CHICAGO, ST. PAUL, MINNE-apolls & Omaha Railway-General offices, Nebraska Division, Fifteenth and Webster Streets, City Ticket Office, 1601 Farnam Street, Telephons, Fifteenth and Webster Streets, 188,

CHIPTAGO & NORTHWESTERN
Railway-City Ticket Offics,
1401 Farnam Street, Telephone
561, Depot, Tenth and Mason
Streets, Telephone 128.
Leave. Arrive.

• 9:05 pm •• 9:05 pm • 4:10 pm • 2:10 pm

road-General Offices, United States National Bank Building, S. W. Corner Twelfith and Farram Streets. Ticket Office, 1801. Depot, Fifteenth and Webster Streets, Telephone 1488.

Arrive. Leave. Sioux Try, Mankato, St. Paur, Minneapolis • 5:53 pm • 9:10 am CHICAGO, ROCK ISLAND & Pacific Railroad—"The Great Rock Island Route"—City Ticket Office, 1323 Farnam Street, Telephone 428, Depot, Tenth and Mason Streets, Telephone 128,

OCKISVANI) ROUTE Leave. Arrive. Chicago and St. Paul Vestibuled Express.... Incoln, Colorado Sp'gs. Pueblo, Denver and • 1:45 pm • 4:50 pm Rock Island......tlantic Express for Des Moines and east-**10:40 am

. Daily .. Daily except Sunday. UNION PACHFIC—"THE OVER-land Route"—General Offices, N. E. Corner Ninth and Farnsin Streets, City Ticket Office, 162 Leave. The Overland Limited"

for Denver, Salt Lake. **Stronsbarg Express ... ** 5:09 pm ***12:50 pm * Daily ** Daily except Sunday. Council Bluffs Local—Leaves, 5:40 n. m.; 6:50

a. m.; 7:39 a. m.; 8:25 a. m.; 10:45 a. m.; 2:15 p. m.; 4:30 p. m.; 5:55 p. m. Arrives, 6:29 a. m.; 7:20 a. m.; 8 a. m.; 9:25 a. m.; 11:30 a. m.; 3:19 p. m.; 5:40 p. m.; 9:05 p. m.; 10:45 p. m. WABASH RAILROAD-TICKET OFFICE, 1411 Farnam Street, felenhone, 222, Depot, Tenth and Mason Streets, Telephone, 123, Leave, Arrive,

to feeders, shippers and others; the making, endorsing and guaranteeing of clocks, drafts and notes, whenever necessary in and about the business and the doing of other things necessary to the full exercise of the corporate powers stated.

Fourth, The amount of capital stock authorized is \$50,000. At least one-half thereof has been subscribed and paid in cash, The remaining \$25,000. or any part thereof, may be issued at any time by the Board of Directors. All stock when issued shall be fully paid up and non-assessable. Fifth, The time of the commencement of the corporation is the first day of January, 1918.

Sixth The highest amount of indebtedness or liability to which the corporation is at any time to subject itself is an amount not to exceed two-thirds of the capital stock. Seventa. The affairs and business of the corporation are to be conducted by a board of three directors and by a president, vice president, secretary, treasurer and manager by said board elected.

In testimony whereof the corporation has caused this notice to be published as by law required.

J. W. GRIBBLE, L. F. STOCKWELL, Secretary.

President.

NOTICE TO CONTRACTORS.

words or another word identical in meaning

or expressing the same meaning be used.

If is not error to refuse to give instructions if their substance is embodied and given in the charge to the jury.

If the actions of the trial court in refusing to give certain requested instructions examined and approved.

If the evidence held sufficient to sustain the verdict.

d Stares No.
d Sta

**10:25 am decision of the trial court vacating a former decree in another action between the same parties.

**10:25 am decision of the trial court vacating a former decree in another action between the same parties.

and all reasonable men must draw the same conclusions therefrom, it is not error for the court to direct a verdict in favor of the party entitled thereto under the pleadings of common sense, "klekt" out of the traces of common sense, "klekt" out of the traces of

3. One not a party to a contract may main-

3. One not a party to a contract may maintain an action thereon when such contract was made for his benefit or the benefit of a class to which he belongs.

Chicago, Burlington & Quiney Railway Company against City of Nebraska City et al. Appeal from Otoe county. Affirmed. Norval. J.

Ordinance No. 226 of Nebraska City was ineffectual, of itself to annex adjacent territory to said city or to extend the territorial limits of the municipality.

2 A city cannot levy a tax on property where its situs is not within the corporate limits.

where its situs is not within the corporate limits,

3. A court of equity will enjoin the collection of a tax which is absolutely void,

Thompson against Thompson, Appeal from Lancaster county. Affirmed, Ryan, C.

In an equitable action by a devisee to quiet title and obtain possession of real property it was sought to recover the rental value of the land which had accrued previous to the revivor of the action in the name of such devisee. Whether or not the devisee under any circumstances would be entitled to such recovery of reat is not determined, because neither put in issue by the pleadings nor argued by counsel.

2. An action of the nature above indicated was pending several years before the death of a testator who was the original planiatiff. The devisee, in whose name the action was

sion by such defendant under circumstances which justified him in making them. Held that the district court properly charged the land finally adjudged to belong to plaintiff with the fair value of such improvements, even though some of sold improvements were made after the commencement of the suit by the testator. of these scholars and thickers a gracious-ness of manner, a certain charm of pres-

were made after the commence. Set of the suit by the testator.

The Life Insurance Clearing Company against Alfabuler, Error from Adams county, Affirmed, Ryan, C.

The evidence in this case examined and held to have justified the jury in finding that the county against a set of the condition president. there was a waiver of a condition precedent with respect to the delivery of a policy—the existence of such condition not having beer communicated to the insured.

communicated to the insured.

2. A special appearance must be assumed to have been promptly overfuled when the affldavit upon which it was founded does not appear in the record in the supreme court.

3. An application for a continuance which failed to disclose the names of absent parties, whose testimony was desired and the les whose testimony was nature of their testimony, held, properly to have been denied. Burkholder against McKinley-Lanning Loan and Trust Company, Error from

the verdict.

Pwekins against Potts, Appeal from Buffalo county. Affirmed, Harrlson, C. J.

The conclusions and decision announced on the former hearing in this cause (for report see 71 N. W., 1917, Neb.) approved and followed.

Perkins against Tilton, Error from Hitch-cock county, Affirmed, Harrison, C. J.

An offer to prove to lay the foundation for the proper presentment of error in the exclusion of purposed testimony as answer to a question to which an objection is sustained must be of matter which would have been admitted as relevant, responsive and pertinent in answer to the rejected interpretation. "stept," "reverst," entrencht," instead of "talked," "walked," "passed," "asked," "stopped," "reversed," "entrenched," and

***Tiso am **10:25 am before the another action between the same parties.

Daily except Sainday ****Daily firmed, Norval, J.

There can be no recovery if there is a material variance between the allegations and the proof. The allegata and probata must be prosent to uniformity. The plans of the spelling reformers would throw the language back to a chaos akin to but uglier proof. The allegata and probata must ee. Spelling reformers would throw the lan-Where the evidence is uncontradicted guage back to a chaos akin to but uglier

court to direct a verdict in favor of the party entitled thereto under the pleadings and proofs.

3. Error in giving an oral instruction is not available in this court where no exception was specially taken on that ground in the trial court at the time the instruction was given.

3. One not a party to a contract may main-

vagaries, they would refuse their contributions until the standard spelling should be again adopted.

tion of women was equality of mental power; "We women have as good brains as you ten, and we are going to prove it." safe to sty, comments Leslie's Weekly, that many believe women have proved, through more than a generation of coilege lives, that their brains are as good as men's, a further step which women and women's colleges should take?

colleges should take?

Humanity makes certain demands on women which it does not make on men. It sets up certain standards of conduct a little higher for women. Whether it ought, we are not now considering; we are only interpreting a social condition. Humanity requires of women gold manners with an urgency which it does not demand of men. It oughtsizes charm, grace and the garces with a strength which it does not by on with a strength which it does not Ly on man's possession of the same traits. It asks of a testator who was the original plantiff.
The devisee, in whose name the action was revived upon the death of the testator, or his petition recovered for rent until the tim of the filling of said petition as though the defendant had during his entire possession been the tenant of the devise. Supporte were findings that the possession of he defendant had been taken and held in soo faith and that hasting and valuable in provements had been made during such porses. women to embedy the "beatitudes" of charactor as it make men to obey the ten commandments of conduct. There is teason to fear that the colleges or women have not given just heed to this demand. They have endrayered to make a holars and thinkers. They should not cease making scholars and thinke, a, and they will not conse. But the colleges should lay strezs beavier and constant upon securing in each

> The methods for securing these great results are questions for the openialist in evolution. to whom we beg to comme d the question. University of Vehres of Votes. The University Ches club is victorious in its tournament with the Business Men's Chess club by a score of 10½ games to 7½. Lee Edwards, P. J. Barron and Elmer Holben were the university champions.

ence, which are the crown of womanhood.

Teaching Manners. One of the first notes struck in the begin-

ning of the movement for the higher educa-

Prof. F. W. Taylor has an interesting and Landsomer Husbard and Landsomer Husbard In the January number of the Gerteman Farmer Magazine, Chicago, upon the great annual fair at Nicol Nevgored, Ressia, which he visited last year. "Inductive Studies in Providing" is the title of the latest text book embodying Ne-broska university methods. It is by Dr. H.

Burkholder against McKinley-Laming
Loan and Trust Company Error from
Kearney country, Affirmed, Ryan, C.

In this case but one question is presented
and that is the sufficiency of the evidence
to sustain the judgment of the district court,
An examination of all the evidence disclosing that this objection is not well taken,
said adapment is affirmed.

Widemair against Weolsey, Error from
Johnson county, Reversed, Norval, J.
Under section 22 of the Code of Civil Procedure a judgment debtor who is the bead
of a family and has no homestead, i. c.
owns neither lands, town lots or houses silb,
jeet to exemption under the homestead laws
of the state may claim as exempt from
forced sple on execution personal property
to the value of \$500
2. The words "subject to exemption as a
homestead" as used in each security for
"lands" and "town lots" as well.
Lorens against the State, Ryeval, J.
A conviction in a criminal case will ordinarily be reversed where the attorney genceral declines to file a brief an the ground
that the evidence is insufficient to support the verdict.
State against Midam! State land, Apply
When an agent, in accordance with a long
course of business deposits in his own name
as agent manyeys of his principal with his
knowledge and consent in a bank which becomes disolvent the money so deposited
will not be declared a frust fund in favor
of the latter and established as a preferred
claim.
Shaffer against Vincent Error from Harlan county, Affirmed, Norval, J.
Shaffer against Vincent Error from Harlan county, Affirmed, Norval, J.
Shaffer against Vincent Error from Harlan county, Affirmed, Norval, J.
Shaffer against Vincent Error from Harlan county, Affirmed, Norval, J.
Shaffer against Vincent Error from Harlan county, Affirmed, Norval, J.
Shaffer against Vincent Error from Harlan county, Affirmed, Norval, J.
Shaffer against Vincent Error from Harlan county. Affirmed, Norval, J.
Shaffer against vincent Error from Harlan county. Affirmed, Norval, J.
Shaffer against vincent Error from Har

Abd by the county to get a receiver of the county of the ental scholar, signalized his retirement from the rectorable of the University of Viercia by taking strong ground in favor of higher female education.

Prof. Charles Ellot Norton once proposed that Harvara university tear down all its halls and rebuild after a coherent and artistic plan for the sake of the educational labeliances of good architectural surroundings on the student body.

