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Burt, Perlman Win
Moot Court Contest

Service To Colombia
Purpose Of Meeting

f
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i-V- ? ;0 i , 1 4i,. , r h p$ versity; Dr. U. J. Grant, local

director of the Rockefeller
Foundation at Bogota; And-

res Restrepo, member of the
board of trustees of the Na-

tional University; and Enrici
Vargas of Bogota.

Representatives of Kansas
State University, Colorado
State University, Iowa State
University and the University
of Missouri all members of
the cooperating
State Universities Associa- -

Two University students,
Donald F. Burt and Harvey
S. Perlman, were named win-

ners of the 1966 Allen Moot
Court competition at the Uni-
versity College of Law Friday.

The pair, as a team, won
the final round of arguments
before members of the Ne-

braska State Supreme Court
and received gold commem-
orative medals at the Co-
llege's annual awards banquet.
Their names will bp inscribed
on a plaque in the College.

In addition to the Allen
awards, Burt and Perlman
were honored for submitting
the best senior brief. In addi

tion, Burt was named winner
of the Dean Roscoe Pound
Memorial Award for his oral
arguments.

Runners up in the 1966 A-

llen competition are Donald
H. Bowman and E. John Stan-
ley.

Members of the Allen Moot
Court Board for the coming
year are Rodney P. Cathcart,
chairman; Gary G. Thomp-
son, secretary; and the fol-

lowing members: Joseph T.
Couillard, John W. DeCamp,
Howard Friedman, Larry D.
Hall, Ronald A. Kastanek,
Stephen Stastny, and William
D. Sutter.

Is" U

tion will participate in the
conference.

Chancellor Clifford M. Har-
din will preside over the con-

ference which opens with
Governor Frank Morrison
hosting the guests for break-
fast Thursday morning. After
informal discussions Thurs-
day, the South American vis-

itors will tour the meat lab-

oratory and the department
of ag information on the east
campus Friday morning and
then travel to Concord to in-

spect the Northeast Nebraska
Experiment Station Friday
afternoon.

Under the contract, fi-

nanced by AID, work will be
done with the Colombian Ag-

ricultural Institute and at the
National University Schools
of Agriculture and Veterinary
Medicine at Bogota, Medellin
and Palmira. Recruiting of
staff for the operation is ex-

pected to start soon.
Dr. William Colwell, chief

of mission in Bogota, is to
direct the project and will
report to Vice Chancellor Ad-

am Breckenridge, who on
July 1 will assume respon-
sibility for all international
programs at the University.

Plans for implementing the
recently signed contract to
render technical service and
assistance in agricultural de-

velopment in Colombia, South
America, will be discussed in
Lincoln on Thursday and Fri-

day.
The meeting will bring to-

gether high government and
education officials from Co-

lombia and representatives ot
the University and other co-

operating midwestern univer-
sities.

The contract between the
University and the U.S.

for International De-

velopment (AID) was recent-
ly signed in Bogota, Colom-
bia.

Participating from South
American is the conference at
the Nebraska Center will be
Dr. Jose Mejia Salazar, minis-
ter of agriculture and pres-
ident of the board of direc-
tors of the Institute of Colom-

bian Agriculture (ICA); Dr.
Fernando Penaranda, director-g-

eneral of ICA; Dr. Alvaro
Gartner, director of educa-
tion at ICA; Dr. Rafael Sam-

per, board of directors mem-
ber, ICA; Dr. Miguel Her-

nandez, Dean of Medellin Uni

Four Nominated MUSIC ... for the Ivy Day festivities was provided by men's and

woman's living units trying for the annual Ivy Day Sing trophy. Shown

here are members of Zeta Tau Alpha, who won third place in the Sing.

Ten Honored As

Chain Leaders
Ten University coeds were

honored Saturday as leaders
of the Ivy and Daisy chains at
the institution's 77th observ-
ance of Ivy Day.

Leaders of the Ivy Chain,
composed of senior women,
were: Judy Tanner, Margie
Lehl, Sandra Heybrock, Mary
Kay Rakow, Barbara Trites
and Sarah Shaw.

The Daisy Chain leaders,
composed of underclasswom-en- ,

were: Betsy White, Nat-
alie Hahn, Joanne Stohlman
and Barbara Pflasterer.

Bowling, Cosier Are
Top Senior Scholars

Alumni Association's new
award to an outstanding sen-

ior went to Shirley Voss. The
award consists of a life mem-
bership in the Alumni Associa-
tion.

Two freshmen were awarded
the Innocents Memorial Schol

arships. They are Roger
Luehrs and Craig Allen
Dreezen.

The Madeline Girard Phil-
anthropic Award went to
Alphi Phi sorority for efforts
in behalf of local and national
charities.

Miss Belzinger
Miss Bentzinger is a junior

in teachers college from Lin-

coln. She is a member of

Alpha Xi Delta sorority.

Beta Sigs Honor
At the annual Beta Sigma

Psi Gold Rose Formal, Kathy
Bentzinger was chosen the
1966 Beta Sigma Psi
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letter adds, "is attitude to-

wards student's questions is
always warm and lively. Both
in and after class, he express-
es a great willingness to dis-

cuss ideas and literary tech-
niques with his students."

On Second Book
The letter continued that

Wolfe has written reviews for
the "Prairie Schooner, has
published articles in journals
and is working on his second
book on contemporary fic-

tion."
"Wolfe's youthful energy,

his academic seal and his in-

terest in advising student
groups on campus" were also
cited in the letter.

Outstanding Psychologist
"Levine is an outstanding

psychologist, teacher and
member of the University
community," one letter of
nomination states.

He serves as an advisory
editor of the Journal of Con-

sulting Psychology, editor of
the Nebraska Symposium on
motivation and chairman of
the Region V Mental Health
Planning Committee.

The letter adds that Levine
has also contributed numer-
ous articles to professional
journals and has "been in-

strumental in organizing var-
ious community mental health
programs."

Clinic Supervisor
At the University, the let-

ter continues, Levine has been
supervisor of the psycholog-
ical clinic and director of the
clinical training program.

The letter notes that as dir-
ector of the program, he "has
been an enthusiastic and stim-
ulating teacher and adminis-
trator. He is someone who
always has time to be in-

terested in the problems and
aspirations of both under-
graduate and graduate stu-

dents."
Levine's activities on cam-

pus, the letter adds, includes
contributing "to various stu-

dent activities, clubs and
panel discussion."

"Furthermore," the letter
concludes, "Levine has been
named a member of the board
of directors of the Nebraska
Civil Liberties Union".
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Vicky Ann Dowling and
John H. Cosier were honored
as the top scholars in the s e

class at the University's
Ivy Day ceremonies Saturday.

Miss Dowling was cited as
the senior with the top wo-

men's average with a 4.13.
Cosier was cited as the

senior with the high men's
average a 4.157.

The Mortar Board Scholarship-A-

ctivities Trophy was
presented to Chi Omega sor-

ority. Gamma Phi Beta was
second, Delta Gamma, third;
Kappa Alpha Theta, fourth;
and Kappa Kappa Gamma,
fifth.

The Innocents Scholarship-Activitie- s

trophy was won by
Beta Theta Pi with Farm
House, second. Theta XI
placed third followed by Alpha
Gamma Rho, fourth; Sigma
Phi Epsilon, fifth; Beta Sig-

ma Psi, sixth; Kappa Sigma,
seventh; Phi Kappa Psi,
eighth; and Triangle, ninth.

Winner of the American As-

sociation of University Wo-

men's award, presented to
the senior woman on the ba-

sis of scholarship and profes-
sional interest was Vicki Dow-

ling. A senior in the College
of Arts and Sciences major-
ing in English, she is a mem-
ber of the Nebraska Career
Scholars program and was
elected to Phi Beta Kappa.
She also has won a Woodrow
Wilson fellowship.

The C. B. Schultz Commun-
ity Service Award, presented
in honor of Dr. C. B. Schultz,
curator of the University
Museum, to the fraternity
which has contributed most
to community service during
the year, went to Alpha Tau
Omega.

The University of Nebraska
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those who have become asso-

ciated with him," the letter
concludes.

Daub Nominated
Daub, his letter of nomina-

tion states, is a senior in the
College of Law, "Where he
has contributed greatly to
the development of the college
and the University."

The letter continues that
he served as University pres-
ident, regional governor and
national vice president of the
American Law Students As-

sociation and as president of
his legal fraternity.

Daub, the letter noted, is
currently working on a pro-

gram "which will establish a
placement service for law
graduates. A program which
has been needed for many
years."

University Influenced
"The University has also

been influenced by the lead-
ership of Hal Daub," the let-

ter continues.
He has served as a mem-

ber of the ASUN constitution-
al convention, the law adviser
to the Student Tribunal for
three years and a founder and
influence in Vox Populi.

Daub, the letter concludes,
has shown "clear and decis-
ive leadership and obvious
contribution to the Univer-
sity."

Wolfe Nominated
The letter nominating Wolfe

cites, "English 265, the course
he has been teaching, as one of
the most popular and one of
the best on campus."

Wolfe, the letter continued,
"has the rare teaching ability
to organize his material, to
present it succinctly and in
depth and, finally, to encour-
age his students."

"Although he researches
all of the books he teaches
with great thoroughness," the

Madrigal,
Ensemble
In Concert

The University Madrigal
Singers and Brass Ensemble
will present a public concert
at 7:30 p.m. Tuesday in the
Nebraska Union ballroom.

The Madrigal Singers, a se-

lect group of talented fresh-
men singers, are under the
direction of John Moon, as-

sociate professor of music
education. The Brass Ensem-
ble is directed by Jack Snider,
professor of brass instru-
ments.

The program:
"Passacaglia and Fugue"

by Presser; "Theme and
Variations" by Reynolds;
"Jubilate Deo" by Gabrieli;
"Sing We and Chant It," by
Morley; three works by Mont-

everdi: "0 What Consuming
Torments" "0 Mirtillo," and
"Cruel Amaryllis;" "My Bon-B- y

Lass," by Morley; "Flora
Gave Me Fairest Flowers"
by Wilbye; "Grace My Lovely
One, Fair Beauties," and
"Lady, Your Eye My Love

Enforced" by Weelkes; "Ra-

diant Stars, Above the Moun-

tains Glowing" by Cui; and
"A Little White Hen" by
Scardello.

Hit Ballad and Blues have e
the Music World
cn its Jaded car!
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PERSHING AUDITORIUM
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This I Jaguar for Men. After-sha- v and cologne combined.

Lusty. Powerful. Potent. Come on stronger. Stays on
longer. $4.50. Soap on a rope, $2.50.

HIGH POWERED OFFER!
Action-packe- d racing car scenes! By today's most popular

racing artist, Walter Gotschke! Four of them ! 'Handsome

11 x 13 lithographed prints! Each suitable for

framing! Each a collector's Item. A $5.00 value, only $11

Send Jaguar boxtop attached to a slip of paper with your

name and address (clearly printed) and $1 check, or money

order (no cash, please), to: Jaguar-Yardle- Box 1009N,

Radio City Station, New York, New York. Offer expires Sep-

tember 30, 1966. Offer void In states or localities where

prohibited, taxed, licensed, or otherwise restricted by law.

JAGUAR FROM YARDLEY

Bo!d Nev Breed
by ARROW

available at

Downtown and Gateway
Jim Dler Enterprise;


