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THE FEEE GIFT

Wherefore, aa by one man sin en
tered into the world, and death by
Bin; and bo death passed upon all
men, for that all have Binned. There
for as by the offense of one judgment
came upon all man to condemnation
even bo by the righteousness of one
the free gift came upon all men unto
justification of life. Romans v. 12

and 18.
rot

If we could see ourselves as others
see us we wouldn't believe it.

:o!- -
Modern necessities are things peo-

ple used to get along without.
tot

Being afraid won't hurt you, but
acting it out puts the run on you.

roi
Lots of folks seem to think the

world owes them two or three liv
ings.

:o:
These days are getting so short you

hardly have time to fly from coast to
coast now.

ro:
It should be mentioned that the

state of unrest is located in the mind
at present.

:o:
Two New Orleans mothers have 18

kids each. What if they lived on ei-

ther side of you?
:oj

Canadian bankers offer $10,000
for six robbers. Ought to get at least
a dozen for that. it

ro:
One compensation of nature . is

when a "brassy young man thinks he's
a golden opportunity.

:o:
A printer arrested in New York is

supposed to have three wives. Re-

lease him for punishment.
:o: J

Springfield, 111., will have a baby
Bhttw?,rAbdut 1,000 babies-wil- l en
ter much to their disgust.

' tot
The reason things are different is

because the old fashioned father now
has a son who keeps two automobiles.

:o:
About all you can say in favor of

moving Is that it shows you whether
the furniture is really solid or ve-

neered.
:ck

A road hog is the man who honks
right at your left wheel after you
have succeeded in passing seventeen
other cars.

:o:
A week from Tuesday and the girls

and boys will be wending their way
up high school hill. Many joyfully,
and a few who don't care whether
school keeps or nof.

. tot
General Wood has disproved that

the Philippine National bank has lost
37 million dollars in the last six
years. Yes, the United States put up
most of the money.

:o:
France will knock off a few bil-

lions from German indemnity If the
United States will ' scale down
France's debt. But will France pay
us back any of the money we spent In
that country buying things at war
prices?

:o:
Senator LaFollette took an expert

statistician with him on his journey
to Europe. It would also need a bat-
tery of adding machines if the sena-
tor is going to pry into the finances
of Germany and Russia. La Follette
expects to return on the Leviathan
about the middle of October and will
have his deadly statistics ready for
the opening of congress.

:o:
Thirty million immigrants have

entered the United States since 1830.
Uncle Sam has checked up the 14
million of these who are still living.
Five million are in the upper valley,
same in the middle Atlantic states,
two million in New England, one
million in the south, 500,000 on the
Pacific coast. The strongholds of the
native born are in the west and
southwest.

:o:
Street cars will soon disappear en-

tirely in New York and be replaced
by busses, predicts that city's police
traffic expert, Dr. John A. Harris. He
also predicts overhead roads and
streets with four lanes the inner two
for express traffic, autos to run a
mile without stopping. This may be
a picture of the average city later,
though chances are that the air-
planes will to considerable extent
eUminaat autos by taking traffi in
the air.

PEE YEAB EN ADVANCE

Anvthine can happen. Barber
shops are opening in Moscow.

:o:- -
A San Antonio, Tex., golfer played

10 hours. Hope he found It.
:o:

A man doesn't need security when
he starts out to borrow trouble.

-- :o:
Some men will shine. One made

$890 shining shoes in Sing Sing.
:o:

It takes three generations to make
a gentleman. Either that or three
hundred dollars.

rot
Some of us are anxious to earn

money and more of us are merely
anxious to get it.

ror
Keen away from Athens Girls

wearing sleeveless dresses there are
smeared with tar.

:o:
An ice man- - is a man who makes

his living by listening to a lot of
poor jokes about scales.

ro:
Cuba pays the U. S. all its war

time debt. If others would follow
suit, we could perhaps have cheaper
living.

:o:
Food prices are still going up,

Washington reports. But just wait
until Magnus Johnson gets to Wash-
ington.

o

About the only successful way
nowadays to get money without work
is to create enough sentiment to get

by taxation.
:o:

If Adam was human he probably
told his neighbors that he talked
pretty rough to the Lord when be
got turned out.

:o:
The average man thinks he has a

forgiving spirit because he sympa-
thizes with the criminal who has
wronged the other fellow.

:o:
There are a lot of motorists who

apparently think the signs: "stop,
look and listen" are placed at the
railroad crossings for engineers to
read.

:o:
Len Small has declared himself a

candidate for on as governor
of Illinois. If the voters of Illinois
re-ele- ct him, he should be given the
office for keeps.

:o:
President Cool id ge was born on a

farm and is up and moving around at
5:45 in the morning. This record
probably will stand until Magnus
Johnson gets there.

:o:
Twin optimists are the man who

looks for signals from the people of
Mars and his brother who thinks he
can discern the quality of a canta-
loupe by intently gazing at Its out
side.

:oi
It seems as -- if there had been a

falling off in husband shooting in the
last three months. Are the ladies
practicing forbearance, or have the
men learned to surrender before hos
tilities commence?

-- :o:-
Several months ago it was an

nounced that Clarence Saunders,
head of the Piggly Wiggly chain
stores had whipped Wall street in a
big financial battle. Now It is an
nounced that Saunders is broke and
outof a job. Wall street has a habit
of getting even.

-- :o:-
An enterprising American found

some compensation in his sojourn
abroad. He had occasion to send out
a huge number of circular letters to
his trade and found an advantage
it doing it in Germany. The postage
on the mail cost him about $1,000
in American gold, while the charges
fixed by Uncle Sam in thi3 country
would have reached nearly $5,000.
The difference paid most of the ex-
pense of the trip and the latter re-
ceived unusual attention because of
its foreign postmark.

:o:
When labor leaders get to fighting

among themselves for cdntrol of their
unions for the sake of graft it would
seem to be a-g- idea for reputable
workers to get out from under. In
one of the Chicago unions a labor
boss admitted with some pride that
he had been collecting $10 a week
from each of slfty men to whom he
had given private membership cards.
It appeared that he was boss of his
union by sheer might. If anybody
had the temerity to raise his voice la
opposition he was knocked down and
out.

"EQUAL EIGHTS"

The National Woman's party has
started: campaign for the adoption
of . a twentieth amendment to the
federal constitution, the stated pur-

pose being to establish total political
and economic equality of men and
women throughout the country.
From the platform adopted by the
party It appears that some of the de-

mands should be granted, some al-

ready have been granted, some could
ndt possibly be granted, and some!
are not desired by the majority or

the women. The specific demands
made In their behalf are:

Control of their children; control
of their property and earnings; right
to make contracts citizenship rights;
inheritance rights; equal opportuni-
ties in Bchools, universities, govern
ment service, professions and indus
tries; equal pay for equal work; au
thority in the church; right after
their marriage to their own identity;
a single moral standard.

Few will question woman's right
to her property and earnings, to an
equal share in government, schools
and public service; fewer still her
right to her own identity whether
married or single. But wnat is
meant by "control of their children?
"Their" seems to ignore the fact that
children also have fathers, who, it
seems, should have "equal rights" in
the control of "their" children. In
actual practice as a matter of fact,
the courts already have allowed the
mother more than an equal share in
the control of children.

It may be admitted that women
should have authority in the church
es, but do they propose to have the
federal government regulate church
affairs to insure that the women are
given the authority to which they are
entitled? The same question applies
to "equal opportunities" in profes
sions and industries. It will be rath
er too difficult to compel a man to
consult a lady physician, or to en
gage a lady lawyer, or to hire a lady
foreman against his will.

Any attempt to by law a single
standard of morals is the product of
native optimism. Legally, no dou-
ble standard exists. Divorce 13 grant-
ed to husbands or to wives on identi-
cal moral grounds; a statutory of-

fense by a man is as serious in the
eyes of the law as by a woman. In-

deed, in some legislation, such as the
Mann act, the tendency, when a mor-
al offense is jointly committed by a
man and a woman, is to place the en-

tire enus on the man. Moral stand-
ards exist, not on the statute books,
but in the opinions, tastes and senti-
ments of men and women. Passing
laws will not alter the character of
the human brain cells.

Any attempt to establish absolute
equality between men and women ig-

nores the plain fact that men and
women are made unequal by nature,
and that nature's biological processes
remain obstinately indifferent to leg-

islation. Such matters cannot al-

ways be decided on ethical grounds.
A law requiring fathers to bear their
share of the children might seem
eminently fair, but it would "hardly
be effective. Moreover, certain
rights entail certain burdens, and
some of the burdens borne by men
cannot be borne by women. Sensible
women do not want privileges which
entail oppressive obligations; they
only desire that women be given ev-
ery opportunity to develop the pow-
ers and abilities which are naturally!
theirs. Where such opportunities are!
within the. proper scope of law, the
laws should be passed. But to at-
tempt to revolutionize and reorgan-
ize the whole field of social rela-
tions by law is blind folly.

-- :o:
A fellow has to be something of a

sprinter to keep up with his good in-

tentions.
:o:

It has been figured out that it
takes 762 eggs to pay a plasterer for
a day's work but it should be quiet.
The hens of this country are a pretty
discouraged lot as it Is.

' o:
If the weather man had been so

minded, he could have played a grim
Joke by sending on a spell of rainy
weather and muddy roads while
cheaper gasoline was in existence.

:o:
Secretary .Mellon found many evi-

dences of prosperity on his trip to
Europe, but the point is will Europe
use its prosperity to pay for the last
war or get ready for the next one?

:o:
The hatonal education convention

passed resolutions . calling for the
correction of all our illiteracy by
1935. it is a fine thing to be able
to make folks bright by passing a
resolution, i The " illiteracy resolu-
tion should' have been passed a cen-
tury ago.

: :o:- -
Next to a doctor giving reasons

why your tonsils should come out,
nobody has ever grouped so many
good reasops under one head as a
woman who has determined to have
her hair bobbed. ''. -

Excursion
TO

Lincoln
'!M (ijft.

To aooommodate patron de-Irln- jr

to visit the

Nebraska
State Fair

the Burlington will sell round-tri-p

tlokets at rate of fare and
are SI.OO)

September 1 to T, Inclusive,
final return limit September 8.

R. W. CLEMENT,
Ticket Agr nt

CRITICISM OF

SECY WALLACE

Dr. Marsh Charges Livestock Com

mission Finns With Bobbing
the Farmers.

Des Moines, la., Aug. 22. A de
mand of the next congress for an in
vestigation of the federal department
of agriculture is to be made by the
farmers' national council, Benjamin
C. Marsh of Wasihngton, D. C, man
aging director or tne council, aeciar- -
ed in an address here tonight before
the conference for progressive politi
cal action.

"Secretary of Agriculture Wal
lace," declared Mr. Marsh, "has turn
ed the administration of the stock
yard acts, passed by congress in 1921,
over to the packers and commission
men to enforce with results highly
satisfactory to the food trust. Under
this administration irregularities
have occurred upon which we will
demand an investigation."

One of the cases of. alleged irregu
larities, Mr. Marsh said, was at the
South St. Paul livestock exchange,
other instances, he declared also
would be cited if a committee is ap
pointed.

Commission men, according to the
admission of the president of the
South St. Paul exchange, have been
guilty of Irregularities in robbing
farmers of large sums of money, Mr
Marsh declared.

"When the secretary of agricul
ture found that sixteen St. Paul firms
had been guilty of robbing the farm-
ers who sold them livestock," Mr
Marsh continued, "the secretary, in-

stead of forcing the firms to make
restitutions to the farmers, turned
over the facts secured by the auditor
to the directors of the exchange. Al- -
tho the act states that any officer or
employe of the commission who
makes public any information obtain
ed by the commission without its au
thority, unless directed by a court,
shall be deemed guilty of a niisde
meanor and subject to punishment.

"The St. Paul livestock exchange
subsequently fined the offending
firms sums ranging from $50 to $750
and suspended several firms."

"The secretary of agriculture in
stead of enforcing the law upon the
livestock commission firms, sent his
auditor to hound the
livestock commission."

Mr. Marsh added that the secre
tary of agriculture had failed to
compel the meat packers to install a
uniform system of accounting thru
which he migt better regulate the
packing Industry.

Hemstitching and Picotlng attach
ment, fits all sewing machines, price
$2. Checks 10c extra. Lights Mail
Order House, Box 127, Birmingham,
Ala.

ORDER TO SHOW CAUSE

In the. district court of the County
of Cass, Nebraska.

in reappiication or it. j. iiucu-ma- n,

guardian of Ruth A. C. Bever
age, incompetent, for license to sell
real estate.

Now on this 11th day of August,
1923. there was presented the peti
tion of R. C. Hitchman, guardian of
Ruth A. C. Beverage, incompetent,
for authority to sell the life estate
of the said Ruth A. C. Beverage, and
to invest the proceeds thereof; and
it appearing from such petition that
it is necessary and will be beneficial
to the said Ruth A. C. Beverage that
said interest should be sold.

It is therefore ordered that the
next of kin and all persons interested
in the estate of the said Ruth A. C.
Beverage, apDear before the judge of
the district court of the County of
Cass, Nebraska, at chambers in the
county court house in the city of
Plattsmouth, Cass county, Nebraska,
on the 17th day of September, 1923,
at 10 o'clock a. m., to show cause, if
any there be, why a license should
not be granted for the sale of said
interest.

It is further ordered that a copy
of this order be served upon the next
of kin of the said Ruth A. C. Bever-
age and all persons interested in her
estate by publication of this order
for three successive weeks in the
Plattsmouth Journal, a legal newspa-
per published and of general circu-
lation in the County of Cass, Ne- -

Dated this 11th day of August,
1923.

By the Court
JAMES T. BEG LEY,

13-2w- ks District Judge.

ORDER OF HEARING
on Petition Tor Appointment of

Administrator.

The State Cass coun
ty. ss. .

In the County Court.
In the matter of the estate of

Sarah Ann Hoham. deceased.
On reading and filing the petition

of Aurelia B. Cooper, praying that
administration of said estate may be
granted to W. E. Hand, as Adminis-trator- ;

v

Ordered, that September 12th, A
D. 1923, at ten o'clock a. m.. is as
signed for hearing said petition, when
all persons interested in said matter
may appear at a County Court to be
held in and for said county, and
show cause why the prayer of peti-
tioner should ' not be granted, and
that notice of the pendency of said
petition and the hearing thereof be
given to all - persons interested in
said matter by publishing a eopy of
this order in the Plattsmouth Jour-
nal, a semi-week- ly newspaper print-
ed in said county for three successive
weeks, prior to said day of hearing.

Dated August 15th. A. D. 1923.
ALLEN J. BEESON,

(Seal) al6-3- w. County Judge.

SHERIFF'S SALE
Notice is hereby given that by vir-

tue of an Order of Sale issued by tho
Clerk of the District Court of the
Second Judicial District of Nebraska.
within and for Cass county, in an ac
tion wnerein Rosina Timmas is
plaintiff and Jacob P. Falter et al
are defendants, I will on the 15thday of September, A. 1). 1923, at-t- en

o'clock a. m.. at the south front
door of the Court House in the City
of Plattsmouth, Cass county, Ne-
braska, offer for sale at public auc-
tion, the following described real es-
tate, to-w- it:

Lots 1, 2, 3, 4, 5, 6, 7, 8, 9 and
10, in Block 5;

Lots 1, 2. 3, 4. 5. 6, 7, 8, 9, 10,
11 and 12, in Block 6;

Lots 7, 8, 9, 10, 11 and 12 in
Block 7;

Lots 3. 4, 5, 6, 7, 8, 9. 10. 11. 12.
13. 14, 15 and 16 in Block 9;

Lots io, ll and 12 in Block 10;
Lots 1. 2. 3. 4, 5. 6, 7, 8, 9, 10,

11 and 12, In Block 11;
Lots 1, 2. 3. 4, 5, 6. 7. 8. 9 and

10. in Block 12;
Lots 1, 2. 3. 4, 5, 5. 7. 8. 9 and

10, In Block 13;
Lots 1, 2. 3r 4, 5, 6. 7. 8. 9. 10.

11. 12, 13 and 14, in Block 14:
lxts 1, 2. 3, 4. 5, C. 7. 8. 9. 10

ll. 12, 13 and 14, in Block 15";
- Lots 1, 2. 3, 4, 5, 6. 7. 8. 9. 1
and 11 in Block 16;

All in Palmer's Out Lots, an add!
tion to the City of Plattsmouth, (n
the County of Cass, Nebraska, all
located within the northwest quarter
(rsvi4) of the northeast quarter
( E J4 ) of Section nineteen. (19
Township twelve (12) North, Range
fourteen (14) East of the Sixth Prin
cipal Meridian.

Given under my hand this 6th day
or August, A. 1). 1923.

C. D. QUINTON,
Sheriff.

NOTICE OF REFEREE'S SALE
In the District Court of the Coun

ty of Cass, Nebraska.
Clara L. Curtis and husband. Bra

den Curtis; Adah I. Ross and hus
band, John Ross; Flora E. Barber
and husband William Barber; W. F.
Kepler and wife Sophia Kepler
Plaintiffs, vs. Hazel Biggerstaff and
husband Everett Biggerstaff, and
Pauline Kepler, a minor, defendants

Notice is hereby given that under
and by virtue of a decree of the Dis
trict Court of Cass county, Nebras
ka, entered in the above entitled
cause on the 28th day of July, 1923
and an order of sale entered by said
court on tthe 28th day of July, 1923
the undersigned Sole Referee, on the
10th day of September, 1923, at
o'clock a. m., at the farm house lo
cated on said premises, one mile
south and three miles east of Elm-woo- d,

will sell at public auction to
the highest bidder, under the terms
hereinafter specified, the following
described real estate, to-w- it:

The southeast quarter (SE'i)
of Section thirteen; (13) Town-
ship ten, (10) Range ten, (10)
east of the Gth P. M. in the
County of Cass, Nebraska.
Terms of said sale will be ten per

cent (10) cash and the balance
payable March 1, 1924. Abstract of
title is in the hands of the Referee
and will be furnished to purchaser.
Possession to be given March 1, 1924.
1923 taxes will be paid and rent re
tained by the parties to the suit
Said sale will remain open for one
hour.

Notice is also hereby given that
under and by virtue of said decree
and order of sale, the undersigned
Sole Referee, on the 10th day of Sep
tember, 1923, at 11 a. m. at the farm
house located on said premises three
miles west and two miles south of
Avoca, will sell at public auction to
the highest bidder, under the terms
hereinafter specified, the following
described real estate, to-w- it:

The southwest quarter (SWU )
of Section three, (3) Township
nine, (9) Range eleven, (11)
Otoe county, Nebraska.
The terms of said sale will be ten

per cent (10) cash and the balance
payable March 1, 1924. Abstract of
title is in the hands of Jhe referee
and will be furnished to purchaser.
Possession to be given March 1, 1924.
1923 taxes will be paid and rent re
tained by the parties . to the suit.
Said sale will remain open for one
hour.

Dated this 30th day of July, A. D.
923.

C. S. ALDRLCH,
W. A. ROBERTSON, Referee.

Attorney for Plaintiffs.
; ." a6-lm- o SW

W 9 . a9 9 .?MTtMT.---- t T T 9

35 years Office 4
Experience Coates Block 4

DR. C. A. MARSHALL
4--

Dentist

M-l-- H I HM' 1 1"'M"M"M-I- -

NOTICE TO CREDITORS

The State of Nebraska, Cass coun-
ty, ss.

In the County Court.
In the matter of the estate of Ann

M. Goodell, deceased.
To the creditors of said estate:
You are hereby notified that I will

sit at the County Court room in
Plattsmouth, In said county, on the
21st day of September, A. D. 1923,
and on the 21st day of December,
A. D. 1923, at 10 o'clock a. m. of
each day to receive and examine all
claims against said estate, with a
view to their adjustment and allow-
ance. The time limited for the pre-
sentation of claims against said es-
tate is three months from the 21st
day of September, A. D. 1923, and
the time limited for payment of debts
is one year from said 21st day of
December, 1923

Witness my hand and the seal of
said County Court, this 18th day of
August, 1923.

ALLEN J. BEESON.
(Seal) a23-4- w. County Judge,

.
LEGAL NOTICE

In the District Court of Cass coun-
ty, Nebraska.

Martha Celestia Reed, Plaintiff, vs.
David T. Griffith et al. Defendants.

To the defendants David T. Grif-
fith; Mrs. David T. Griffith, real
name unknown; David T. Griff eth ;

Mrs. David T. Griffeth, real name un- -
known; II. L. Pitzer, real name un- -
known; Mrs. H. L.. Pitzer. real name
unknown; Henry L. Pitzer and Mrs.
Henry L. Pitzer, real name unknown;
me neirs, aevisees, legatees, personal
representatives and all other persons
interested in the respective estates of
David T. Griffith, deceased; Mrs.
David T. Griffith, deceased; David
T. Griffeth, deceased; Mrs. David T.
Griffeth, deceased; H. L. Pitzer, de--
ceased; Mrs. H. L. Pitzer, deceased;
Henry L. Pitzer, deceased and Mrs.
Henry L. Pitzer, deceased, real names
unknown; and all persons having or
claiming any interest in the north
?alf,,!A f. e ?orthwst Qur"
W iVA f Sectl?? 4 Tow?8h'p
lh r.T ?f 5ange 13' Eatf he
Gth P. M., in Cass county, Nebraska,
real names unknown

You and each of you are hereby
notified that on the 8th day of Aug
ust, 1923, the plaintiff filed her suit
in the District Court of Cass coun-
ty, Nebraska, the object and prayer
of which Is to establish and quiet
and confirm plaintiff's title in and
to the above described lands, and to
enjoin each and all of you from hav- l
ing or. claiming to have --any right, I

title, estate, lien or Interest either
legal or equitable in or to said real
estate, or any part thereof, and to
enjoin you and each of you from inA.any manner interfering with plain - 1

tiff's possession and enjoyment of
said premises and for equitable re -
lief. I

This notice is given pursuant to I

an order of said Court. You are here -
Dy required to answer said petition

1 j at rt j a. j 1un ur unure muuuay, me im uay
of September, 1923, and failing so to
do your default will be entered there
in, and judgment taken upon the
plaintiff's petition.

MARTHA CELESTIA REED,
Plaintiff.

By A. L. TIDD,
Her Attorney.

al3-4- w.

ORDER OF HEARING AND NO
TICE OF PROBATE OF WILL

In the County Court of Cass coun
ty, Nebraska.

State of Nebraska, County of Cass,
ss.

To all persons interested in the es
tate of Christian Gurr, deceased:

On reading the petition of Fred
Backemeyer praying that the instru-
ment filed in this court on the 8th
day of August, 1923, and purporting
to be the last will and testament of
the said deceased, may be proved and
allowed, and recorded as the last will!
and testament of Christian Gurr, de
ceased; that said Instrument be ad
niitted probate,

uno miner ana x uacKeuiejer as
" i

T 1 I . 1 . 1 . 1 . Jit is iiereoy oruereu mat you, anu i

pcuuuo ,u orderedthe saidk0D?inie5
county, the 4th day September.
A. 1923, ten o'clock a m,,

o i .ho-- o TOw
prayer of the petitioner should not
be granted, and that notice of the

rlf bo,a nanttnn arwi f,af. .u"r:me ileal lug iiitrtuipersons interested said matter by
publishing a copy of this Order in
the Plattsmouth Journal, a semi--
weekly newspaper ' printed in said
county, for three successive weeks
prior said day of hearing.

Witness my hand, and seal of said
court, this Sth of August, D.
1923.

' ALLEN J. BEESON,
(Seal) al3-3- w. County Judge

ORDER OF HEARING
..Petition for Appointment of

Administrators.

The State of Nebraska, Cass coun
ty, x

In the County Court.
matter the of Au

gusta Gurr, deceased.
On readins: and flliner the petition
Ida Backemeyer praying that ad- -

ministration said estate may
granted Miller and Fred
Backemej-er- , as Administrators;

Ordered, that September 4th. A. D. !

1923. at ten o'clock m. is asslemed
for hearing said petition, when all
persons interested said matter
may appear a County Court to be

in and for said county, . and
show cause why the prayer of pet!
tioner should not granted;
that notice of the pendency of said
petition and the hearing thereof be

to all " persons interested
said matter by publishing a copy of
this order in the Plattsmouth Jour-
nal, a semi-week- ly newspaper 'print-
ed county, for three successive
weeks, prior said day of hear-
ing. ,

Dated August 8th. 1923.
ALLEN J. BEESON. ,

(Seal) al3-3- w. County Judre.

ORDER OF HEARING
on Petition for Appointment

Administrator

State of Nebraska, Cass cour

In the County Court.
In the matter of the estate of Edn

Cunningham, deceased.
On reading and filing the petltio

of C. E. Cunningham praying tha
administration of said estate may o

granted to W. E. Hand, as Adminli
trator; .

Ordered, that September 12 in,
D. 1923, at 10 o'clock m. is af
signed for hearing petition
when all persons Interested in sai,
matter may appear at a County Cour
to be held and for county
and show cause why the prayer
petitioner should not be granted; an!
that notice of the pendency of sal
netltion and the hearing thereof
civen to all persons interested li
said matter by publishing copy
this order in the Plattsmouth Jourj
nal. a semi-week- ly newspaper pnns
ed in said county, for three succeesivi

I weeks, prior said day or nearing.
Dated August 17th, 19Z3.

. ALLEN J. BEESON,
(Seal) a20-3- w. County Judgd

LEGAL NOTICE!
In the District Court of Cam aouvi

ty, Nebraska. J
Bvron Golding. Plaintiff, vs. Ida Pi

Reynolds, George W. Kinser and Uri
George W. Kinser, real name nni
known, hia wife, al. Defendants

Tn t.h defendants Georre W. Klni
Ber an(1 Mr8. George W. Kinser. real
name unknown, his wife:

you are hereby notified that
the 26th day of June. 1918. th
plaintiff filed his suit in the District
court of Cass county, Nebraska,
aSratnt nnrt nthan thm nhlnriLn(i nmvr nf whlrh tn rnrnr.lnw
tax Bale certificates owned and held
by plaintiff Lot 10 in Block 43,
in th Citv nf Plftttmnniith- - In fViid

L,,,,,.. NAhrnkn n1 tnr nmftAhld
rellef. This notice Is given pursoaiH
to order of Md court.

You are required answer said
petition or before Monday, Octol
ber 8, 1923. or your default will
entered Judgment taken upon
plaintiff s petition against you.

BYRON GOLDINO.
Plaintiff.

By A. L. TIDD,
a27-4- w. His Attorney

ORDER TO SHOW CAUSE

In the District Court of Cass coun
ty, Nebraska.

In the matter of the Guardianship
of Dorothy Elizabeth Trent, Minor.

Now, this 20th day of August,
D. 1923, this cause came for

to and the adminis-- J sarae to better advantage for saidtration of said estate be granted tomlnort and for neCessary expense fo
reu

on caicu oo.iu mouo, it is tnererore that allmay, and do, appear at perj
Court to be held in and for
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hearing upon the petition of Charles
A. Trent, guardian of Dorothy Ellza- -

Jbeth Trent, minor, praying for li
cense to sell an undivided three
eighths part of the following describe

led real estate, to-w- it:

CnmmpnclTur nt & int flftira - " -

two (521 rods west of the north
east corner of the northwest
quarter (NW) of Section
twenty-thre- e, (23) in Township
eleven dl) North, Range thir-
teen (13) east of the Sixth Prin-
cipal Meridian, Cass county, Ne-
braska, running thence south
one hundred sixteen (116) rods,
thence west to the east boun-
dary line of the right-of-wa- y of
the Omaha and Southern Rail-
way company, thence northeast-
erly along the east boundary
line of said right-of-wa- y to the
north line of said Section twenty-th-

ree, (23) thence east to the
place of beginning; also known
as Tax Lots 4, 22. ' 28 in the
northeast quarter in the north-
west quarter, and Tax Lot 27
in the northwest quarter of the
northwest quarter and Tax Lot
23 in the southwest quarter of
the northwest quarter and Tax
Lot 29 in the southeast quarter
of the northwest quarter of said
Section, Township and Range

for the purpose of th

educating and keeping said minor.
sam minor navine, no Dersonai e&'
ap

""V? .the.conrt4 0Uose n. P10"day of Septem
ber-- A- - ? "23, at 10:00 o'clock aj
m-o- f 8aid hw caueay:Ato
a license be granted t
said Guardian to sell the above del,, , . . -

f"5 v"rua
?f rlnvKe8tIn th,e P8 thereoi
'?rtthe bene.fi. ?f ' Jd m,norJ, ,Hthat a copy of this Order be published
three successive weeks in the Piatts;
uiuuui journal prior iu saiu uate. I

Dated this 20th day of August, A
D. 1923.

JAMES T. BEGLEY,
Judge of the Dlstrid

a23-3- w. Court.

NOTICE TO CREDITORS

The State of Nebraska, Cass counity, ss.
In the County Court.
in tne matter or the estate oi

George R. South, deceased. i

To the creditors of said estate:
You are hereby notified that I wil!

'st at the County Court room if
Plattsmouth in said county, on thi

om aay or septemDer, A. D. 1&23
and on the 26th day of December, Av. 19Z3, at 10 o'clock a. m. of eacl
uay, to receive and examine all claim
against said estate, with a view
their adjustment and allowance. 3
time limited for the presentation

i i . . . ,

viaims againsi said estate is threi
months from the 26th day of Septemt
ber, A. D. 1923, and the time limited
for payment of debts is one year front
said 26th, dayof September, 1923.

Witness my 'hand and the seal o
said County Court, this 22nd day ol
AUgUSC, 1323.

ALLEN J. BEESON.
(Seal) a23-4- w. County Judgd

FOR SALE

Spotted Poland China spring bserl
Tel. 31-- J. Maud H. Babbitt tot
Plattsmouth, Nebr. alS-lt- si


